District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Musical Instruments — Number of Vendors 74
Elementary/General Notified
Bid Number 07-074-MK Number of Bids 18
Distributed
Date Solicited 11/13/2006 Number of Vendors 56
Not Bidding
Date Opened 11/30/2006 Number of Formal 1
“No Bid” Responses
Date Board 1/23/07 Funding Source 10
Presentation
Total Savings Estimated Savings . Grand Total of Bid Estimated Total
$14,000.00 $95,000.00

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as lowest and best
bid meeting written specifications.

Term of Contract: This is a one-year contract. The first year of the contract will commence on January 19,
2007 and continue through January 18, 2008.

Notations and Exceptions
This bid is for Musical Instruments-Elementary/General to be utilized by the District on “as needed basis.”

MU-5 & 5a: Recommend acceptance of bid from West Music Remo as best bid meeting written specifications.
Lower bid from Rhythm Band could not be adequately evaluated; vendor did not supply specifications as
requested in bid document.

MU-13: Recommend acceptance of bid from Rhythm Band Aulos, a one piece instruments as best bid meeting
written specifications. Lower bid from Peripole-Bergerault is a two piece instrument therefore it did not meet
specifications additionally, no strap with the instrument.

MU-48: Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World West as best bid meeting written specifications.
The Axates from West is made from gourds and beads and are a higher quality to withstand student use. Lower
bid from Peripole-Bergerault is made from a coconut, not a gourd and bead Axatse, and did not meet
specifications.

MU-78: Recommend acceptance of bid from Keyboard World Remo as best bid meeting written specifications.
Compact size and versatility of Remo better suited for student use additionally it can be played with hands,
sticks or mallets. Lower bid from Peripole-Bergerault description does not allow for this versatility.

Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.
All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:

Kathy Sanz, Supervisor, Curriculum and Instructional Services
Bids Prepared By:

Mina Kaeding, CPPB, Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized By:
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

DATE/TIME: January 17, 2007 10:45:00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942
07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
HAND DRUMS
M-1 8" Hand Drums: $17.40 No Bid $13.50 $13.50 No Bid $13.36
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8508 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4908N
M-2 10" Hand Drums: $20.40 No Bid $15.75 $14.50 No Bid $14.31
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8510 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4910N
M-3 12" Hand Drums: $23.40 No Bid $18.50 $18.00 No Bid $17.88
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8512 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4912N
M-4 14" Hand Drums: $25.40 No Bid $22.00 $21.00 No Bid $20.51
Manufacturer: Remo HD-8514 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4914N
Total "all or none" M-1 Through M-4 $86.60 No Bid $60.80 $67.00 No Bid $66.06
M-5 10" Pre-Tuned Tambourine: $18.80 No Bid $14.75 $11.00 No Bid $14.12
Manufacturer: Remo TARE511070 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4610 RBI TAM10
M-5a 8" Single Row Jingles Tamourine: $16.30 No Bid $11.99 $9.00 No Bid $12.65
Manufacturer: Remo TARE51087 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal *7" Peripole-Bergerault PB4607 RBI TAM8
M-6  Tuneable Bongo Drum: $44.08 No Bid $109.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: CP Matador PA532 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4230N
ROTO TOMS
M-7 6" Roto Toms: $132.90 No Bid No Bid $154.29 No Bid No Bid
Mfg: Remo ER-0012-03RT, ST-2000-00, P92 As Specs.
ER-0006-03RT W STAND ST-
Or Equal 4233-10 W MALLET P92
8" Roto Toms: $132.90 No Bid No Bid $159.47 No Bid No Bid
Mfg: Remo ER-0014-03RT, ST2000-00, P92 As Specs.
REMO -ER0008-03rt, ST-4233-
Or Equal 10 Mallet P92
10" Roto Toms: $132.90 No Bid No Bid $170.31 No Bid No Bid
REMO ER-00-10-03R2 ST-4233-
Mfg: Remo ER-0016-03RT, ST2000-00, P92 As Specs. 10 MALLET P92
Or Equal
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521
BID TITLE: Minneapolis, MN 55413 Coralville, 1A 52241
Musical Instruments - Elementary G.L. Repka Carol Lund Randy Hargis Judy Drengwitz Beth Villhauer
215-794-1980 800-443-3592 800-424-4724 301-946-3448 800-397-9378
BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942
07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
M-08 |Autoharp: $149.00 No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid No Bid
Mfg: Rhythm Band RB-1545, RB-1509 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal $213.75
TONE CHIMES HAND BELLS
M-09 Tone Chimes Hand Bells: Range G4-G6 $667.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $815.14
Manufacturer: As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
M-10 | Tone Chimes Hand Bells: G6-C7 $517.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $624.34
Manufacturer: Suzuki HB-12A As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
M-11 | Tone Chime Hand Bells: C7-G7 $520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $709.14
Manufacturer: Suzuki HB-12B As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
Total "all or none** M-09 Through M-11 $1,704.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,148.62
M-12 |25-Resonator Bells: $232.00 No Bid $345.55 $205.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-2122 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB2125A | |
\ |
M-13 |Soprano Recorders Aulos: $6.90 No Bid $2.15 $5.75 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Auolos As Specs. \ |
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB6101 AULOS A103N NECK
M-14 |Soprano Recorders; $2.85 No Bid $4.60 No Bid No Bid $2.39
Manufacturer: Angel REAN101 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB6000
BLOCKS
M-15 Sand Blocks (Pairs): $3.90 No Bid $6.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-753 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5301
M-16 Small Rosewood Blocks w/Mallet $21.90 No Bid $9.95 $23.75 No Bid $15.90
Manufacturer: Sonor WOSOV220 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5205 LWB1
M-17 Large Rosewood Blcoks w/Mallet $29.50 No Bid $9.95 $33.25 No Bid $31.54
Manufacturer: Sonor WOSOV2202 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5205 LWB2
M-18 |Guiro Tone Blocks: $2.89 No Bid $5.25 $2.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-756 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5203
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

M-19 Stir Xylophone Woodblock: $13.50 No Bid No Bid $14.31
Manufacturer: West XYWM39 As Specs. $8.80 No Bid As Specs.
Or Equal RBI 1065
Total "all or none'* M-15 Through M-19 $71.69 No Bid No Bid DISQ DISQ
TRIANGLES

M-20 4" Triangles: Steel $18.20 No Bid No Bid $14.70 No Bid $12.88
Manufacturer: Studio 49 TRSTT10 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal

M-21 4" Triangles: Chrome Steel $14.50 No Bid No Bid $15.20 No Bid $14.42
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2350 As Specs. LTR10 As Specs.
Or Equal

M-22 6" Triangles: Chrome Steel $17.50 No Bid $5.75 $19.95 No Bid $18.92
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2352 As Specs. LTR15 As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault

Or Equal PB3201/PB3202

M-23 7" Triangles: Chrome Steel $20.50 No Bid No Bid $22.80 No Bid $22.90
Manufacturer: Sonor TRSOV2353 As Specs. LTR18 As Specs.
Or Equal

M-24 |Finger Cymbals: $13.00 No Bid $6.75 $8.75 $14.79
Manufacturer: 2.4" Zildjian As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB3507 MIDEAST 874D
Total "all or none' M-20 Through M-24 $83.70 No Bid N/A $81.40 $83.91

M-25 |Rhythm Sticks Set: $18.10 No Bid $21.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-802 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5001S

M-26 18" Hardwood Slapsticks: $24.00 No Bid $19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West SLDWM62 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB520M

M-27 13" Hardwood Slapstick: $16.00 No Bid $19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West SLBLM63 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5207

M-28 |Scarf Set:
27" $74.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.30
Manufacturer: West SCID27 As Specs. As Specs.
36" $95.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.50
Manufacturer: West SCID36 As Specs. As Specs.
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
54" $132.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $116.60
Manufacturer: West SCID54 As Specs. As Specs.
Total "all or none'* M-25 Through M-28 $301.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid DISQ

M-29 |Cabasa: Small Size $18.80 No Bid $23.95 $12.50 No Bid $18.44
Manufacturer: West CALP234 As Specs. \ As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5404 RBI RB662

M-30 Maracas: Large, Colored Wood $9.60 No Bid $10.50 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-1201 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB55022 |
Maracas: Deluxe Professional $10.10 No Bid $10.50 $6.00 No Bid No Bid

M-32 Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB100X As Specs. \
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB55022 RB1201
Total "all or none'* M-29 Through M-32 $38.50 No Bid $44.95 $24.50 No Bid No Bid

\

M-33 |Ratchet: $73.90 No Bid $25.99 $14.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band RB-701 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5208

M-34 Claves: $10.90 No Bid $10.95 $10.45 No Bid $9.91
Manufacturer: Sonor CLS02602 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5102 V2602

M-35 |Deep Bass Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $105.00 No Bid $276.73 $161.50 No Bid $150.26
Manufacturer: Sonor KS50PO As Specs. KS50PO-C As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault

Or Equal PB1408C/PB2510 MALLET SCH15

M-36 Bass Xylophones: $940.00 No Bid $1,187.50 No Bid $1,125.99
Manufacturer: Sonor GBKX100 As Specs. $111.11 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1121C

M-37 |Tenor-Alto Xylophones: $430.00 No Bid $529.61 $527.50 No Bid $500.06
Manufacturer: Sonor TAKX100 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1131C

M-38 |Soprano Xylophones: $284.00 No Bid $327.38 $351.50 No Bid $333.37
Manufacturer: Sonor SKX100 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1101C

M-39 Bass Metallophone: $844.00 No Bid $954.93 $1,001.01
Manufacturer: Sonor GBKM10 As Specs. $1,045.00 No Bid As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1321 As Specs.
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

M-40 | Tenor-Alto Metallophone: $437.00 No Bid $500.18 $536.75 No Bid $501.07
Manufacturer: Sonor TAKM10 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1331

M-41 |Soprano Metallophone: $310.00 No Bid $500.19 $380.00 No Bid $360.40
Manufacturer: Sonor SKM10 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1301

M-42 | Alto Glockenspiels: $123.00 No Bid $148.62 $152.00 No Bid $144.16
Manufacturer: Sonor TAGL1 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1231

M-43 Deep Bass C-F# Palisono Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $103.00/EACH No Bid No Bid 128.25/EACH No Bid 150.26/EACH
Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS50PO As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal KS50PO/SCH15

M-44 | Conta Bass Bars w/Yarn Mallet: $182.00/EACH No Bid $313.32/Each 223.25/EACH No Bid 236.54/EACH
Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS60PO As Specs. As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault

Or Equal PB140412510F2B KS60PO/SCH100

M-45 |Sub-Contra Bass C-E w/Yarn Mallet: $282.00/EACH No Bid $354.73/Each 346.75/EACH No Bid 353.67/EACH
Manufacturer: Sonor BASOKS100PO As Specs. As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault

Or Equal PB1401C/2510-CTOD KS100PO/SCH100

M-46 'Soprano Glockenspiels: $116.00 No Bid $109.35 $142.50 No Bid $135.15
Manufacturer: Sonor SGL1 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB1201
Total "all or none' M-35 Through M-46 $4,156.00 No Bid No Bid $8,980.60 $4,991.94

As Specs.

M-47 |Storage Cart: $278.00 No Bid No Bid $295.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhytm Band RB-39 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal

M-48 | Axatse: $94.50 No Bid $19.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: West CAWMCA?2 As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5407

M-49 | Temple Blocks: $183.00 No Bid $247.00 $175.00 No Bid $159.80
Manufacturer: West TEBLAR As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4560 RBI RB603

M-50 |Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 12' $37.00 No Bid No Bid $29.95 No Bid $31.44
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE021200 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal ET021200
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

M-51 |Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 16" $44.80 No Bid No Bid $38.22 $38.16
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE021600 As Specs. \ As Specs.
Or Equal ET021600

\

M-52 |Ocean Drums: 2 1/2 X 22" $61.20 No Bid No Bid $53.71 No Bid
Manufacturer: Rhythm Band OCRE022200 As Specs. \ $57.20
Or Equal ET022200
Total "all or none** M-50 through M-52 $143.00 No Bid No Bid $121.88 No Bid $126.80

M-53 18" Hand-Hammered Gongs: $181.00 No Bid $186.95 No Bid No Bid $93.28
Manufacturer: West GOWM18 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB3920

M-54 |Rainstick: $19.90 No Bid $30.74 No Bid No Bid $19.08
Manufacturer: RAWM1130 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5515

M-55 |Slide Whistle: $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.45
Manufacturer: West WHAMC219 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
COWBELL

M-56 |5" Cowbell: $18.30 No Bid $8.99 No Bid No Bid $21.94
Manufacturer: Latin Percussion COLP204A As Specs. | As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault OPB3305

M-57 8" Cowbell: $29.26
Manufacturer: Latin Percussion COLP229 $22.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid As Specs.
Or Equal As Specs.

M-58 |Vibra-Slap $24.90 No Bid $21.95 No Bid No Bid $31.48
Manufacturer:Latin Percussion LP208 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5210

M-59 |Chime Tree: $69.00 No Bid $82.45 No Bid No Bid $59.63
Manufacturer: West M166 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB3900
Total "all or none'* M-58 through M-59 $93.90 No Bid $104.40 No Bid No Bid $91.11

M-60 Keyboard: $118.00 No Bid No Bid $123.45 $109.00 $119.78
Manufacturer:Yamaha PSR203 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal

M-61 Billfrog Guiro Rhythm Instrument: No Bid No Bid $28.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB0722 |
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault

\
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521
BID TITLE: Minneapolis, MN 55413 Coralville, 1A 52241
Musical Instruments - Elementary G.L. Repka Carol Lund Randy Hargis Judy Drengwitz Beth Villhauer
| 215-794-1980 800-443-3592 800-424-4724 301-946-3448 800-397-9378
BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942
07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
M-62 Sound Bench Board Play: No Bid No Bid $42.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB0730 \ |
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB70.30
\ \
M-63 Sound Bench Play: No Bid No Bid $40.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB7006 \ |
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB7066
M-64 |Resonator Bell Block Play: No Bid No Bid Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Peripole PB7001
Or Equal
M-65 |Paddle Drums: $30.90 No Bid No Bid $34.90 No Bid $24.75
a. 8" Paddle Drum w/Mallet As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Manufacturer: Remo w/ Mattet PARE100800
Or Equal
b. 10" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $34.90 No Bid No Bid $38.35 No Bid $28.47
Manufacturer: Remo w/ Mattet PARE101000 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal \ |
C. 12" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $38.50 No Bid No Bid $43.85 No Bid $31.43
Manufacturer: Remo w/Mallet PARE101200 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal \ |
d. 14" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $41.50 No Bid $47.60 No Bid $34.34
Manufacturer: Remo w/Mallet PARE101400 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal \ |
e. 16" Paddle Drum w/Mallet $58.90 No Bid No Bid DISC No Bid DISC
Manufacturer: Eemo w/Mallet PARE101600 As Specs.
Or Equal
Total "all or none' M-65a Through M-65e $204.70 No Bid No Bid
M-66 |Paddle Drum Set: $118.90 No Bid No Bid $128.32 No Bid $97.26
Manufacturer: Remo PARE481400 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
M-67 |Pretuned Tubanos:
a. Small 10 X 26" $103.50 No Bid $130.24 $108.95 No Bid $98.26
Manufacturer: Remo TURE051009 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4150 \
b. Medium 12 X 26" $113.50 No Bid $139.04 $122.05 No Bid $111.00
Manufacturer: Remo TURE051209 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4151 \
C. Large 14 X 26" $130.50 No Bid 147.84 $140.85 No Bid $129.69
Manufacturer: Remo TURE051409 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4152
Total ""all or none" M-67a Through M-67c $347.50 No Bid $417.12 $371.85 No Bid $338.37
\
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

M-68 Kid's Tubano: $75.00 No Bid $44.95 $82.65 No Bid $66.78
Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion TURE001001 As Specs. | As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4104S

M-69 Kid's Djembe: $55.50 No Bid $46.90 $57.00 No Bid $42.97
Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion DJRE060801 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4385

M-70 |Kid's Floor Tom w/Mallet: $36.50 No Bid $39.95 $35.61 No Bid $26.71
Mfg: Remo Kid's Percussion w/Mallet 508001 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4103S

M-71 |Gathering Drums:

a. Kid's Gathering Drum: 21 X 22" 131.00 No Bid $261.56 $152.00 No Bid $113.53
Manufacturer: Remo GARE522201 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault PB41.01

Or Equal *Set of 3

b. Kid's Gathering Drum: 8 X 22" $88.00 No Bid $91.65 $90.25 No Bid $68.21
Manufacturer: Remo GARE582201 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4100M
Total ""all or none" M-71a Through M-71b $219.00 No Bid $353.21 $242.25 $181.74

M-72 |Guiro: Fish Shaped $9.00 No Bid $11.95 No Bid $9.49
Manufacturer:West GUWM4340 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5400

M-73 |Bullfrog Guiro: Small $39.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.12
Manufacturer:West GUDW250 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal

M-74 |Bullfrog Guiro: Large $44.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.60
Manufacturer: West GUDW300 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal

M-75 \Wooden Frog Rasps: $28.00 No Bid $17.75 No Bid No Bid $10.49
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG1 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5209

M-76 |Medium Frog Rasps: $34.10 No Bid $17.75 No Bid No Bid $16.18
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG2 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5209

M-77 |Large Frog Rasps: $41.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.94
Manufacturer: West RAWMFG3 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
Total "all or none' M-72 Through M-77 $197.00 No Bid N/A No Bid No Bid $107.82
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: Keyboard World MSA Music Inc. Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instruments | Washington Music Center, Inc. West Music
November 30, 2006 @ 2:30 P.M. PO Box 709 2021 E. Hehnepin Ave P.O. Box 12909 PO Box 126 11151 Veirs Mill Road 1212 5th St.
Holicong, PA 18928 Suite 374 Salem, OR 97309-0909 Ft. Worth, TX 76101-0126 Wheaton, MD 20902 PO Box 5521

BID TITLE:

Minneapolis, MN 55413

Coralville, 1A 52241

Musical Instruments - Elementary

G.L. Repka

Carol Lund

Randy Hargis

Judy Drengwitz

Beth Villhauer

215-794-1980

800-443-3592

800-424-4724

301-946-3448

800-397-9378

BID: 215-794-1965 888-724-6733 800-784-9401 301-946-0487 888-470-3942

07-074-MK DISQUALIFIED

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

M-78 Kid's Percussion: $116.00 No Bid $84.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:Remo As Specs.

Peripole-Bergerault

Or Equal PB4103S/PB4104S

M-79a Kid's Konga: $58.50 No Bid $44.95 $42.75 No Bid $38.12
Manufacturer: Remo CORE150601 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB41045

M-80b Kid's Bongos: $41.50 No Bid $46.50 $37.95 No Bid $29.10
Manufacturer: Remo BORE540001 As Specs. As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB4220S
Total ""all or none" M-79a Through M-80b $100.00 No Bid $91.45 $80.70 No Bid $67.00

M-81 |Sleigh Bells: 13 Bells $10.10 No Bid $10.50 $4.75 No Bid $16.36
Manufacturer West SB13 Peripole-Bergerault PB3005 RBI RB808 BEBB13

\

M-82 |Sleigh Bells: 25 Bells $17.50 No Bid $18.75 $6.95 No Bid $21.37
Manufacturer West SB25 Peripole-Bergerault PB3004 RBI RB809 BEBB25

M-83 |Mini Plastic Maracas: $10.10 No Bid $7.50 No Bid No Bid $6.10
Manufacturer: West MAWMFMM As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal Peripole-Bergerault PB5504

M-84 Basic Rhythm Stick: 8" length $3.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17
Manufacturer: West 201358 As Specs. As Specs.
Or Equal
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