District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Furniture, New Schools (2) Number of Vendors 128
and Warehouse Notified
Bid Number | 09-001-AZ Number of Bids 29
Distributed
Date January 8, 2008 Number of Vendors 9
Solicited Bidding
Date Opened | February 12, 2008 Number of Formal “No 5
Bid” Responses
Date Board March 4, 2008 Funding Source Capital and
Presentation general funds
Total Savings Approx. $57,910 . Grand Total of Proposal $350,461.56
(Part 1)

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheets, for
the warehouse and for Veterans Elementary School and Crews Lake Middle School currently
under construction.

Term of Contract: Part A: For a period of one (1) year from date of award. Part B
(manufacturer’s discount off list price): For a period of one (1) year from date of award, with two
(2) consecutive yearly renewals at the mutual consent of the parties.

Notations and Exceptions:

Part A: Each Award Group was awarded “all or none” for compatibility of product. The bid from
School Specialty was disqualified at the bid opening for failure to provide a mandatory bid bond.
Award Group #1: Student furniture & activity tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from
Schoolhouse Products as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written
specifications.

Award Group #2, Pedestal tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from Virco Inc. as lowest and
best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #3, File cabinets: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris Enterprises
Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #4, Administrative chairs: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris
Enterprises Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.
Award Group #5, Computer tables: Recommend rejection of low bid from Hertz Furniture,
bidding an alternate table with a lower quality wire management system than the model specified.
Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris Enterprises Inc. as lowest and best responsive,
responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Date/Time: February 27, 2008 09:42:00



Notations and Exceptions, continued:

Award Group #7, First aid loungers: No compliant bids received. Requesting permission to
purchase on the open market.

Award Group #8, Administrative furniture: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris
Enterprises Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications. Per
the bid, the unit price prevails. There was a minor error in the bid extension for PSF13E; Ernie
Morris has agreed to honor the adjusted extension price and the all or none Award Group price.
Award Group #9, Teacher furniture: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris
Enterprises Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.
Purchasing has verified the pricing (only bid received in this Group) as fair and reasonable, as it
represents a 4% increase over Ernie Morris’ bid prices last year (bid 08-001-AZ).

The following Award Groups are still under evaluation, and will be submitted to a future Board
meeting: Award Group #6, Metal shelving; Award group #10, Student music chairs.

Under Part B, on items where no active or valid bids were received, we will review bids from
other counties and school districts, and Florida State Contract, and attempt to “piggyback” where
it is in the best interest of the District to do so. We are requesting permission to “piggyback”
Pinellas County Schools bid 07-422-003-RN for the following product lines through School
Specialty at these discounts off list price: Allied Plastics 38%; Fleetwood 35.1%; Georgia Chair
43.1%; Scholarcraft 43%. We are requesting permission to “piggyback” the same bid for
Rubbermaid products through Ernie Morris Inc. at 40.1% off list price. Single orders greater than
$25,000 will be submitted separately for Board approval. We are also requesting permission to
negotiate as required with interested parties regarding other manufacturers listed in the bid
document. Any such negotiations will be forwarded to subsequent Board meetings for
consideration and approval.

The requirements of this bid are for the two (2) new schools and the warehouse as noted above.
For all items, quantities listed may vary slightly, but unit prices will remain the same. Offers
from other vendors listed herein are the only offers received per the specified opening date and
time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Bids Evaluated By:

Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer
Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant

Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

Bid Prepared By:

Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer
Reviewed and Authorized By:

Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

Date/Time



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

CBA Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc. Grainger
36 Weatherby Drive PO Box 818 4505 W. Hillsborough Avenue
Greenville, SC 29615 232 N. Main Street Tampa, FL 33614
Bushnell, FL 33513

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #1
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120
PSF1A 550 13 1/2" - 14" stack chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF1B 896 15 1/2" - 16" stack chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF1C 2,887 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF1D 20 11 1/2" - 12" stack chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK
PSF2 562 Student desk w/bookbox No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB
PSF2A 1,330 Student desk w/out bookbox No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC427FB
PSF3 30 Student desk w/chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120
PSF4A 216 Teacher chair with casters No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series
PSF5A 150 Table 30" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5B 10 Table 36" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5C 240 Table 36" x 72" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5D 137 Table 24" x 48" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5F 15 Table 48" round No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5H 55 Table 48" x 72" kidney No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5I 8 Table 42" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #2
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series
PSF5J 5 Table 36" round pedestal base No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5L 3 Table 36" square pedestal base No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF5M 16 Table 48" round pedestal base No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #3
Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L Hon as specified
PSF8A 218 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter No Bid 135.20 29,473.60 No Bid
PSF8B 15 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal No Bid 155.20 2,328.00 No Bid
PSF8E 11 File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock No Bid 424.45 4,668.95 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3 36,470.55 No Bid

Page 1 of 15



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Hertz Furniture

95 Mckee Drive
Mahwah, NJ 07430

Office Furniture Center, Inc.

2117 W. Kennedy Boulevard
Tampa, FL 33606

Satco Supply
441 Old Highway 8 NW
Suite 202
St. Paul, MN 55112

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #1
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Academia 120 Series
PSF1A 550 13 1/2" - 14" stack chair 19.36 10,648.00 No Bid No Bid
PSF1B 896 15 1/2" - 16" stack chair 22.99 20,599.04 No Bid No Bid
PSF1C 2,887 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair 23.23 67,065.01 No Bid No Bid
PSF1D 20 11 1/2" - 12" stack chair 19.12 382.40 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK Academia / ACD-1100WS
PSF2 562 Student desk w/bookbox 42.91 24,115.42 No Bid No Bid
Alternate Academia ACD-1100
43.27 24,317.74
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB Academia / OPV-1400UWS
PSF2A 1,330 Student desk w/out bookbox 40.23 53,505.90 No Bid No Bid
Alternate Academia OPV-1400U
40.60 53,998.00
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC427FB Academia / APT-3218WS
PSF3 30 Student desk wi/chair 53.86 1,615.80 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Academia / ACD-128CP
PSF4A 216 Teacher chair with casters 35.25 7,614.00 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series Allied Plastic F5 Series
PSF5A 150 Table 30" x 60" 80.84 12,006.00 No Bid No Bid
PSF5B 10 Table 36" x 60" 83.67 836.70 No Bid No Bid
PSF5C 240 Table 36" x 72" 93.35 22,404.00 No Bid No Bid
PSF5D 137 Table 24" x 48" 61.89 8,478.93 No Bid No Bid
PSF5F 15 Table 48" round 82.46 1,236.90 No Bid No Bid
PSF5H 55 Table 48" x 72" kidney 117.55 6,465.25 No Bid No Bid
PSF5I 8 Table 42" x 60" 93.35 746.80 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1 237,720.15 No Bid No Bid
Award Group #2 Allied Plastics
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series TB36CR / TB3636 / TB48C2
PSF5J 5 Table 36" round pedestal base 107.87 539.35 No Bid No Bid
PSF5L 3 Table 36" square pedestal base 107.87 323.61 No Bid No Bid
PSF5M 16 Table 48" round pedestal base 158.69 2,539.04 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2 3,402.00 No Bid No Bid
Award Group #3
Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L Hon as specified
PSF8A 218 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter No Bid 143.00 31,174.00 No Bid
PSF8B 15 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal No Bid 163.00 2,445.00 No Bid
PSF8E 11 File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock No Bid 448.00 4,928.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3 No Bid 38,547.00 No Bid

Page 2 of 15



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Schoolhouse Products, Inc.

13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101
Tampa, FL 33635

Virco, Inc.
PO Box 5000

Highway 65 South
Conway, AR 72032

Wenger Corporation

555 Park Drive
Owatonna, MN 55060

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #1 Artco Bell 7100 Series /
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Discover Series Virco 900 Series
PSF1A 550 13 1/2" - 14" stack chair 14.90 8,195.00 16.89 9,289.50 No Bid
PSF1B 896 15 1/2" - 16" stack chair 15.10 13,529.60 18.77 16,817.92 No Bid
PSF1C 2,887 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair 17.00 49,079.00 20.02 57,797.74 No Bid
PSF1D 20 11 1/2" - 12" stack chair 14.90 298.00] 16.89 337.80 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK Avrtco Bell/ DAOD Virco / 785MBBLBCHRMX
PSF2 562 Student desk w/bookbox 31.50 17,703.00 41.30 23,210.60 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB Artco Bell/ 9100 Virco / 72LBMX
PSF2A 1,330 Student desk w/out bookbox 31.40 41,762.00 51.00 67,830.00 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC427FB Artco Bell 7257 / Discover Series Virco / 9700BRX
PSF3 30 Student desk wi/chair 54.70] 1,641.00 61.64 1,849.20 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Artco Bell 7167 / Discover Series Virco / 9050P
PSF4A 216 Teacher chair with casters 31.70 6,847.20 42.87 9,259.92 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series Artco Bell 1200 Series Virco 4000 Series
PSF5A 150 Table 30" x 60" 69.00 10,350.00 65.08 9,762.00 No Bid
PSF5B 10 Table 36" x 60" 73.00 730.00 72.28 722.80 No Bid
PSF5C 240 Table 36" x 72" 82.00 19,680.00 75.41 18,098.40 No Bid
PSF5D 137 Table 24" x 48" 49.00 6,713.00 50.38 6,902.06 No Bid
PSF5F 15 Table 48" round 69.00 1,035.00 77.91 1,168.65 No Bid
PSF5H 55 Table 48" x 72" kidney 110.00 6,050.00 128.28 7,055.40 No Bid
PSF5I 8 Table 42" x 60" 81.00 648.00 90.00 720.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1 184,260.80 230,821.99 No Bid
Award Group #2
Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series Virco Café Top / 66433 Base
PSF5J 5 Table 36" round pedestal base No Bid 119.53 597.65 No Bid
PSF5L 3 Table 36" square pedestal base No Bid 119.53 358.59 No Bid
PSF5M 16 Table 48" round pedestal base No Bid 144.87 2,317.92 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2 No Bid 3,274.16] No Bid
Award Group #3
Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L
PSF8A 218 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF8B 15 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF8E 11 File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

CBA
36 Weatherby Drive

Greenville, SC 29615

Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.

PO Box 818

Grainger

232 N. Main Street

4505 W. Hillsborough Avenue
Tampa, FL 33614

Board Meeting March 4, 2008 Bushnell, FL 33513
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #4
Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805 Hon 7901/ Alt 7992/ 7805
PSF9A 8 Data posture chair with arms No Bid 93.85 750.80 No Bid
PSF9B 40 Data posture chair without arms No Bid 76.25 3,050.00| No Bid
PSF9C 4 Task stool, high No Bid 183.75 735.00 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Hon 2400 series Hon as specified
PSF14A 2 Wood executive swivel chair No Bid 201.75 403.50| No Bid
PSF14B 75 Wood base guest chair No Bid 135.25 10,143.75 No Bid
PSF14C 44 Wood swivel conference room chair; mid back No Bid 173.60 7,638.40| No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4 No Bid 22,721.45 No Bid
Award Group #5
Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series Abco as specified
PSF17 36 Computer table 30" x 60" No Bid 289.75 10,431.00 No Bid
PSF17A 32 Computer table 24" x 60" No Bid 263.10 8,419.20 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5 No Bid 18,850.20 No Bid
Award Group #6
Manufacturer: spec Hallowell Hi-Tech HD Hallowell - Bidding materials only
PSF11B 92 Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87" No Bid No Bid 75.70 6,964.40
PSF11C 157 Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87" No Bid No Bid 85.00 13,345.00
PSF11F 8 Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87" No Bid No Bid 105.00 840.00
PSF11G 78 Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87" No Bid No Bid 120.00 9,360.00
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6 No Bid No Bid 30,509.40
Award Group #7
Manufacturer: spec Barrington 800P Deluxe
PSF12 6 First aid lounger No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #8
Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series Hon as specified
PSF13A 2 Wood lam desk 72" x 36" No Bid 382.95 765.90 No Bid
PSF13C 4 Wood lam secretarial desk left return No Bid 513.10 2,052.40 No Bid
PSF13D 7 Wood lam secretarial desk right return No Bid 513.10 3,591.70| No Bid
PSF13E 2 Wood lam storage credenza No Bid 408.85* 817.70 No Bid
PSF13F 7 Wood lam knee space credenza No Bid 340.30 2,382.10| No Bid
PSF13G 1 Wood lam keyboard arm No Bid 154.50 154.50 No Bid
PSF131 4 Wood lam end table No Bid 110.10 440.40| No Bid
PSF13K 5 Wood lam lateral file cabinet No Bid 272.15 1,360.75 No Bid
PSF13L 2 Wood lam desk 66" x 30" No Bid 289.30 578.60) No Bid
PSF13N 4 Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf No Bid 127.90 511.60 No Bid
PSF130 25 Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf No Bid 213.95 5,348.75 No Bid
PSF15A 3 Conference table 4' x 8' No Bid 417.50 1,252.50 No Bid
PSF15B 1 Conference table 4' x 12" No Bid 499.50 499,50 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8 No Bid 19756.40* No Bid
*Unit prices prevail, see Notations
and Exceptions.

Page 4 of 15



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Hertz Furniture

95 Mckee Drive
Mahwah, NJ 07430

Office Furniture Center, Inc.

2117 W. Kennedy Boulevard
Tampa, FL 33606

Satco Supply
441 Old Highway 8 NW
Suite 202
St. Paul, MN 55112

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
| |Award Group #4 |
Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805 Hon as specified
PSF9A 8 Data posture chair with arms No Bid 99.00 792.00 No Bid
PSF9B 40 Data posture chair without arms No Bid 80.00 3,200.00 No Bid
PSFoC 4 Task stool, high No Bid 194.00 776.00 No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Hon 2400 series Hon as specified
PSF14A 2 Wood executive swivel chair No Bid 213.00 426.00 No Bid
PSF14B 75 Wood base guest chair No Bid 143.00 10,725.00 No Bid
PSF14C 44 Wood swivel conference room chair; mid back No Bid 183.00 8,052.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4 No Bid 23,971.00 No Bid
Award Group #5 Abco alternate
Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series CFLAA3060W / CFLAA2460W
PSF17 36 Computer table 30" x 60" 254.76 9,171.29 No Bid No Bid
PSF17A 32 Computer table 24" x 60" 224.15 7,172.88 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5 16,344.17 No Bid No Bid
Award Group #6
Manufacturer: spec Hallowell Hi-Tech HD Penco Clipper Open Shelving
PSF11B 92 Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87" 112.43 10,343.19 No Bid No Bid
PSF11C 157 Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87" 123.79 19,435.07 No Bid No Bid
PSF11F 8 Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87" 149.93 1,199.41 No Bid No Bid
PSF11G 78 Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87" 167.74 13,083.52 No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6 44,061.19 No Bid No Bid
Award Group #7
Manufacturer: spec Barrington 800P Deluxe
PSF12 6 First aid lounger No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #8
Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series Hon as specified
PSF13A 2 Wood lam desk 72" x 36" No Bid 405.00 810.00 No Bid
PSF13C 4 Wood lam secretarial desk left return No Bid 542.00 2,168.00 No Bid
PSF13D 7 Wood lam secretarial desk right return No Bid 542.00 3,794.00 No Bid
PSF13E 2 Wood lam storage credenza No Bid 432.00 864.00 No Bid
PSF13F 7 Wood lam knee space credenza No Bid 359.00 2,513.00 No Bid
PSF13G 1 Wood lam keyboard arm No Bid 157.00 157.00 No Bid
PSF13I 4 Wood lam end table No Bid 104.00 416.00 No Bid
PSF13K 5 Wood lam lateral file cabinet No Bid 287.00 1,435.00 No Bid
PSF13L 2 Wood lam desk 66" x 30" No Bid 306.00 612.00 No Bid
PSF13N 4 Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf No Bid 135.00 540.00 No Bid
PSF130 25 Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf No Bid 226.00 5,650.00 No Bid
PSF15A 3 Conference table 4' x 8' No Bid 426.00 1,278.00 No Bid
PSF15B 1 Conference table 4' x 12' No Bid 516.00 516.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8 No Bid 20,753.00 No Bid




2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Schoolhouse Products, Inc.

13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101
Tampa, FL 33635

Virco, Inc.
PO Box 5000

Highway 65 South
Conway, AR 72032

Wenger Corporation

555 Park Drive
Owatonna, MN 55060

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #4
Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805
PSF9A 8 Data posture chair with arms No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF9B 40 Data posture chair without arms No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSFoC 4 Task stool, high No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: spec Hon 2400 series
PSF14A 2 Wood executive swivel chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF14B 75 Wood base guest chair No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF14C 44 Wood swivel conference room chair; mid back No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #5
Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series
PSF17 36 Computer table 30" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF17A 32 Computer table 24" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #6
Manufacturer: spec Hallowell Hi-Tech HD
PSF11B 92 Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF11C 157 Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF11F 8 Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF11G 78 Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #7
Manufacturer: spec Barrington 800P Deluxe
PSF12 6 First aid lounger No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #8
Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series
PSF13A 2 Wood lam desk 72" x 36" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13C 4 Wood lam secretarial desk left return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13D 7 Wood lam secretarial desk right return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13E 2 Wood lam storage credenza No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13F 7 Wood lam knee space credenza No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13G 1 Wood lam keyboard arm No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13I 4 Wood lam end table No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13K 5 Wood lam lateral file cabinet No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13L 2 Wood lam desk 66" x 30" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF13N 4 Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF130 25 Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF15A 3 Conference table 4' x 8' No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF15B 1 Conference table 4' x 12' No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 6 of 15



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

CBA

36 Weatherby Drive
Greenville, SC 29615

Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.
PO Box 818

232 N. Main Street
Bushnell, FL 33513

Grainger

4505 W. Hillshorough Avenue
Tampa, FL 33614

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #9
Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series Shellie Radison as specified
PSF16B 139 Single pedestal desk 30" x 48" No Bid 298.00 41,422.00 No Bid
PSF16C 9 Secretarial desk right return No Bid 410.50 3,694.50 No Bid
PSF16D 2 Secretarial desk left return No Bid 410.50 821.00 No Bid
PSF16E 98 Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12" No Bid 162.00 15,876.00 No Bid
PSF16F 3 Bookcase 48" x 36" x 12" No Bid 176.50 529.50] No Bid
PSF16G 1 Bookcase 36" x 36" x 12" No Bid 140.00 140.00 No Bid
PSF16J 3 Double pedestal kneespace credenza No Bid 240.00 720.00 No Bid
PSF16K 7 Double pedestal desk 30" x 60" No Bid 275.00 1,925.00 No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9 No Bid 65,128.00 No Bid
Award Group #10
Manufacturer: spec Wenger
PSF22 120 Student music posture chair No Bid No Bid No Bid

Page 7 of 15



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm Hertz Furniture Office Furniture Center, Inc. Satco Supply
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock 95 Mckee Drive 2117 W. Kennedy Boulevard 441 Old Highway 8 NW
BID #09-001-AZ Mahwah, NJ 07430 Tampa, FL 33606 Suite 202
Board Meeting March 4, 2008 St. Paul, MN 55112

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Award Group #9

Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series
PSF16B 139 Single pedestal desk 30" x 48" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16C 9 Secretarial desk right return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16D 2 Secretarial desk left return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16E 98 Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16F 3 Bookcase 48" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16G 1 Bookcase 36" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16J 3 Double pedestal kneespace credenza No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16K 7 Double pedestal desk 30" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Award Group #10 National Public Seating

Manufacturer: spec Wenger 8210 Melody Chair
PSF22 120 Student music posture chair 48.00 5,760.00 No Bid No Bid
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2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Schoolhouse Products, Inc.

13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101
Tampa, FL 33635

Virco, Inc.
PO Box 5000

Highway 65 South
Conway, AR 72032

Wenger Corporation

555 Park Drive

Owatonna, MN 55060

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #9
Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series
PSF16B 139 Single pedestal desk 30" x 48" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16C 9 Secretarial desk right return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16D 2 Secretarial desk left return No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16E 98 Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16F 3 Bookcase 48" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16G 1 Bookcase 36" x 36" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16J 3 Double pedestal kneespace credenza No Bid No Bid No Bid
PSF16K 7 Double pedestal desk 30" x 60" No Bid No Bid No Bid
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Award Group #10
Manufacturer: spec Wenger Wenger as specified
PSF22 120 Student music posture chair No Bid No Bid 70.00 8,400.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock
BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

CBA

36 Weatherby Drive
Greenville, SC 29615

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE

Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.

PO Box 818
232 N. Main Street
Bushnell, FL 33513

Grainger

4505 W. Hillshorough Avenue

Tampa, FL 33614

TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

MANUFACTURER'S DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF LIST
ABCO
Adapto
Allied Plastics
Allsteel
Anderson Hickey Company
Artco Bell Corporation
B & B Library Shelving
Balt
Best Rite (formerly Elite)
Borroughs
Bretford Manufacturing
Bush
Clarin
Fire King
Fleetwood
Georgia Chair
Global Furniture Company
Globe Chair
Hale
Hallowell
Haskell
Hon Company
Iceberg
Indiana Desk
Interior Concepts
Inwood
Kl
Kimball
K-Log
Luxor Specialty Furniture
Lyons Metal Products

45.00%

I 55.10%
]
I Z7.00%
I 20.10%
I Z7.10%
I 78.90%
50.10%
I BL.I0%
I 72.00%
I Z7.10%
I 72.10%

10% No pricer received

2/25/200812:29 PM
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm Hertz Furniture Office Furniture Center, Inc. Satco Supply

TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock 95 Mckee Drive 2117 W. Kennedy Boulevard 441 Old Highway 8 NW
BID #09-001-AZ Mahwah, NJ 07430 Tampa, FL 33606 Suite 202
Board Meeting March 4, 2008 St. Paul, MN 55112
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
MANUFACTURER'S DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF LIST

ABCO

Adapto

Allied Plastics

Allsteel

Anderson Hickey Company

Artco Bell Corporation

B & B Library Shelving

Balt

Best Rite (formerly Elite)

Borroughs

Bretford Manufacturing

Bush

Clarin

Fire King

Fleetwood

Georgia Chair

Global Furniture Company 55.00%

Globe Chair

Hale

Hallowell

Haskell

Hon Company 60.00%

Iceberg

Indiana Desk | 57.00% |

Interior Concepts

Inwood

Kl

Kimball

K-Log

Luxor Specialty Furniture

Lyons Metal Products | 5.00%
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm Schoolhouse Products, Inc. Virco, Inc. Wenger Corporation

TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 PO Box 5000 555 Park Drive
BID #09-001-AZ Tampa, FL 33635 Highway 65 South Owatonna, MN 55060
Board Meeting March 4, 2008 Conway, AR 72032
ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
MANUFACTURER'S DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE OFF LIST
ABCO 40.00%
Adapto
Allied Plastics
Allsteel
Anderson Hickey Company
Artco Bell Corporation | 54.00% |
B & B Library Shelving
Balt | 46.00% |
Best Rite (formerly Elite) 46.00%
Borroughs
Bretford Manufacturing | 56.50% |
Bush
Clarin
Fire King
Fleetwood
Georgia Chair
Global Furniture Company 56.00% |
Globe Chair
Hale
Hallowell
Haskell
Hon Company
Iceberg
Indiana Desk
Interior Concepts
Inwood
Kl
Kimball
K-Log
Luxor Specialty Furniture 37.00% |
Lyons Metal Products

2/25/200812:29 PM Page 12 of 15



2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm CBA Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc.

TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock 36 Weatherby Drive PO Box 818

BID #09-001-AZ Greenville, SC 29615 232 N. Main Street
Board Meeting March 4, 2008 Bushnell, FL 33513

ITEM#

QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE  TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

4505 W. Hillshorough Avenue
Tampa, FL 33614

Midwest Folding Products
Mitchell Tables
Oklahoma Sound
Palmer

Palmieri Library Furniture
Paragon

Pepco

Revolution Products
Royal Seating
Rubbermaid

Safeco

Sandusky

Saunders
Scholarcraft
Screenflex

Shain Shop-Built
Shellie Desk

Smith System
Southern Aluminum
Spectrum Furniture
Tennsco

Virco Manufacturing
Waddell

Wenger
Whitehall Furniture
Worden

I 3B.10%
I 35.00% ]
I 75.00% ]

40.10%

I 7T.00%

T2.00%

22.10%

50.30%

I 7T T0%

57.30%

I T7.10%

I 78.10%
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2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm
TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock

BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Office Furniture Center, Inc.

2117 W. Kennedy Boulevard

Mahwah, NJ 07430 Tampa, FL 33606

Satco Supply
441 Old Highway 8 NW

Suite 202
St. Paul, MN 55112

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

|Midwest Folding Products
Mitchell Tables
Oklahoma Sound
Palmer

Palmieri Library Furniture
Paragon

Pepco

Revolution Products
Royal Seating
Rubbermaid

Safeco

Sandusky

Saunders
Scholarcraft
Screenflex

Shain Shop-Built
Shellie Desk

Smith System
Southern Aluminum
Spectrum Furniture
Tennsco

Virco Manufacturing
Waddell

Wenger
Whitehall Furniture
Worden

44% No pricer received

5% No pricer received

10.00%

8% No pricer received

B.00%

3% No pricer received
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2/25/200812:29 PM

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 12, 2008 at 2:00 pm

TITLE: Furniture 2 Schools, CLMS and VES, and Warehouse Stock

BID #09-001-AZ

Board Meeting March 4, 2008

Schoolhouse Products, Inc.

13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101
Tampa, FL 33635

Virco, Inc.
PO Box 5000

Highway 65 South
Conway, AR 72032

Wenger Corporation

555 Park Drive
Owatonna, MN 55060

ITEM#

QTY. DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE  TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Midwest Folding Products
Mitchell Tables
Oklahoma Sound
Palmer

Palmieri Library Furniture
Paragon

Pepco

Revolution Products
Royal Seating
Rubbermaid

Safeco

Sandusky

Saunders
Scholarcraft
Screenflex

Shain Shop-Built
Shellie Desk

Smith System
Southern Aluminum
Spectrum Furniture
Tennsco

Virco Manufacturing
Waddell

Wenger
Whitehall Furniture
Worden

\ 37.00%

40% No pricer received

45.00%

5% No pricer received

49.00%

63.00%

Maximum quantity break for
certain products or 2% off catalog
price, whichever greater
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