

District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation

Bid Title	Furniture, 2 New Schools: Anclote HS, Watergrass Elem. School		Number of Vendors Notified	144
Bid Number	10-001-AZ		Number of Bids Distributed	57
Date Solicited	December 16, 2008		Number of Vendors Bidding	18
Date Opened	January 30, 2009		Number of Formal “No Bid” Responses	7
Date Board Presentation	February 17, 2009		Funding Source	Capital and General Funds
Total Savings	Approx. \$154,778		Grand Total of Bid (Part I)	\$272,879.04

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheets for Anclote High School and Watergrass Elementary School, currently under construction.

Term of Contract: Part A, for a period of one (1) year from date of award. Part B, manufacturer’s discount off list price, for a period of one (1) year from date of award, with two (2) consecutive yearly renewals at the mutual consent of the parties.

Notations and Exceptions: In Part A, each Award Group was awarded “all or none” for compatibility of product. The bid from GLT Total Office was disqualified at the bid opening for failure to provide a mandatory bid bond on Part A, and pricers for Part B.

Award Group #1, Student furniture & activity tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #2, Pedestal tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from Virco Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #3, File cabinets: Recommend acceptance of bid from Commercial Design Services as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #4, Administrative chairs: Recommend acceptance of bid from Commercial Design Services as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #5, Computer tables: Recommend rejection of low bids from Virco Inc. and School Specialty, bidding alternate tables with a lower quality wire management system than the model specified. The schools which currently have the specified table in use report lower incidence of vandalism due to the table’s locking wire management tray. Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Notations and Exceptions, continued:

Award Group #7, First aid lounge: Recommend rejection of low bid from Apex Office Products, bidding an alternate lounge which is 5” taller than the model specified. Student Services states this is a potential safety issue. Recommend acceptance of bid from School Specialty as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

The following Award Groups are still under evaluation, and will be submitted to a future Board meeting: **Award Group #6, Metal shelving; Award Group #8, Administrative Furniture; Award Group #9, Teacher furniture; Award Group #10, Student music chairs.**

Under Part B, on items where no active or valid bids were received, we will review bids from other counties and school districts, and Florida State Contract, and attempt to “piggyback” where it is in the best interest of the District to do so. We are also requesting permission to negotiate as required with interested parties regarding other manufacturers listed in the bid document. Any such negotiations will be forwarded to subsequent Board meetings for consideration and approval.

The requirements of this bid are for the two (2) new schools as noted above. For all items, quantities listed may vary slightly, but unit prices will remain the same. Offers from other vendors listed herein are the only offers received per the specified opening date and time; all other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Cost savings have been calculated as the difference between the highest bid and lowest bid received under Part A for each Award Group.

Bids Evaluated By:

Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer
Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

Bid Prepared By:

Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer

Reviewed and Authorized By:

Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm	Apex Office Products	The Beaux-Arts Group	CBA	Commercial Design Services, Inc.		
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES	5209 N. Howard Ave Tampa, FL 33603	8408 Benjamin Rd Tampa, FL 33634	36 Weatherby Drive Greenville, SC 29615	5805 Barry Road Tampa, Florida 33634		
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ						
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009						
ITEM#	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #1				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft 120				
PSF1A	610	13 1/2" - 14" stack chair	Royal Seating Ltd 21.81	13,304.10	No Bid	No Bid
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 153 boxes				
PSF1B	988	15 1/2" - 16" stack chair	22.80	22,526.40	No Bid	No Bid
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 247 boxes				
PSF1C	2,666	17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	24.10	64,250.60	No Bid	No Bid
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 667 boxes				
PSF1D	20	11 1/2" - 12" stack chair	20.49	409.80	No Bid	No Bid
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 5 boxes				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft SC2200-FBBK				
PSF2	567	Student desk w/bookbox	Royal Seating Ltd / 1607 43.62	24,732.54	No Bid	No Bid
		**Desks 2 to a box at 284 boxes				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft 2700FB				
PSF2A	1,637	Student desk w/out bookbox	Royal Seating Ltd / 1647 39.82	65,185.34	No Bid	No Bid
		**Desks 2 to a box at 819 boxes				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft 120				
PSF4A	433	Teacher chair with casters	Royal Seating Ltd / 11414 69.26	29,989.58	No Bid	No Bid
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft 9400 series				
PSF5A	374	Table 30" x 60"	Royal Seating Ltd 77.41	28,951.34	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5B	30	Table 36" x 60"	122.09	3,662.70	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5C	10	Table 36" x 72"	123.68	1,236.80	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5D	185	Table 24" x 48"	56.40	10,434.00	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5F	7	Table 48" round	92.30	646.10	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5H	54	Table 48" x 72" kidney	113.58	6,133.32	No Bid	No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1		271,462.62	No Bid	No Bid
		Award Group #2				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholcraft 4000 series				
PSF5J	2	Table 36" round pedestal base	No Bid	No Bid	Global Industries / Board Room 154.85	309.70
PSF5M	8	Table 48" round pedestal base	No Bid	No Bid	216.88	1,735.04
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2		No Bid		2,044.74
		Award Group #3				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L				
PSF8A	203	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	Hon as specified 178.46	36,227.38	2600 Series Vert / 9300 Series Lat 183.56	37,262.68
PSF8B	3	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal	204.13	612.39	212.76	638.28
PSF8E	11	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	551.02	6,061.22	509.11	5,600.21
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3		42,900.99		43,501.17
		Award Group #4				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805				
PSF9A	10	Data posture chair with arms	Hon as specified 107.89	1,078.90	Global Industries Score / Score / Goal 168.96	1,689.60
PSF9B	34	Data posture chair without arms	87.83	2,986.22	147.29	5,007.86
PSF9C	4	Task stool, high	200.11	800.44	168.10	672.40
		Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605			Enterprise / Twilight / Enterprise	
PSF14A	2	Executive swivel chair	160.81	321.62	177.82	355.64
PSF14B	66	Guest chair	101.85	6,722.10	158.79	10,480.14
PSF14C	46	Mid-back chair	154.40	7,102.40	169.41	7,792.86
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4		19,011.68		25,998.50
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #7				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #10				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #11				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #12				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #13				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #14				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #15				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #16				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #17				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #18				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #19				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #20				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #21				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #22				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #23				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #24				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #25				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #26				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #27				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #28				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #29				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #30				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #31				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #32				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #33				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #34				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #35				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #36				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #37				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #38				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #39				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #40				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #41				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #42				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #43				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #44				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #45				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #46				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #47				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #48				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #49				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #50				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #51				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #52				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #53				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #54				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #55				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #56				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #57				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #58				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #59				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #60				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #61				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #62				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #63				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #64				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #65				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #66				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #67				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #68				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #69				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #70				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #71				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #72				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #73				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #74				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #75				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #76				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #77				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #78				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #79				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #80				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #81				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #82				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #83				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #84				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #85				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #86				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #87				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #88				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #89				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #90				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #91				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #92				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #93				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #94				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #95				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #96				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #97				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #98				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #99				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #100				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #101				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #102				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #103				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #104				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #105				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #106				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #107				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #108				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #109				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #110				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #111				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #112				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #113				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #114				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #115				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #116				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #117				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #118				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #119				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #120				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #121				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #122				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #123				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #124				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #125				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #126				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #127				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #128				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #129				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #130				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #131				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #132				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #133				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #134				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #135				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #136				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #137				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #138				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #139				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #140				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #141				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #142				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #143				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #144				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #145				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #146				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #147				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #148				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #149				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #150				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #151				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #152				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #153				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #154				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #155				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #156				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #157				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #158			</	

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Contrax Furnishings, Inc.		Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc		Hertz Furniture		Office Furniture Center, Inc.		
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		690 NE 23rd Ave.		232 N. Main St.		95 Mckee Dr.		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd.		
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		Gainesville, FL 32609		Bushnell, FL 33513		Mahwah, NJ 07430		Tampa, FL 33606		
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009										
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #1										
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120								
PSF1A	610	13 1/2" - 14" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 153 boxes								
PSF1B	988	15 1/2" - 16" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 247 boxes								
PSF1C	2,666	17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 667 boxes								
PSF1D	20	11 1/2" - 12" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 5 boxes								
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK								
PSF2	567	Student desk w/bookbox	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Desks 2 to a box at 284 boxes								
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB								
PSF2A	1,637	Student desk w/out bookbox	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		**Desks 2 to a box at 819 boxes								
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120								
PSF4A	433	Teacher chair with casters	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series								
PSF5A	374	Table 30" x 60"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5B	30	Table 36" x 60"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5C	10	Table 36" x 72"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5D	185	Table 24" x 48"	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5F	7	Table 48" round	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5H	54	Table 48" x 72" kidney	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1										
		Award Group #2								
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series								
PSF5J	2	Table 36" round pedestal base	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
PSF5M	8	Table 48" round pedestal base	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2										
		Award Group #3								
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L								
PSF8A	203	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	Hon as specified	161.44	32,772.32	Hon as specified	169.00	34,307.00	Hon as specified	34,307.00
PSF8B	3	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal	No Bid	185.20	555.60	No Bid	194.00	582.00	No Bid	582.00
PSF8E	11	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	No Bid	506.23	5,568.53	No Bid	550.00	5,830.00	No Bid	5,830.00
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3										
		Award Group #4								
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805								
PSF9A	10	Data posture chair with arms	Hon as specified	110.24	1,102.40	Hon as specified	103.00	1,030.00	Hon as specified	1,030.00
PSF9B	34	Data posture chair without arms	No Bid	79.72	2,710.48	No Bid	83.00	2,822.00	No Bid	2,822.00
PSF9C	4	Task stool, high	No Bid	186.53	746.12	No Bid	195.00	780.00	No Bid	780.00
		Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605								
PSF14A	2	Executive swivel chair	Hon as specified	150.67	301.34	Hon as specified	158.00	316.00	Hon as specified	316.00
PSF14B	66	Guest chair	No Bid	93.07	6,142.62	No Bid	97.00	6,402.00	No Bid	6,402.00
PSF14C	46	Mid-back chair	No Bid	143.04	6,579.84	No Bid	150.00	6,900.00	No Bid	6,900.00
TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4										
					17,582.81*				No Bid	18,250.00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		PRIDE Enterprises		Satco Supply		School Specialty, Inc.		Schoolhouse Products, Inc.	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		12425 28th St. North, Suite 300		441 Old Hwy 8 NW, Ste 202		100 Pangon Parkway		13517 Prestige Place	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		St. Petersburg, FL 33716		St. Paul, MN 55112		Mansfield, OH 44903		Tampa, FL 33635	
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009									
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Award Group #1									
PSF1A	610	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 13 1/2" - 14" stack chair	No Bid		Scholarcraft as specified 15.08	9,198.80	Artco Bell / 7100 Series 15.60	9,516.00	
PSF1B	988	**Chairs 4 to a box at 153 boxes 15 1/2" - 16" stack chair	No Bid		16.89	16,687.32	18.25	18,031.00	
PSF1C	2,666	**Chairs 4 to a box at 247 boxes 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	No Bid		18.84	50,227.44	20.32	54,173.12	
PSF1D	2011	**Chairs 4 to a box at 667 boxes 11 1/2" - 12" stack chair	No Bid		15.08	301.60	15.60	312.00	
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 5 boxes							
PSF2	567	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK Student desk w/bookbox	No Bid		Scholarcraft as specified 30.16	17,100.72	Artco Bell / DA0D 32.00	18,144.00	
		**Desks 2 to a box at 284 boxes							
PSF2A	1,637	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB Student desk w/out bookbox	No Bid		Scholarcraft as specified 32.74	53,593.38	Artco Bell / 9100 31.73	51,942.01	
		**Desks 2 to a box at 819 boxes							
PSF4A	433	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Teacher chair with casters	No Bid		Scholarcraft as specified 32.26	13,968.58	Artco Bell / 7167P 53.50	23,165.50	
PSF5A	374	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series Table 30" x 60"	No Bid		Allied / F500 Series 66.15	24,740.10	Artco Bell / 1200 Series 72.00	26,928.00	
PSF5B	30	Table 36" x 60"	No Bid		76.04	2,281.20	81.84	2,455.20	
PSF5C	10	Table 36" x 72"	No Bid		80.21	802.10	88.52	885.20	
PSF5D	185	Table 24" x 48"	No Bid		51.56	9,538.60	53.00	9,805.00	
PSF5F	7	Table 48" round	No Bid		74.48	521.36	75.80	530.60	
PSF5H	54	Table 48" x 72" kidney	No Bid		98.96	5,343.84	127.72	6,896.88	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1	No Bid			208,307.04		222,784.51	
		Award Group #2							
PSF5J	2	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series Table 36" round pedestal base	No Bid				No Bid	No Bid	
PSF5M	8	Table 48" round pedestal base	No Bid				No Bid	No Bid	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2	No Bid				No Bid	No Bid	
		Award Group #3							
PSF8A	203	Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	No Bid		Global / 25-401/25-451/93724FH 165.64	33,624.92	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF8B	3	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal	No Bid		189.13	567.39	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF8E	11	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	No Bid		508.26	5,590.86	No Bid	No Bid	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3	No Bid			39,783.17	No Bid	No Bid	
		Award Group #4							
PSF9A	10	Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805 Data posture chair with arms	Pride / Clarion & Anywhere 160.44	1,604.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF9B	34	Data posture chair without arms	123.06	4,184.04	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF9C	4	Task stool, high	166.74	666.96	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF14A	2	Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605 Executive swivel chair	Pride / Floridian & General 327.18	654.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF14B	66	Guest chair	108.78	7,179.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
PSF14C	46	Mid-back chair	324.66	14,934.36	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4		29,223.60					

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Signature Products, Inc.	Storage and Handling Equipment, Inc.	Storagecraft	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		2650 Pemberton Dr Apopka, FL 32703	4582 107th Circle N Clearwater, FL 33762	2823 W Orange Ave Apopka, FL 32703	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ					
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009					
ITEM#	QTY. DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Award Group #1				
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120				
PSF1A	610 13 1/2" - 14" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Chairs 4 to a box at 153 boxes				
PSF1B	988 15 1/2" - 16" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Chairs 4 to a box at 247 boxes				
PSF1C	2,666 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Chairs 4 to a box at 667 boxes				
PSF1D	20 11 1/2" - 12" stack chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Chairs 4 to a box at 5 boxes				
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FBBK				
PSF2	567 Student desk w/bookbox	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Desks 2 to a box at 284 boxes				
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB				
PSF2A	1,637 Student desk w/out bookbox	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	**Desks 2 to a box at 819 boxes				
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120				
PSF4A	433 Teacher chair with casters	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series				
PSF5A	374 Table 30" x 60"	Allied Plastics / FS Series 70.46	26,352.04	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5B	30 Table 36" x 60"	80.67	2,420.10	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5C	10 Table 36" x 72"	87.47	874.70	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5D	185 Table 24" x 48"	54.31	10,047.35	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5E	7 Table 48" round	81.93	573.51	No Bid	No Bid
PSF5H	54 Table 48" x 72" kidney	106.08	5,728.32	No Bid	No Bid
	TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1		49,992.02*	No Bid	No Bid
	Award Group #2				
	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series				
PSF5J	2 Table 36" round pedestal base	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF5M	8 Table 48" round pedestal base	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2			No Bid	No Bid
	Award Group #3				
	Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L				
PSF8A	203 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF8B	3 File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF8E	11 File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3			No Bid	No Bid
	Award Group #4				
	Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805				
PSF9A	10 Data posture chair with arms	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF9B	34 Data posture chair without arms	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF9C	4 Task stool, high	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605				
PSF14A	2 Executive swivel chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF14B	66 Guest chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
PSF14C	46 Mid-back chair	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
	TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4			No Bid	No Bid

*Did not bid entire award group.

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Universal Seating Company		Virco, Inc.		
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		3772 Kori Road		Highway 65 South		
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		Jacksonville, FL 32257		Conway, AR 72032		
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009						
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #1			Virco	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120				
PSF1A	610	13 1/2" - 14" stack chair	No Bid		9000 Series / 2000 Series	9,150.00
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 153 boxes				
PSF1B	988	15 1/2" - 16" stack chair	No Bid		16.88	16,677.44
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 247 boxes				
PSF1C	2,666	17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	No Bid		18.88	50,334.08
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 667 boxes				
PSF1D	20	11 1/2" - 12" stack chair	No Bid		15.00	300.00
		**Chairs 4 to a box at 5 boxes				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft SC2200-FB BK				
PSF2	567	Student desk w/bookbox	No Bid		Virco / 785	17,435.25
		**Desks 2 to a box at 284 boxes			30.75	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB				
PSF2A	1,637	Student desk w/out bookbox	No Bid		Virco / 727LB	70,407.37
		**Desks 2 to a box at 819 boxes			43.01	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120				
PSF4A	433	Teacher chair with casters	No Bid		Virco / 9050P/2050P	20,182.13
		46.61				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series				
PSF5A	374	Table 30" x 60"	No Bid		Virco / 4000 Series	25,039.30
PSF5B	30	Table 36" x 60"	No Bid		66.95	2,233.50
PSF5C	10	Table 36" x 72"	No Bid		74.45	775.50
PSF5D	185	Table 24" x 48"	No Bid		49.00	9,065.00
PSF5F	7	Table 48" round	No Bid		69.00	483.00
PSF5H	54	Table 48" x 72" kidney	No Bid		118.99	6,425.46
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1				228,508.03
		Award Group #2				
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series				
PSF5J	2	Table 36" round pedestal base	No Bid		Virco / Cafe' Tops w/ Pedestal Bases	113.00
PSF5M	8	Table 48" round pedestal base	No Bid		135.00	1,080.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2				1,306.00
		Award Group #3				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L				
PSF8A	203	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	No Bid			No Bid
PSF8B	3	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, legal	No Bid			No Bid
PSF8E	11	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3				No Bid
		Award Group #4				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 7901/7991/7805				
PSF9A	10	Data posture chair with arms	No Bid			No Bid
PSF9B	34	Data posture chair without arms	No Bid			No Bid
PSF9C	4	Task stool, high	No Bid			No Bid
		Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605				
PSF14A	2	Executive swivel chair	No Bid			No Bid
PSF14B	66	Guest chair	No Bid			No Bid
PSF14C	46	Mid-back chair	No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4				No Bid

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm	Apex Office Products	The Beaux-Arts Group	CBA	Commercial Design Services, Inc.				
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES	5209 N. Howard Ave Tampa, FL 33603	8408 Benjamin Rd Tampa, FL 33634	36 Weatherby Drive Greenville, SC 29615	5805 Barry Road Tampa, Florida 33634				
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ								
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009								
ITEM#	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #5						
		Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series						ABCO as specified
PSF17	28	Computer table 30" x 60"	No Bid		No Bid			345.42
PSF17A	14	Computer table 24" x 60"	No Bid		No Bid			313.78
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5	No Bid		No Bid			14,064.68
		Award Group #6						
		Manufacturer: spec Penco Open Clipper Series						
PSF11B	30	Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87"	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
PSF11C	147	Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87"	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
PSF11F	26	Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87"	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
PSF11G	81	Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87"	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid
		Award Group #7						
		Manufacturer: spec Lloyd / Barrington 800P Deluxe						
PSF12	6	First aid lounge	278.01	1,668.06	Global Industries / 308 Nurse	592.97	3,553.62*	No Bid
								*Vendor math error; all or none bid price incorrect
		Award Group #8						
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series						
PSF13A	2	Wood lam desk 72" x 36"	446.75	893.50	Hon as specified	451.61	903.22	No Bid
PSF13B	2	Wood lam DP desk 66" x 60"	418.27	836.54		421.54	843.08	No Bid
PSF13C	5	Wood lam secretarial desk left return	598.74	2,993.70		633.85	3,169.25	No Bid
PSF13D	9	Wood lam secretarial desk right return	476.82	4,291.38		476.38	4,287.42	No Bid
PSF13E	7	Wood lam storage credenza	399.02	2,793.14		415.79	2,910.53	No Bid
PSF13F	4	Wood lam knee space credenza	125.91	503.64		167.87	671.48	No Bid
PSF13I	8	Wood lam end table	319.61	2,556.88		346.34	2,773.12	No Bid
PSF13K	7	Wood lam lateral file cabinet	154.40	1,080.80		235.34	1,647.38	No Bid
PSF13N	5	Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf	252.65	1,263.25		266.28	1,331.40	No Bid
PSF13O	2	Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf	496.08	992.16		458.48	916.96	No Bid
PSF15A	2	Conference table 4' x 8'	618.00	1,236.00		604.66	1,209.32	No Bid
PSF15B	2	Conference table 4' x 12'						No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8		28,870.43			30,676.74	26,827.45
		Award Group #9						
		Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series						
PSF16B	150	Single pedestal desk 30" x 48"	248.00	37,200.00	Crest Manufacturing / 2000SW	273.27	40,990.50	No Bid
PSF16C	5	Secretarial desk right return	410.00	2,050.00		556.08	2,780.40	No Bid
PSF16D	6	Secretarial desk left return	410.00	2,460.00		556.08	3,336.48	No Bid
PSF16E	174	Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12"	179.00	31,146.00		347.01	60,379.74	No Bid
PSF16I	1	Double pedestal kneespace credenza	282.00	282.00		342.24	342.24	No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9		73,138.00			107,829.36	No Bid
		Award Group #10						
		Manufacturer: spec Natl. Public Seating 8210 Melody						
PSF22	140	Student music posture chair	No Bid		Global Industries / Galaxy	44.25	6,195.00	No Bid
		**Quantity adjustment required by vendor to ship complete cartons. (See bid)						

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Signature Products, Inc.		Storage and Handling Equipment, Inc.		Storagecraft	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		2650 Pemberton Dr		4582 107th Circle N		2823 W Orange Ave	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		Apopka, FL 32703		Clearwater, FL 33762		Apopka, FL 32703	
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009							
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #5					
		Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series					
PSF17	28	Computer table 30" x 60"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF17A	14	Computer table 24" x 60"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5					
		Award Group #6					
		Manufacturer: spec Penco Open Clipper Series					
PSF11B	30	Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87"	No Bid	2,574.60	Hallowell / Heavy Duty/High Tech	149.16	4,474.80
PSF11C	147	Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87"	No Bid	13,519.59		165.90	24,387.30
PSF11F	26	Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87"	No Bid	111.23		206.18	5,360.68
PSF11G	81	Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87"	No Bid	113.72		231.19	18,726.39
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6		28,197.49			52,949.17
		Award Group #7					
		Manufacturer: spec Lloyd / Barrington 800P Deluxe					
PSF12	6	First aid lounge	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Award Group #8					
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series					
PSF13A	2	Wood lam desk 72" x 36"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13B	2	Wood lam DP desk 66" x 60"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13C	5	Wood lam secretarial desk left return	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13D	9	Wood lam secretarial desk right return	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13E	7	Wood lam storage credenza	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13F	4	Wood lam knee space credenza	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13I	8	Wood lam end table	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13K	7	Wood lam lateral file cabinet	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13N	5	Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF13O	30	Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF15A	2	Conference table 4' x 8'	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF15B	2	Conference table 4' x 12'	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
		Award Group #9					
		Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series					
PSF16B	150	Single pedestal desk 30" x 48"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF16C	5	Secretarial desk right return	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF16D	6	Secretarial desk left return	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF16E	174	Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PSF16J	1	Double pedestal kneespace credenza	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
		Award Group #10					
		Manufacturer: spec Natl. Public Seating 8210 Mcloody					
PSF22	140	Student music posture chair	Natl. Public Seating as specified	49.05	6,867.01*	No Bid	No Bid
		**Quantity adjustment required by vendor to ship complete cartons. (See bid)					

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Universal Seating Company		Virco, Inc.		
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		3772 Kori Road		Highway 65 South		
BID NUMBER: 10-001-AZ		Jacksonville, FL 32257		Conway, AR 72032		
***BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009**						
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #5				
		Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series			Virco 8700 Series	
PSF17	28	Computer table 30" x 60"	No Bid		107.00	2,996.00
PSF17A	14	Computer table 24" x 60"	No Bid		100.00	1,400.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5	No Bid			4,396.00
		Award Group #6				
		Manufacturer: spec Penco Open Clipper Series				
PSF11B	30	Metal shelf 12" x 36" x 87"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF11C	147	Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF11F	26	Metal shelf 18" x 48" x 87"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF11G	81	Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87"	No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6	No Bid			No Bid
		Award Group #7				
		Manufacturer: spec Lloyd / Barrington 800P Deluxe			Virco / Fabedpd	
PSF12	6	First aid lounger	No Bid		540.00	3,240.00
		Award Group #8				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 10600/80192/L series				
PSF13A	2	Wood lam desk 72" x 36"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13B	2	Wood lam DP desk 66" x 60"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13C	5	Wood lam secretarial desk left return	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13D	9	Wood lam secretarial desk right return	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13E	7	Wood lam storage credenza	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13F	4	Wood lam knee space credenza	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13I	8	Wood lam end table	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13K	7	Wood lam lateral file cabinet	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13N	5	Wood lam bookcase 2 shelf	No Bid			No Bid
PSF13O	30	Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf	No Bid			No Bid
PSF15A	2	Conference table 4' x 8'	No Bid			No Bid
PSF15B	2	Conference table 4' x 12'	No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8	No Bid			No Bid
		Award Group #9				
		Manufacturer: Shellie Radison Series				
PSF16B	150	Single pedestal desk 30" x 48"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF16C	5	Secretarial desk right return	No Bid			No Bid
PSF16D	6	Secretarial desk left return	No Bid			No Bid
PSF16E	174	Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12"	No Bid			No Bid
PSF16J	1	Double pedestal kneespace credenza	No Bid			No Bid
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9	No Bid			No Bid
		Award Group #10				
		Manufacturer: spec Natl. Public Seating 8210 Melody				
PSF22	140	Student music posture chair	No Bid			No Bid
		**Quantity adjustment required by vendor to ship complete cartons. (See bid)				

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Apex Office Products		The Beaux-Arts Group		CBA		Commercial Design Services, Inc.	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		5209 N. Howard Ave Tampa, FL 33603		8408 Benjamin Rd Tampa, FL 33634		36 Weatherby Drive Greenville, SC 29615		5805 Barry Road Tampa, Florida 33634	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		TOTAL PRICE		TOTAL PRICE		TOTAL PRICE		TOTAL PRICE	
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE		UNIT PRICE	
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		ABCO							
		Allied Plastics							
		Allsteel							
		Amiab							
		Anderson Hickey Company							
		Artco Bell Corporation							
		B & B Library Shelving							
		Balt							
		Best Rite (formerly Elite)							
		Blockhouse							
		Borroughs							
		Bretford Manufacturing							
		Bush							
		Clarín							
		Community							
		Evolve Systems							
		Fire King							
		Fleetwood							
		Georgia Chair							
		Global Furniture Company							
		Hale							
		Hallowell							
		Hon Company							
		Iceberg							
		Indiana Desk							
		Interior Concepts							
		Inwood							
		KI							
		Kimball							
		K-Log							
		Knoll							
		Lloyd Barrington							
		Luxor Specialty Furniture							
		Lyons Metal Products							
		Midwest Folding Products							
		Mitchell Tables							
		National Public Seating							
		Oklahoma Sound							
		Palmer							
		Palmieri Library Furniture							
		Paragon							
		Pepeco							
		PRIDE							
		Revolution Products							
		Royal Seating							
		Rubbermaid							
		Safeco							
		Scholarcraft							
		Screenflex							
		Shain Shop-Built							
		Shellie Desk							
		Smith System							
		Southern Aluminum							
		Spectrum Furniture							
		Tennisco							
		United Chair							
		Virco Manufacturing							
		Waddell							
		Walker, McGuire							
		Wenger							
		Whitchell Furniture							
		Worden							

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		Contrax Furnishings, Inc.		Ernie Morris Enterprises, Inc		Hertz Furniture		Office Furniture Center, Inc.	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		690 NE 23rd Ave.		232 N. Main St.		95 Mckee Dr.		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd.	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		Gainesville, FL 32609		Bushnell, FL 33513		Mahwah, NJ 07430		Tampa, FL 33606	
** BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009 **									
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		ABCO							
		Allied Plastics							
		Allsteel							
		Amiab							
		Anderson Hickey Company							
		Artco Bell Corporation							
		B & B Library Shelving							
		Balt							
		Best Rite (formerly Elite)							
		Blockhouse							
		Borroughs							
		Bretford Manufacturing							
		Bush							
		Clarrin							
		Community							
		Evolve Systems							
		Fire King							
		Fleetwood							
		Georgia Chair							
		Global Furniture Company							
		Hale							
		Hallowell							
		Hon Company							
		Iceberg							
		Indiana Desk							
		Interior Concepts							
		Inwood							
		Kl							
		Kimball							
		K-Log							
		Knoll							
		Lloyd Barrington							
		Luxor Specialty Furniture							
		Lyons Metal Products							
		Midwest Folding Products							
		Mitchell Tables							
		National Public Seating							
		Oklahoma Sound							
		Palmer							
		Palmeri Library Furniture							
		Paragon							
		Penco							
		Pepco							
		PRIDE							
		Revolution Products							
		Royal Seating							
		Rubbermaid							
		Safeco							
		Scholarcraft							
		Screenflex							
		Shain Shop-Built							
		Shellie Desk							
		Smith System							
		Southern Aluminum							
		Spectrum Furniture							
		Tennisco							
		United Chair							
		Virco Manufacturing							
		Waddell							
		Walker, McGuire							
		Wenger							
		Whitehall Furniture							
		Worden							

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 30, 2009 @ 1:30 pm		PRIDE Enterprises		Satco Supply		School Specialty, Inc.		Schoolhouse Products, Inc.	
TITLE: Furniture2 Schools AHS & WGES		12425 28th St. North, Suite 300		441 Old Hwy 8 NW, Ste 202		100 Paragon Parkway		13517 Prestige Place	
BID NUMBER 10-001-AZ		St. Petersburg, FL 33716		St. Paul, MN 55112		Mansfield, OH 44903		Tampa, FL 33635	
BOARD MEETING FEBRUARY 17, 2009									
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		ABCO							
		Allied Plastics				56.00%			
		Allsteel				47.00%			
		Amlab				47.00%			
		Anderson Hickey Company							52.00%
		Artco Bell Corporation							
		B & B Library Shelving							
		Balt				51.00%			46% No pricer received
		Best Rite (formerly Elite)				51.00%			47.00%
		Blockhouse							
		Boroughs							
		Bretford Manufacturing				55% basic / 38% library			
		Bush				52.00%			56.00%
		Clarim				44.00%			
		Community							
		Evolve Systems							
		Fire King				44.00%			
		Fleetwood				38.00%			
		Georgia Chair				43.00%			
		Global Furniture Company				54.00%			52% No pricer received
		Hale							
		Hallowell				57.00%			
		Hon Company							
		Iceberg							
		Indiana Desk							
		Interior Concepts				38.00%			
		Inwood				54.00%			
		KI							
		Kimball							
		K-Log							
		Knoll							
		Lloyd Barrington				25.00%			
		Luxor Specialty Furniture				40.00%			34.00%
		Lyons Metal Products				38.00%			
		Midwest Folding Products				42% general line only			36% general / 38% mobile
		Mitchell Tables				50.00%			
		National Public Seating				50.00%			42.00%
		Oklahoma Sound				50.00%			42.00%
		Palmer							
		Palmeri Library Furniture				50.00%			
		Paragon							
		Penco				47.00%			
		Pepco							
		PRIDE				38% metal furniture excluded			
		Revolution Products							
		Royal Seating				42.00%			40.00%
		Rubbermaid				15.00%			
		Safeco				44.00%			
		Scholarcraft				50.00%			
		Screenflex				13.00%			11.00%
		Shain Shop-Built				47.00%			
		Shellie Desk				25.00%			
		Smith System				20.00%			
		Southern Aluminum				38% No pricer received			
		Spectrum Furniture				44.00%			47.00%
		Tennsco				20.00%			
		United Chair				42.00%			
		Viroco Manufacturing							
		Waddell				25.00%			
		Walker, McGuire							
		Wenger							
		Whitehall Furniture							
		Worden							

