
District School Board of Pasco County 
Bid Recommendation 

 

 
Date/Time: April 15, 2009 09:44:00

Bid Title Musical Instruments –Sec.-
“As Needed” Basis Part II 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

62 

Bid Number 09-115-SN  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

40 

Date 
Solicited 

January 23, 2009  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

11 

Date Opened February 26, 2009  Number of Formal “No 
Bid” Responses 

1 

Date Board 
Presentation 

April 21, 2009  Funding Source Capital and 
General 

Funds 
Total Savings $ 3,900 Est.  Grand Total of Bid $20,000 Est. 

Recommendation: 
Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheets as lowest and best, 
responsive, responsible bids meeting written specifications. 
 
Term of Contract: 
This bid is to establish a firm fixed price for the purchase of musical instruments on an “as-
needed” basis for various secondary schools throughout Pasco County, including Anclote High 
School. All prices will remain firm and in effect beginning on April 21, 2009 through March 3, 
2010. 
 
Notations and Exceptions: 
Offers from vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date 
and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as 
late.  Estimated total cost was based upon a new High School’s anticipated requirements. 
All other groups are still being evaluated and will be forwarded to a later board meeting. 
 
Bids Evaluated By: 
Barbara Falkingham, Fine Arts Teacher on Assignment, Curriculum and Instructional Services 
Department, Joshua Sall, Music Teacher, Travis Henry, Music Teacher 
  
Bids Prepared By: 
Stephanie Noble, Buyer, Purchasing Department 
 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 
 



 
 
 

Notations and Exceptions: 
 
MU-06  Oboe-  Recommend acceptance of bid from Washington Music as lowest and best, 
responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. Lower alternate bid from 
National Education Music Company was disqualified as they did not submit the requested 
sample used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-10 Bassoon - Recommend acceptance of bid from The Woodwind & Brasswind as 
lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. Lower 
alternate bids from National Education Music Company, Taylor Music, Inc. and Washington 
Music were disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples used for testing and 
evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-24 Alto Saxophone - Recommend acceptance of bid from Music Man bidding as 
specified, as lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. 
Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid from Music Man as the Yamaha YAS-23 did not 
have the high F#, key response was mediocre and the sound was weak.  Alternate bids from 
National Education Music Company and Washington Music were disqualified as they did not 
submit the requested samples used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-25 Alto Saxophone-YamahaYAS-6211 - Recommend acceptance of bid from Taylor 
Music as lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. 
Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid from Washington Music as the Keilwerth EX-90 
had a sharp mid range and the upper range had a slow response. Alternate bid from National 
Education Music Company was disqualified as they did not submit the requested sample 
used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-25 Alto Saxophone-Yanagisawa A991 -Recommend acceptance of bid from National 
Education Music Company bidding as specified, as lowest and best, responsive and 
responsible bid meeting written specifications. Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid 
from Washington Music as the Keilwerth EX-90 had a sharp mid range and the upper range 
had a slow response. Alternate bid from National Education Music Company (Olds 
Professional NA64JR) was disqualified as they did not submit the requested sample used for 
testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-26 Tenor Saxophone- Recommend acceptance of bid from Music Man bidding as 
specified, as lowest and best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. 
Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid from Music Man as the Yamaha YTS-23 had a 
slow response, airy and bright sound and the keys are high which effects the interaction. 
Alternate bid from National Education Music Company was disqualified as they did not 
submit the requested sample used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
 

Bid # 09-115-SN 
Page 2 



 
 
 

Notations and Exceptions: 
 
MU-27 Tenor Saxophone-Yamaha YTS-62II-Recommend acceptance of bid from 
Washington Music bidding the Keilwerth EX90III as lowest best, responsive and responsible 
bid meeting written specifications.  Alternate Bid from National Education Music Company 
was disqualified as they did not submit the requested sample used for testing and evaluation 
purposes. 
 
MU-27 Tenor Saxophone-Yanagisawa T901-Recommend acceptance of bid from National 
Education Music Company as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written 
specifications.  Alternate bid from National Education Music Company was disqualified as 
they did not submit the requested sample used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-29 Baritone Saxophone-Yamaha YBS-62-Recommend acceptance of bid from Music 
Man as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  
Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid from Music Man as the Selmer BS-500 had an 
edgy sound and rough to start pitches. Alternate bids from National Education Music 
Company and Washington Music were disqualified as they did not submit the requested 
samples used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-29 Baritone Saxophone-Yaganaisawa T901-Recommend acceptance of bid from 
National Education Music Company bidding as specified, as lowest best, responsive and 
responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Recommend rejection of lower alternate bid 
from Music Man as the Selmer BS-500 had an edgy sound and rough to start pitches. 
Alternate bids from National Education Music Company (Olds Professional) and Washington 
Music were disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples used for testing and 
evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-39 Mellophones-King 1121 and 1121SP-Recommend acceptance of bid from 
Washington Music bidding as specified as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid 
meeting written specifications.  Recommend rejection of lower alternate bids from Taylor 
Music (DEG 541L and DEG 541S) and Washington Music (Jupiter 450L) as the tone quality 
was not consistent in all ranges, airy sound and concerns with the instruments playing flat. 
Alternate bid from National Education Music Company was disqualified as they did not 
submit the requested samples used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-39 Mellophones-Yamaha YMP-204 and YMP-204MS-Recommend acceptance of bid 
from National Education Music Company bidding as specified as lowest best, responsive and 
responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Recommend rejection of lower alternate bids 
from Taylor Music (DEG 541L and DEG 541S) and Washington Music (Jupiter 450L) as the 
tone quality was not consistent in all ranges, airy sound and concerns with the instruments 
playing flat. Alternate bid from National Education Music Company (Olds NA42) was 
disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples used for testing and evaluation 
purposes. 
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Notations and Exceptions: 
 
MU-48 Euphonium-King 2280SP-Recommend acceptance of bid from National Education 
Music Company bidding as specified, as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting 
written specifications.  Alternate bids from National Education Music Company (Jupiter 
470S), Taylor Music and Washington Music were disqualified as they did not submit the 
requested samples used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-48 Euphonium-Yamaha YEP-321S-Recommend acceptance of bid from Music Man 
as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Alternate bids 
from National Education Music Company, Taylor Music and Washington Music were 
disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples used for testing and evaluation 
purposes. 
 
MU-50 Tuba-Yamaha YBB-621-Recommend acceptance of bid from National Education 
Music Company bidding as specified, as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting 
written specifications.  Alternate bids from National Education Music Company, Taylor 
Music and Washington Music were disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples 
used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-51 Tuba-Conn 5JSPW, King 2341SPW and Yamaha YBB-321-Recommend 
acceptance of bid from National Education Music Company bidding as specified, as lowest 
best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Alternate bids from 
National Education Music Company (Olds N0100), Taylor Music and Washington Music 
were disqualified as they did not submit the requested samples used for testing and 
evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-53 Tuba- Yamaha YBB-641WC-Recommend acceptance of bid from Music Man as 
lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Alternate bids 
from National Education Music Company and Washington Music were disqualified as they 
did not submit the requested samples used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-69 and MU-70 Ludwig-Recommend acceptance of bid from National Education Music 
Company as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  
Lower alternate bids from Music Man and Taylor Music were disqualified as they did not 
provide the manufacturer and item number required for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-69 and MU-70 Pearl-Recommend acceptance of bid from Taylor Music bidding as 
specified, as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  
Lower alternate bids from Music Man and Taylor Music were disqualified as they did not 
provide the manufacturer and item number required for testing and evaluation purposes.  
Recommend rejection of alternate bid from Music Man as the carrier was not as specified.   
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Notations and Exceptions: 
 
MU-69 and MU-70 Yamaha-Recommend acceptance of bid from Washington Music as 
lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Lower alternate 
bids from Music Man and Taylor Music were disqualified as they did not provide the 
manufacturer and item number for used for testing and evaluation purposes. Alternate bid 
from National Education Music Company was disqualified as they did not submit the 
requested sample used for testing and evaluation purposes.   
 
MU-118 Guitar Bass-Fender Squire Precision Bass-Recommend acceptance of bid from 
Washington Music as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written 
specifications.  Lower alternate bid from Washington Music was disqualified as they did not 
submit the requested sample used for testing and evaluation purposes. 
 
MU-121 Music Stand-Recommend acceptance of bid from Wenger Corporation as lowest 
best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Recommend rejection of 
alternate bids from Taylor Music as the stand bends easily.  Recommend rejection of 
alternate bid from Washington Music Company as the stand is black enamel which may chip 
more easily than the black powered coat finish which was specified.  
 
MU-134 String Bass Glaesel DB633CFH, w/GL0760 bag, GL2501 bow-Recommend 
rejection of all bids as this item has been discontinued.  Schools will purchase the Strunal 
String Bass in this category.  
 
MU-134 String Bass Strunal 535-Recommend acceptance of bid from Washington Music 
as lowest best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications.  Lower bid 
from Interstate Music is a counter-offer stating price increases can be made on discontinued 
replacement items and could not be considered as the true cost over the lifetime of the 
contract could not be determined. 
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

All County Music, Inc Interstate Music Music Man
8136 N University Dr 13819 W National Ave PO Box 8335
Tamarac, FL 33321 New Berlin, WI 53151 2309 N Dixie Hwy

West Palm Beach, FL 33407

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

MU-06 Oboe-Yamaha YOB-441 No Bid $2,049.00 $2,011.00
Oboe-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-10 Bassoon-Fox Renard 222 No Bid $4,417.00 $4,424.00
Bassoon-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-11 Bassoon-Fox Renard 220 No Bid $6,102.00 $6,068.00
Bassoon-Schrieber WS5013 No Bid No Bid $3,807.00 / WS5013

$5,935.00 / WS5131
MU-24 Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YAS-475 No Bid $1,349.00 $1,319.00

Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid $776.00
Manufacturer: Yamaha YAS-23

MU-25 Alto Saxophone (Eb-)Yamaha YAS-6211 No Bid $1,773.00 $1,736.00
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa A991 No Bid $2,640.00 $2,627.00
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-26 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-475 No Bid $1,552.00 $1,518.00
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid $977.00
Manufacturer: Yamaha YTS-23

MU-27 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-62II No Bid $1,917.00 $1,871.00
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yanagisawa T901 No Bid $2,260.00 $2,239.00
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-29 Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YBS-62 No Bid $5,469.00 $5,341.00
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa B901 No Bid $4,463.00 $4,399.00
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid $2,541.00
Manufacturer: Selmer BS-500

MU-39 Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121 No Bid $1,061.00 $988.00
Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121SP No Bid $1,194.00 $1,113.00
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204 No Bid $1,001.00 $971.00
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204MS No Bid $1,047.00 $1,018.00
Marching Mellophones (F)-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

Manufacturer:

09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-01 THROUGH MU-61 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

MU-06 Oboe-Yamaha YOB-441
Oboe-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-10 Bassoon-Fox Renard 222
Bassoon-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-11 Bassoon-Fox Renard 220
Bassoon-Schrieber WS5013 

MU-24 Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YAS-475
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-25 Alto Saxophone (Eb-)Yamaha YAS-6211
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa A991
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-26 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-475
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-27 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-62II
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yanagisawa T901
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-29 Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YBS-62 
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa B901
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-39 Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121
Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121SP
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204MS
Marching Mellophones (F)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

Manufacturer:

09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-01 THROUGH MU-61 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

National Educational Music Company Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instuments
1181 US Route 22, Box 1130 1270 Wilbur Street. SE PO Box 126

Mountainside, NJ 07092 Salem, OR 97302 Forth Worth, TX 76101

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

$2,029.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,139.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds NL1123F

$4,389.00 No Bid No Bid
$3,588.00 No Bid No Bid

Schreiber WS5110

$6,069.00 No Bid No Bid
$5,275.00 / WS5013 No Bid No Bid

$1,327.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,128.00 No Bid No Bid

Selmer SAS280R

$1,747.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,576.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,124.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds Professional NA64JR

$1,524.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,335.00 No Bid No Bid

Selmer STS280R

$1,887.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,199.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,239.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds Professional NA68JR

$5,398.00 No Bid No Bid
$4,349.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,948.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds Professional NA85LB

$970.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,094.00 No Bid No Bid
$969.00 No Bid No Bid

$1,015.00 No Bid No Bid
$709.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds NA42
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

MU-06 Oboe-Yamaha YOB-441
Oboe-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-10 Bassoon-Fox Renard 222
Bassoon-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-11 Bassoon-Fox Renard 220
Bassoon-Schrieber WS5013 

MU-24 Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YAS-475
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-25 Alto Saxophone (Eb-)Yamaha YAS-6211
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa A991
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-26 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-475
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-27 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-62II
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yanagisawa T901
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-29 Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YBS-62 
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa B901
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-39 Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121
Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121SP
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204MS
Marching Mellophones (F)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

Manufacturer:

09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-01 THROUGH MU-61 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

Southwest Springs Taylor Music, Inc. Washington Music Sales Center, Inc.
1721 S. Cherrybell Strav. 513 S. Main 11151 Veirs Mill Road

Tuscon, AZ 85713 PO Box 670 Wheaton, MD 20902
Aberdeen, SD 57402-0670

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

No Bid $2,044.00 $2,034.00
No Bid No Bid $1,441.00

Selmer 122F

No Bid $4,366.00 $4,363.00
No Bid $4,040.00 $4,249.00

Selmer 132 Schreiber S-16

No Bid $6,044.00 $6,036.00
No Bid No Bid $6,189.00 / WS5131

No Bid $1,333.00 $1,333.00
No Bid No Bid $1,124.00

Selmer SAS280R

No Bid $1,722.00 $1,755.00
No Bid $2,688.00 $2,582.00
No Bid No Bid $1,599.00

Keilwerth EX90 III JK 22008

No Bid $1,522.00 $1,531.00
No Bid No Bid $1,699.00

Keilwerth EX90III JK3200-8

No Bid $1,800.00 $1,894.00
No Bid $2,311.00 $2,204.00
No Bid No Bid $1,699.00

Keilwerth EX90 III  JK32008

No Bid $5,399.00 $5,423.00
No Bid $4,522.00 $4,357.00
No Bid No Bid $3,064.00

Selmer SBS280R

No Bid $1,011.00 $968.00
No Bid $1,140.00 $1,093.00
No Bid $988.00 $973.00
No Bid $1,033.00 $1,020.00
No Bid $766.00 $709.00

DEG M541L (Brass) Jupiter 450L (lacquer)
$811.00

Silver DEG M541S
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

MU-06 Oboe-Yamaha YOB-441
Oboe-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-10 Bassoon-Fox Renard 222
Bassoon-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-11 Bassoon-Fox Renard 220
Bassoon-Schrieber WS5013 

MU-24 Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YAS-475
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-25 Alto Saxophone (Eb-)Yamaha YAS-6211
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa A991
Alto Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-26 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-475
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-27 Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yamaha YTS-62II
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Yanagisawa T901
Tenor Saxophone (Bb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-29 Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yamaha YBS-62 
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Yanagisawa B901
Baritone Saxophone (Eb)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-39 Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121
Marching Mellophones (F)-King 1121SP
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204
Marching Mellophones (F)-Yamaha YMP-204MS
Marching Mellophones (F)-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

Manufacturer:

09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-01 THROUGH MU-61 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

Wenger Corporation The Woodwind & Brasswind
555 Park Drive 4004 Technoloty Drive

Owatonna, MN 55060-0448 South Bend, IN 46628

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

No Bid $2,160.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $4,250.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $5,900.00
No Bid $6,300.00

No Bid $1,410.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $1,860.00
No Bid $2,950.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $1,640.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $2,000.00
No Bid $2,450.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $5,650.00
No Bid $4,975.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $1,125.00
No Bid $1,280.00
No Bid $1,070.00
No Bid $1,120.00
No Bid No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

All County Music, Inc Interstate Music Music Man
8136 N University Dr 13819 W National Ave PO Box 8335
Tamarac, FL 33321 New Berlin, WI 53151 2309 N Dixie Hwy

West Palm Beach, FL 33407

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-48 Euphonium-King 2280SP No Bid $1,983.00 $1,848.00
Euphonium-Yamaha YEP-321S No Bid $1,784.00 $1,731.00
Euphonium-Or Equal Mfg.: $2,187.50 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: VMI171S

MU-50 Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-621 No Bid $5,317.00 $5,168.00
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.: $6,646.50 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: Meinl Weston MW18WC

MU-51 Concert Tuba-Conn 5JSPW No Bid No Bid $4,019.00
Concert Tuba-King 2341SPW No Bid No Bid $4,232.00
Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-321 No Bid $4,107.00 $3,927.00
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-53 Tuba-Yamaha YBB-641WC No Bid $5,152.00 $4,899.00
Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.: $6,086.50 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer: VMI103WC

MU-69
Drum, Marching Quints-Ludwig LF-C564XVWC, case LP02C, includes carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid
Drum, Marching Quints-Pearl PMTC 60234 wPD-8004 case No Bid No Bid $1,120.00 (tube carrier)

$1,199.00 / PMT 60234 (mag carrier)
Drum, Marching Quints-Yamaha MQT-6200, includes case and carrier No Bid No Bid $1,132.00

MU-70 
Drum, Marching Quads-Ludwig LFC483XVWC, case LP01C, includes carrier No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drum, Marching Quads-Pearl PMT 8023NC with carrier, Case PD8004 No Bid No Bid $699.00
Drum, Marching Quads-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid $656.00
Manufacturer:

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $1,819.00
No Bid No Bid $1,132.00
No Bid No Bid $656.00

MU-118 Guitar Bass-Fender Squire Precision Bass No Bid No Bid No Bid
Guitar Bass-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 PEARL
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 YAMAHA
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 "OR EQUAL"

MU-113 THROUGH MU-134 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 AWARDED TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BY 
MANUFACTURER AND "OR EQUAL"

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 LUDWIG

Page 5 09-115-SN Musical Instruments-Secondary



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-48 Euphonium-King 2280SP
Euphonium-Yamaha YEP-321S
Euphonium-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-50 Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-621
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-51 Concert Tuba-Conn 5JSPW
Concert Tuba-King 2341SPW
Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-321
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-53 Tuba-Yamaha YBB-641WC
Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-69
Drum, Marching Quints-Ludwig LF-C564XVWC, case LP02C, includes carrier
Drum, Marching Quints-Pearl PMTC 60234 wPD-8004 case

Drum, Marching Quints-Yamaha MQT-6200, includes case and carrier

MU-70 
Drum, Marching Quads-Ludwig LFC483XVWC, case LP01C, includes carrier

Drum, Marching Quads-Pearl PMT 8023NC with carrier, Case PD8004
Drum, Marching Quads-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-118 Guitar Bass-Fender Squire Precision Bass
Guitar Bass-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 PEARL
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 YAMAHA
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 "OR EQUAL"

MU-113 THROUGH MU-134 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 AWARDED TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BY 
MANUFACTURER AND "OR EQUAL"

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 LUDWIG

National Educational Music Company Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instuments
1181 US Route 22, Box 1130 1270 Wilbur Street. SE PO Box 126

Mountainside, NJ 07092 Salem, OR 97302 Forth Worth, TX 76101

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
$1,819.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,742.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,304.00 No Bid No Bid

Jupiter 470S

$5,113.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,887.00 No Bid No Bid

Jupiter 780L

$3,959.00 No Bid No Bid
$4,037.00 No Bid No Bid
$3,699.00 No Bid No Bid
$3,442.00 No Bid No Bid
Conn 5JW

$4,929.00 No Bid No Bid
$3,739.00 No Bid No Bid

Olds N01004GWC

$1,074.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,139.00 / Pearl PMT60234AXC No Bid No Bid

$1,199.00 / MQT60234FWC No Bid No Bid

$895.00 No Bid No Bid

$976.00 No Bid No Bid
$716.00 No Bid No Bid

Yamaha MQL8023XWWC

$1,969.00 No Bid No Bid
$2,115.00 No Bid No Bid
$1,199.00 No Bid No Bid
$716.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-48 Euphonium-King 2280SP
Euphonium-Yamaha YEP-321S
Euphonium-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-50 Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-621
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-51 Concert Tuba-Conn 5JSPW
Concert Tuba-King 2341SPW
Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-321
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-53 Tuba-Yamaha YBB-641WC
Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-69
Drum, Marching Quints-Ludwig LF-C564XVWC, case LP02C, includes carrier
Drum, Marching Quints-Pearl PMTC 60234 wPD-8004 case

Drum, Marching Quints-Yamaha MQT-6200, includes case and carrier

MU-70 
Drum, Marching Quads-Ludwig LFC483XVWC, case LP01C, includes carrier

Drum, Marching Quads-Pearl PMT 8023NC with carrier, Case PD8004
Drum, Marching Quads-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-118 Guitar Bass-Fender Squire Precision Bass
Guitar Bass-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 PEARL
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 YAMAHA
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 "OR EQUAL"

MU-113 THROUGH MU-134 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 AWARDED TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BY 
MANUFACTURER AND "OR EQUAL"

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 LUDWIG

Southwest Springs Taylor Music, Inc. Washington Music Sales Center, Inc.
1721 S. Cherrybell Strav. 513 S. Main 11151 Veirs Mill Road

Tuscon, AZ 85713 PO Box 670 Wheaton, MD 20902
Aberdeen, SD 57402-0670

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid $1,888.00 $1,824.00
No Bid $1,755.00 $1,750.00
No Bid $1,311.00 $1,378.00

Jupiter 470S Holton B490RS

No Bid $5,399.00 $5,288.00
No Bid $2,555.00 $4,499.00

Jupiter 482L Kaustul 902-4B-1

No Bid $4,444.00 $4,162.00
No Bid $4,455.00 $4269.00 / King 2341WSP 
No Bid $4,099.00 $4,052.00
No Bid $3,577.00 $3,672.00

Jupiter 532L Holton BB460

No Bid $5,199.00 $5,079.00
No Bid $6,199.00 $4,149.00

Mirafone S186W Cerveny CBB6864PRXO

No Bid $1,199.00 $1,029.00
No Bid $1,066.00 $1,189.00

No Bid $1,199.00 $1,129.00

No Bid $999.00 $989.00

No Bid $888.00 $999.00
No Bid $699.00 $945.00

Yamaha MQT8023 FWC

No Bid $2,198.00 $2,018.00
No Bid $1,954.00 $2,188.00
No Bid $1,199.00 $1,129.00
No Bid $699.00 $945.00

No Bid No Bid $267.00
No Bid No Bid $227.00

Yamaha RBX170
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-48 Euphonium-King 2280SP
Euphonium-Yamaha YEP-321S
Euphonium-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-50 Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-621
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-51 Concert Tuba-Conn 5JSPW
Concert Tuba-King 2341SPW
Concert Tuba-Yamaha YBB-321
Concert Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-53 Tuba-Yamaha YBB-641WC
Tuba-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-69
Drum, Marching Quints-Ludwig LF-C564XVWC, case LP02C, includes carrier
Drum, Marching Quints-Pearl PMTC 60234 wPD-8004 case

Drum, Marching Quints-Yamaha MQT-6200, includes case and carrier

MU-70 
Drum, Marching Quads-Ludwig LFC483XVWC, case LP01C, includes carrier

Drum, Marching Quads-Pearl PMT 8023NC with carrier, Case PD8004
Drum, Marching Quads-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-118 Guitar Bass-Fender Squire Precision Bass
Guitar Bass-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 PEARL
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 YAMAHA
TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 "OR EQUAL"

MU-113 THROUGH MU-134 WILL BE AWARDED INDIVIDUALLY

ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 AWARDED TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BY 
MANUFACTURER AND "OR EQUAL"

TOTAL “ALL OR NONE” BID PRICE ITEMS MU-69 THROUGH MU-70 LUDWIG

Wenger Corporation The Woodwind & Brasswind
555 Park Drive 4004 Technoloty Drive

Owatonna, MN 55060-0448 South Bend, IN 46628

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid $2,120.00
No Bid $1,900.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $5,400.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid $4,850.00
No Bid $3,950.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $5,200.00
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid $330.00
No Bid No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

All County Music, Inc Interstate Music Music Man
8136 N University Dr 13819 W National Ave PO Box 8335
Tamarac, FL 33321 New Berlin, WI 53151 2309 N Dixie Hwy

West Palm Beach, FL 33407

ITEM# DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-121 Music Stands-Wenger Roughneck No Bid No Bid No Bid
Music Stands-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-125 Midi-Synthesizer-KORG 01WFD  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Midi-Synthesizer-Or Equal Mfg.: No Bid No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer:

MU-134 String Bass-Glaesel DB633CFH, w/GL0760 bag, GL2501 bow  ***Discontinued No Bid No Bid $1,361.00 / SB9002L3CFH

$1,959.00 / DB303CFH
String Bass-Strunal 535 No Bid $1,503.00 No Bid

Exclusions: Products prices held only until 

Discountinued items will be 
replaced upon mutual 
agreement of item and possible 
price difference.  If an 
agreement cannot be met, the 
item may be awareded to the 
next lowest bidder and no 
penalty imposed upon Interstate 
Music.
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-121 Music Stands-Wenger Roughneck
Music Stands-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-125 Midi-Synthesizer-KORG 01WFD  
Midi-Synthesizer-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-134 String Bass-Glaesel DB633CFH, w/GL0760 bag, GL2501 bow  ***Discontinued

String Bass-Strunal 535
Exclusions:

National Educational Music Company Peripole-Bergerault, Inc. Rhythm Band Instuments
1181 US Route 22, Box 1130 1270 Wilbur Street. SE PO Box 126

Mountainside, NJ 07092 Salem, OR 97302 Forth Worth, TX 76101

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $30.53

Hamilton KB95E

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Disc. No Bid No Bid

$1,599.00 No Bid No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-121 Music Stands-Wenger Roughneck
Music Stands-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-125 Midi-Synthesizer-KORG 01WFD  
Midi-Synthesizer-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-134 String Bass-Glaesel DB633CFH, w/GL0760 bag, GL2501 bow  ***Discontinued

String Bass-Strunal 535
Exclusions:

Southwest Springs Taylor Music, Inc. Washington Music Sales Center, Inc.
1721 S. Cherrybell Strav. 513 S. Main 11151 Veirs Mill Road

Tuscon, AZ 85713 PO Box 670 Wheaton, MD 20902
Aberdeen, SD 57402-0670

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
No Bid No Bid $70.00 (037C001)
No Bid $24.00 (1-11 Qty.) $23.00 (12+) $21.00
No Bid Manhassett M48 Hamilton KB95E

No Bid No Bid $1,549.00 Korg M361
No Bid No Bid $1,797.00

Yamaha Motif XS6

$1,845.00 / H K Roger 870HFT No Bid $1,273.00

Scheul Roth SB900L3CFH
$1,565.00 No Bid $1,599.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# DESCRIPTION
09-115-SN
BID: 

DATE OF OPENING:  
February 26, 2009 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: 
Musical Instruments - Secondary

MU-121 Music Stands-Wenger Roughneck
Music Stands-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-125 Midi-Synthesizer-KORG 01WFD  
Midi-Synthesizer-Or Equal Mfg.:
Manufacturer:

MU-134 String Bass-Glaesel DB633CFH, w/GL0760 bag, GL2501 bow  ***Discontinued

String Bass-Strunal 535
Exclusions:

Wenger Corporation The Woodwind & Brasswind
555 Park Drive 4004 Technoloty Drive

Owatonna, MN 55060-0448 South Bend, IN 46628

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
$53.00/Wenger 037C001 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
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