



District School Board of Pasco County

7227 Land O' Lakes Boulevard • Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638 • 813/ 794-2000

Heather Fiorentino, Superintendent

www.pasco.k12.fl.us

Department of Purchasing

Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

813/794-2221 Fax: 813/794-2221

727/774-2221 TDD: 813/794-2484

352/524-2221 e-mail: kgoodman@pasco.k12.fl.us

February 16, 2010

MEMORANDUM

TO: Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

RE: Request Permission to Piggyback
Pinellas County School Board Bid #10-880-102 – Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.
Thermal/Poster Paper only

The Purchasing Department is requesting approval to “piggyback” Pinellas County School Board Bid #10-880-102 – Audio Visual and Video Equipment/Materials for the purchase of Transfer Paper from Audio Visual Innovations, Inc. on an “as needed” basis. The piggyback will allow the District to receive a five percent discount off the manufacturer’s price for Variquest/Varitronics Transfer Paper. This contract is effective February 17, 2010 through January 25, 2011.

The estimated total dollar amount of \$50,000 is based upon orders processed by the District for last fiscal year. The Purchasing Department will monitor transactions to assure the estimated dollar amount is not exceeded.

Should you have any questions or wish to discuss this matter further, please contact me at your convenience.

KDG/vj



District School Board of Pasco County

20430 Gator Lane • Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638 • 813/794-2221

John Long, Ph.D., Superintendent

www.pasco.k12.fl.us

Department of Purchasing
Kendra Goodman, CPPB, Purchasing Agent
813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 794-2111
727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484
352/ 524-2221 e-mail: kgoodman@pasco.k12.fl.us

January 28, 2010

BID PIGGYBACK REQUEST

BID # 10-880-102 Pinellas County School Board

BID TITLE: Audio Visual & Video Equipment/Materials

Yes, I agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggyback Bid # 10-880-102 under the same terms and conditions as the existing bid. The coverage period shall be from January 26, 2010 through January 25, 2011. *For Varifronics ONLY.*

No, I do not agree to allow the District School Board of Pasco County to piggyback Bid # 10-880-102.

COMPANY NAME: Audio Visual Innovations

SIGNATURE: Cindy Turner

TYPED NAME AND TITLE: Cindy Turner Public Sector Contracts Mgr.
(Person authorized to bind your company)

TELEPHONE (WITH AREA CODE): 813 884-7168

FAX NUMBER (WITH AREA CODE): 813 882-9508

DATE: 2-1-2010

The prospective bidder certifies, by submission and signature of this piggyback request form, that neither it nor its principals are presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from participation in this transaction per the provisions of Florida Statute 287.133(2)(a).

PLEASE FAX TO: DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY
ATTENTION: VICKIE JONES, PURCHASING ASSISTANT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
20430 GATOR LANE
LAND O' LAKES, FL 34638
(813) 794-2226 (PHONE)
(813) 794-2713 (FAX)

SCHOOL BOARD OF PINELLAS COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID # 10-880-102

Bid Title: Audio Visual & Video Equipment & Materials

Date & Time Due: November 19, 2009 @ 3 PM

Item #	Description	AFP Industries	Audio Visual Innovations	Aves Audio Visual	AVID	BES Industries	B & H Photo	Cancer	CDW SYSTEMS	Item #
50	Audio Mixer	No Bid	No Bid	SAMSON	No Bid	BEHRINGER	BEHRINGER	No Bid	No Bid	
	MFG:	No Bid	No Bid	MOR1688	No Bid	122ZFX	122ZFX	No Bid	No Bid	
	Model#	No Bid	VARIQUEST	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Price	No Bid	PM3500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
		No Bid	\$4,595.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
51	Poster Printer Paper, Standard	No Bid	VARIQUEST	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	MFG:	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Model#	No Bid	5.00%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Discount Percent	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
52	Projection Screen Wall Mount, 60x60	BRETFORD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	VUTECH	DRAPER	VUTECH	No Bid	
	MFG:	6560M	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	EVMM6060	209002	EVMM6060	No Bid	
	Model#	\$39.47	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$39.99	\$44.00	\$36.72	No Bid	
	Price									
53	Projection Screen Wall Mount, 70x70	BRETFORD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	VUTECH	DRAPER	VUTECH	No Bid	
	MFG:	6570M	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	EVMM7070	209003	EVMM7070	No Bid	
	Model#	\$42.59	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.85	\$46.00	\$41.82	No Bid	
	Price									
54	Projection Screen Electric	DA-LITE	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	VUTECH	DA-LITE	VUTECH	No Bid	
	MFG:	408LA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	EMJR120120	408LA	LETTRIC 1	No Bid	
	Model#	\$798.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$298.99	\$787.00	\$731.85	No Bid	
	Price									
55	Projection Screen Mounting Hardware	BRETFORD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	VUTECH	DRAPER	VUTECH	No Bid	
	MFG:	KW-18	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	EVWB1424	227216	EVMM1424	No Bid	
	Model#	\$23.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$24.00	\$21.00	\$16.30	No Bid	
	Price									