
District School Board of Pasco County 
Bid Recommendation 

 

Bid Title Office Supplies – 
Warehouse Stock 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

172 

Bid Number 11-007-AF  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

63 

Date 
Solicited 

February 5, 2010  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

14 

Date Opened March 3, 2010  Number of Formal “No 
Bid” Responses 

0 

Date Board 
Presentation 

April 20, 2010  Funding Source General 

Total Savings $33,204.02  Grand Total of Bid $51,914.80 

Recommendation:  
Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as lowest and best 
responsive, responsible bids meeting written specifications. 
Term of Contract:  
This is an annual purchase for office products to be stocked in the central warehouse for use 
throughout the District. 
Notations and Exceptions: Recommend acceptance of all low bids as meeting the written 
specifications and testing criteria as specified in the bid documents with the following exceptions: 
 
OS-07: Tie between Standard Stationary Supply and Pyramid School Supply is recommended to 
Pyramid School Supply by toss-of-the-coin, as outlined in the specifications.  Toss-of-the-coin 
was witnessed by two District employees (on file in the Purchasing Department). 
 
OS-23 through 27: Recommend acceptance of “all or none” bid from Pyramid School Supply as 
lowest and best, responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications and testing criteria.  
Although there was an error in Pyramid’s “total” for this group, unit prices were correct and 
reflect the correct total.  Lower bid from Standard Stationary Supply is disqualified as outlined in 
the bid specifications for bidding multiple items for one item number. 
 
Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening 
date and time.  All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby 
rejected as late. 
Bids Evaluated By:   
Beth Gehring, Childcare Site Manager; Susan Green, Bookkeeper; Michelle Bolin, Finance 
Assistant II; Lorrie Sybert, Finance Assistant II; Joanne Auer, Secretary II 
Bids Prepared By: 
Amy Flack, Buyer Assistant, Purchasing Department 
Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 

Lora B. Lester
Typewritten Text
Date/Time: April 14, 2010 10:14:00



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

OS-001 1,200 Markers, Highlighting, 4 Colors No Bid $0.99 $1,188.00 $0.97 $1,164.00
Pkgs. Avery #17-752 or equal

OS-004 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo No Bid $3.99 $1,596.00 No Bid
Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-005 180 Tape Dispensers 3" Core No Bid $4.25 $765.00 $2.10 $378.00
each 3M #C-25 or equal

OS-006 1,200 Tape Dispensers 1" Core No Bid $1.09 $1,308.00 $0.86 $1,032.00
each 3M #C-38 or equal Status Plus #61-040

Leonard #81300

Universal #15001

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
631 Triumph Ct, Unit # 5

Orlando, FL 32805

ACCO Brands USA, LLC
300 Tower Pkwy

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

Ace Office Supplies AFP Industries, Inc.

South Miami, FL 33243
PO Box 43-0747

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

Liquimark #41580 Liquimark #41580

Universal #72220

Status Plus #61-042

OS-007 2,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size No Bid $3.99 $7,980.00 $3.68 $7,360.00
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-014 300 Rubber Bands No Bid $0.72 $216.00 No Bid
Bags Alliance Eco #54 or equal

OS-015 1,800 Scissors No Bid $2.49 $4,482.00 $0.47 $846.00
each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-016 3,000 Sheet Protectors No Bid $1.99 $5,970.00 $2.51 $7,530.00
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-017 3,600 Staples No Bid $0.40 $1,440.00 $0.377 $1,357.20
Boxes ACE # 74001 or equal

Acme #19018 Status Plus #26-183

Bostitch #SBS19 1/4 CP

Universal #00454

Bostitch #SBS19 1/4 CP

As specified

Status Plus #34-151

As specified

Universal #21124
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

OS-001 1,200 Markers, Highlighting, 4 Colors
Pkgs. Avery #17-752 or equal

OS-004 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-005 180 Tape Dispensers 3" Core
each 3M #C-25 or equal

OS-006 1,200 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
each 3M #C-38 or equal

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

No Bid No Bid $1.375 $1,650.00

$0.40 $160.00 No Bid No Bid

$1.88 $338.40 No Bid No Bid

$0.83 $996.00 $1.37 $1,644.00 No Bid

Avery #17-752

Status Plus #50-027

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
PO Box 107

Montreal, Quebec, H4E 1A4

Status Plus #61-042

260 Ryan Avenue3800 St. Patrick Street
Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Chico, CA 95973

Elgin School Supply Co., Inc.Business Stationers

Status Plus #61-040 CL1 #900

OS-007 2,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-014 300 Rubber Bands
Bags Alliance Eco #54 or equal

OS-015 1,800 Scissors
each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-016 3,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-017 3,600 Staples
Boxes ACE # 74001 or equal

No Bid No Bid $3.71 $7,420.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$1.31 $2,358.00 $0.698 $1,256.40 $2.39 $4,302.00

$1.86 $5,580.00 $4.12 $12,360.00 $2.06 $6,180.00

$0.488 $1,756.80 No Bid $0.38 $1,368.00

Armada #SN666A Fiskars #01-4249First Metal Norwegia #26240

Leonard #48185

Status Plus #66-066 Bostitch #SBS19 1/4 CP

As Specified

Samsill #42294Status Plus #34-150
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

OS-001 1,200 Markers, Highlighting, 4 Colors
Pkgs. Avery #17-752 or equal

OS-004 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-005 180 Tape Dispensers 3" Core
each 3M #C-25 or equal

OS-006 1,200 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
each 3M #C-38 or equal

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

$1.92 $2,304.00 $1.00 $1,200.00 $0.79 $948.00

$5.09 $2,036.00 $0.51 $204.00 $3.75 $1,500.00

$22.14 $3,985.20 $17.59 $3,165.65* $1.79 $322.20

$9.27 $1,112.40* $1.07 $1,278.26* $0.79 $948.00

Glastonbury, CT 06033

Avery #AVE17752

Pyramid School Products
655 Winding Brook Dr.
IKON Office Solutions

6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

12916 DuPont Cr., Bldg. C
My Office Products

Tampa, FL 33626

Universal #UNV77220

3M #MMMC40BK Sparco #SPR64007 Status Plus #61-040

Integra #ITA01526 Liquamark #41580

As Specified As Specified Status Plus #61-042

Sparco #SPR85009 Leonard #301E

OS-007 2,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-014 300 Rubber Bands
Bags Alliance Eco #54 or equal

OS-015 1,800 Scissors
each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-016 3,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-017 3,600 Staples
Boxes ACE # 74001 or equal

$12.55 $25,100.00 $5.92 $11,847.83* $3.66 $7,320.00

$1.32 $396.00 $1.05 $316.30* $0.53 $159.00

$5.64 $10,152.00 $1.47 $2641.30* $1.23 $2,214.00

$4.53 $13,590.00 $5.90 $17,706.52* $1.69 $5,070.00

$0.73 $2,628.00 $0.52 $1878.26* $0.37 $1,332.00

C-Line #CLI62038

Universal #UNV79000

Universal #UNV00454

Westcott #ACM13139 Sparco # SPR02041 Status Plus #26-240

Bostitch #SBS19 1/4 CP

Status Plus #34-015

As SpecifiedSparco #SPR5414LB

Sparco #SPRHB210

As SpecifiedAs Specified As Specified

Sparco #SPR74102
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

OS-001 1,200 Markers, Highlighting, 4 Colors
Pkgs. Avery #17-752 or equal

OS-004 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-005 180 Tape Dispensers 3" Core
each 3M #C-25 or equal

OS-006 1,200 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
each 3M #C-38 or equal

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

$1.35 $1,620.00 $1.19 $1,428.00 $0.79 $948.00

$3.69 $1,476.00 $0.43 $516.00* No Bid

No Bid $18.85 $3,393.00 No Bid

No Bid $2.19 $2,628.00 No Bid

Greenville, WI 54942
W6316 Design Drive

School Specialty

Hollywood, FL 33020Lincolnshire, IL 60069

Quill Corporation
1009 S. 21st Avenue100 Schelter Road

As Specified

School Specialty #084475

As Specified Bic #BLMGP41

As Specified

Quill #BID-P1JG

Smith Office & Computer Supply

Liquamark #41580

OS-007 2,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-014 300 Rubber Bands
Bags Alliance Eco #54 or equal

OS-015 1,800 Scissors
each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-016 3,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-017 3,600 Staples
Boxes ACE # 74001 or equal

$3.79 $7,580.00 $3.91 $7,820.00 $3.69 $7,380.00

No Bid $0.38 $114.00 No Bid

$0.78 $1,404.00 No Bid No Bid

$1.83 $5,490.00 $1.55 $4,650.00 $2.00 $6,000.00

$0.49 $1,764.00 $0.49 $1,764.00 No Bid

School Specialty #020874

School Specialty #070311

Quill #BID-790701BE

Amax #SBS19 1/4 CP

School Specialty #084904

Quill #BID-791123

Quill #BID-7Q5215

Quill #BID-702050 Universal #21124

As Specified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

OS-001 1,200 Markers, Highlighting, 4 Colors
Pkgs. Avery #17-752 or equal

OS-004 400 Paper Clips, Metal, Jumbo
Pkgs. Sparco #85009 or equal

OS-005 180 Tape Dispensers 3" Core
each 3M #C-25 or equal

OS-006 1,200 Tape Dispensers 1" Core
each 3M #C-38 or equal

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**
UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

$0.64 $768.00 $1.56 $1,872.00

$3.61 $1,444.00 No Bid

$1.74 $313.20 No Bid

$14.48 $2,606.40

$0.747 $896.40 $1.34 $1,608.00

$1 65 $1 980 00

Wheeling, IL 60090
9452 Phillips Hwy, Ste 7

Standard Stationery Supply, Co.
2251 Foster Avenue

Total Office Products

Jacksonville, FL 32256

Emphasizer # 814-6

Office Mate #PC-G

Standard #C38

Standard #G250

Altermate 3M #C-25

As Specified

Charles Leonard #900-BK

OS-007 2,000 File Folders, Hanging Letter Size
Boxes Pendaflex ESS81602 1/5 Cut or equal

OS-014 300 Rubber Bands
Bags Alliance Eco #54 or equal

OS-015 1,800 Scissors
each Clauss Cutlery or equal

OS-016 3,000 Sheet Protectors
Boxes Sparco # 74102 or equal

OS-017 3,600 Staples
Boxes ACE # 74001 or equal

$1.65 $1,980.00

$3.66 $7,320.00 $4.64 $9,280.00

$0.428 $128.40 No Bid

$0.438 $788.40 $2.60 $4,680.00

$1.39 $4,170.00 $3.20 $9,600.00

$0.344 $1,238.40 $0.56 $2,016.00

Standard #2100

General #54

C-Line #62038

Charles Leonard #84500

Oxford #ESS81602

Standard #STBC

Premier #42294

Acme #19018

Ampad #421 1/5

 Alternate 3M #C-38
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
631 Triumph Ct, Unit # 5

Orlando, FL 32805

ACCO Brands USA, LLC
300 Tower Pkwy

Lincolnshire, IL 60069
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

Ace Office Supplies AFP Industries, Inc.

South Miami, FL 33243
PO Box 43-0747

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

OS-019 600 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core No Bid $4.44 $2,664.00 $5.67 $3,402.00
Dzn 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-020 900 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core No Bid $5.76 $5,184.00 $7.23 $6,507.00
Dzn 3M Brand 810-3/4x1296 or equal

OS-023 1,200 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2" x 2" Size, Yellow No Bid $1.17 $1,404.00
Pkg 3M #653 or equal

OS-024 1,200 Post-It Notes, 3" x 3" Size, Yellow No Bid $2.39 $2,868.00

Leonard #49534

Stickety-Do #60-347

Leonard #49512

Mend - All #60-664

Mend - All #60-662

Disqualified

DisqualifiedOS 024 1,200 Post It Notes, 3  x 3  Size, Yellow No Bid $2.39 $2,868.00
Pkg 3M #554-YW or equal

OS-026 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink No Bid No Bid $3.20 $768.00
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-027 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue No Bid No Bid $3.20 $768.00*
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

No Bid $5808.00*

OS-034 18,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White $1.16 $20,880.00 $0.98 $17,640.00 $1.55 $27,900.00
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-036 2,400 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White $3.04 $7,296.00 $2.58 $6,192.00 $3.07 $7,368.00
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

*Vendor Math Error

GBC Clear View, STD 8313001 Avery #CV1110WE

Avery #CV1125WE

Stickety-Do #60-348

GBC Clear View, STD 8313051

TOTAL ALL-OR-NONE FOR ITEMS OS023  - OS027

Stickety-Do #60-447

As Specified

As Specified

Disqualified

Disqualified

8313051

Stickety-Do #60-449
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

OS-019 600 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-020 900 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand 810-3/4x1296 or equal

OS-023 1,200 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2" x 2" Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #653 or equal

OS-024 1,200 Post-It Notes, 3" x 3" Size, Yellow

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Kingsbury, IN 46345-0107
PO Box 107

Montreal, Quebec, H4E 1A4
260 Ryan Avenue3800 St. Patrick Street

Bye-Mo'r, Inc.

Chico, CA 95973

Elgin School Supply Co., Inc.Business Stationers

$5.50 $3,300.00 $5.84 $3,504.00 $13.68 $8,208.00

$7.00 $6,300.00 $7.90 $7,110.00 $15.60 $14,040.00

$1.10 $1,320.00 No Bid

$2.25 $2,700.00 No Bid

Stickety-Do #60-347

Mend-All #60-664

Mend-All #60-662 3M #6200 1/2 x 1296

3M #6200 3/4 x 1296

3M #810 1/2 x 1296

As Specified

Disqualified

Disqualified

OS 024 1,200 Post It Notes, 3  x 3  Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #554-YW or equal

OS-026 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-027 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-034 18,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-036 2,400 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

*Vendor Math Error

TOTAL ALL-OR-NONE FOR ITEMS OS023  - OS027

$2.25 $2,700.00 No Bid

$3.18 $763.20 No Bid No Bid

$3.18 $1,526.40 No Bid No Bid

$6,309.60 No Bid

No Bid $0.97 $17,460.00 $0.96 $17,280.00

No Bid $2.575 $6,180.00 $2.54 $6,096.00

Stickety-Do #60-348

Samsill #18537C ACCO #27601

Stickety-Do #60-447

Stickety-Do #60-449

ACCO #27608Samsill #18587C

Disqualified

Disqualified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

OS-019 600 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-020 900 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand 810-3/4x1296 or equal

OS-023 1,200 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2" x 2" Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #653 or equal

OS-024 1,200 Post-It Notes, 3" x 3" Size, Yellow

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Glastonbury, CT 06033

Pyramid School Products
655 Winding Brook Dr.
IKON Office Solutions

6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

12916 DuPont Cr., Bldg. C
My Office Products

Tampa, FL 33626

$21.48 $12,888.00 $4.44 $2,660.87* $4.26 $2,556.00

$27.48 $24,732.00 $6.12 $5,517.39* $5.58 $5,022.00

$5.23 $6,276.00 $1.07 $1,284.00

$11.52 $13,824.00 $2.19 $2,628.00

As Specified

As Specified

As Specified

Sparco #SPR60046 Leonard #49512

Sparco #SPR60047 Leonard #49534

Stickety-Do #60-347
Disqualified

DisqualifiedOS 024 1,200 Post It Notes, 3  x 3  Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #554-YW or equal

OS-026 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-027 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-034 18,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-036 2,400 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

*Vendor Math Error

TOTAL ALL-OR-NONE FOR ITEMS OS023  - OS027

$11.52 $13,824.00 $2.19 $2,628.00

$13.86 $3,326.40 No Bid $2.92 $700.80

$13.86 $6,652.80 No Bid $2.92 $1401.60*

$30,079.20  $6,014.40*

$2.75 $49,500.00 $1.28 $23,086.96* $0.956 $17,208.00

$7.79 $18,696.00 $3.22 $7,721.74* $2.53 $6,072.00

As Specified Stickety-Do #60-348

3M #MMM654AST

As Specified

As Specified

Sparco # SPR05711

Sparco # SPR05741

3M #MMM654AST

Stickety-Do #60-449

Samsill #18537C

Samsill #18587C

Stickety-Do #60-447

Disqualified

Disqualified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

OS-019 600 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-020 900 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand 810-3/4x1296 or equal

OS-023 1,200 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2" x 2" Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #653 or equal

OS-024 1,200 Post-It Notes, 3" x 3" Size, Yellow

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Greenville, WI 54942
W6316 Design Drive

School Specialty

Hollywood, FL 33020Lincolnshire, IL 60069

Quill Corporation
1009 S. 21st Avenue100 Schelter Road

Smith Office & Computer Supply

No Bid $6.72 $336.00* $5.94 $3,564.00

No Bid $9.12 $684.00* $8.28 $7,452.00

No Bid $4.59 $5,508.00

No Bid $1.97 $2,364.00

As Specified

As Specified

3M #6200As Specified

3M #6200

Disqualified

DisqualifiedOS 024 1,200 Post It Notes, 3  x 3  Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #554-YW or equal

OS-026 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-027 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-034 18,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-036 2,400 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

*Vendor Math Error

TOTAL ALL-OR-NONE FOR ITEMS OS023  - OS027

No Bid $1.97 $2,364.00

No Bid $1.62 $388.80 No Bid

No Bid $1.62 $777.60 No Bid

No Bid $9,038.40

$2.22 $39,960.00 $1.56 $28,080.00 $0.945 $17,010.00

$4.00 $9,600.00 $2.31 $5,544.00 $2.50 $6,000.00

School Specialty #084876

School Specialty #084877

Quill #BID-7221WE

School Specialty #084878

School Specialty #086397

As Specified

As Specified

Disqualified

Quill # BID-7223WE

School Specialty #086388

Disqualified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

ITEM# QTY. DESCRIPTION

DATE OF OPENING: March 3, 2010 @ 2:30 PM

BID:  11-007-AF
BID TITLE: Office Supplies - Warehouse Stock

**Board Meeting 4/20/10**

OS-019 600 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand MMM810121296 or equal

OS-020 900 Tape, Magic Transparent 1' Core
Dzn 3M Brand 810-3/4x1296 or equal

OS-023 1,200 Post-It Notes, 1 1/2" x 2" Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #653 or equal

OS-024 1,200 Post-It Notes, 3" x 3" Size, Yellow

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Wheeling, IL 60090
9452 Phillips Hwy, Ste 7

Standard Stationery Supply, Co.
2251 Foster Avenue

Total Office Products

Jacksonville, FL 32256

$13.65 $8,190.00 $4.76 $2,856.00

$5.50 $3,300.00

$16.35 $14,715.00 $6.40 $5,760.00

$7.43 $6,687.00

$0.977 $1,172.40 No Bid

$2.07 $2,484.00 No Bid

Charles Leonard #49512

Charles Leonard #49534

Alternate Beautone #11110

3M #810

3M #810

Alternate 3M #6200

Alternate 3M #6200

proposed - not permitted
Disqualified as 2 alternated

OS 024 1,200 Post It Notes, 3  x 3  Size, Yellow
Pkg 3M #554-YW or equal

OS-026 240 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Pink
Pkgs. 3M # 654-PK or equal

OS-027 480 Post-It-Notes 3" x 3" Size Blue
Pkgs. 3M # 654-BE or equal

OS-034 18,000 3-Ring Present Binders 1" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-14W or equal

OS-036 2,400 3-Ring Present Binder 3" Capacity, White
Each Wilson Jones # W362-49W or equal

*Vendor Math Error

TOTAL ALL-OR-NONE FOR ITEMS OS023  - OS027

$2.07 $2,484.00 No Bid

$2.18 $523.20 No Bid

$2.18 $1,046.40 No Bid

No Bid

$0.967/ $0.996 $11604/ $5976 $1.05 $18,900.00

$2.56/ $2.64 $3072/ $5976 $2.75 $6,600.00
Samsill #18587C

Beautone #11032

Alternate Beautone #11030

Samsill #18537C

Disqualified

Samsill #18537C

Samsill #18587C

Beautone #11031

proposed - not permitted
Disqualified as 2 alternated
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