

## **District School Board of Pasco County**

20430 Gator Lane • Land O' Lakes, Florida 34638 • 813/794-2221

Heather Fiorentino, Superintendent

www.pasco.k12,fl.us

Department of Purchasing

Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

813/ 794-2221 Fax: 813/ 794-2111 727/ 774-2221 TDD: 813/ 794-2484

352/ 524-2221 e-mail: kgoodman@pasco.k12.fl.us

March 1, 2011

## **MEMORANDUM**

**TO:** Honorable School Board Members

FROM: Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent

**RE:** Rescind and Re-award

Bid #11-055-AJ Plumbing Supplies

Item NPA63, 4" PVC DWV plug, schedule 40

Item NPA65, 2" Plug PVC DWV

Item NPA69, 4" x 3" PVC DWV bushing, schedule 40 Item NPA71, 3" x 2" PVC DWV bushing, schedule 40

On February 1, 2011 official action was taken to award the above-mentioned items to Ferguson – Castle Supply. After the award, Ferguson-Castle Supply had brought to our attention that the above noted items were incorrectly tabulated.

These items have been changed to correctly reflect an award to HD Supply, Inc. as the lowest and best bid meeting specifications. We are requesting that the Board rescind the award to Ferguson – Castle Supply and re-award to HD Supply, Inc. for the above-mentioned items.

Should you have any questions regarding this matter, or if I can be of further assistance, please feel free to contact me at your earliest convenience.

KDG/amj

Attachments

Date/Time: February 23, 2011 08:30:00

DATE OF C BID TITLE:	PENIN	DATE OF OPENING: December 2, 2010 @ 2:30 PM BID TITLE: Plumbing Supplies - Maintenance Department	Apple 2042 N.	Best 3039	Bridgeton 756 N.	Ferguson - 9900 State	Ferguson - HD Supply 9900 State 8326	Innovative 2501-A	Interline 701 San	Tampa 6930	Warner 5205 North
BID #11-055-AJ	5-AJ	-	Wading	Myersville,	Bridgeton,	Hudson, FL	Port Richey,		Jacksonville		Tampa, FL
		**Awarded 2/1/2011**									
ITEM#	ΩTY	QTY DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
			10111								
NPA63	15	15 4" PVC DWV PLUG SCHEDULE 40	No Bid	\$1.92	\$1.51	<del>0.426</del> 1.126	\$1.062	\$2.12	\$1.51	\$1.25	\$1.50
NPA65	15	15 2" PLUG PVC DWV	No Bid	\$0.73	\$0.60	0.384 0.426	\$0.402	\$0.75	\$0.58	\$0.47	\$0.53
NPA69	25	25 4" X 3" PVC DWV BUSHING SCHEDULE 40	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.13	<del>0.936</del> 1.592	\$1.500	\$3.00	\$2.24	\$1.76	\$2.12
NPA71	25	25 3" X 2" PVC DWV BUSHING SCHEDULE 40	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.29	<del>0.372</del> 0.936	\$0.882	\$1.77	\$1.26	\$1.04	\$1.25