
 
 
 

Bid Title Telecommunications 
Repair Products 

 Number of Vendors 
Notified 

82 

Bid Number 11-061-AZ  Number of Bids 
Distributed 

32 

Date 
Solicited 

January 10, 2011  Number of Vendors 
Bidding 

2 

Date Opened February 2, 2011  Number of Formal “No 
Bid” Responses 

0 

Date Board 
Presentation 

March 1, 2011  Funding Source General 
funds 

Total Savings N/A  Grand Total of Proposal $482,818.25 

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bid from Graybar per the attached bid tabulation 
as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications. 

Term of Contract: This bid is for telecommunications repair products, purchased on an as-
needed basis for the Information Services Department. The term of this bid is three (3) years, 
renewable annually at the mutual agreement of the parties. The first-year term will be March 5, 
2011 – March 4, 2012.  Prices in Part A are firm and fixed for the first-year term of the bid. 
Thereafter, increases or decreases in pricing will be based on changes in a specific Producer Price 
Index, as outlined in the bid document. Prices in Part B, fixed percentage discount off retail list 
price for balance of line, may be adjusted at specific intervals, subject to the District receiving an 
updated manufacturer pricer and approval by the Purchasing Department. 

Notations and Exceptions:  Toner Cable Equipment bid only on Blonder Tongue product. The 
bid’s intent is to establish terms and pricing for approximately 28 product lines on an all-or-none 
basis. Toner Cable’s bid was therefore considered non-responsive and cannot be considered.  
 
Graybar’s all-or-none bid price contains a slight mathematical error of less than $1.00, which does 
not affect bid award. Graybar has confirmed that they will honor line item pricing as bid. As 
Graybar is the sole competitive bid received, the Purchasing Department has verified that their 
pricing is fair and reasonable.  A price comparison was performed on Graybar’s pricing through 
their current US Communities contract. Based on a random sample, the bid pricing we have 
received is an average of 32% less than the current US Communities pricing. Additionally, a price 
comparison was performed on a sample of high-usage items on our current bid with Graybar vs. 
their proposed new pricing. The average increase in Graybar’s pricing, which has been fixed since 
2008, is 5%, with some high-usage actually decreasing in price by as much a 10%.  
 
We recommend award to Graybar as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written 
specifications.  Offers from other vendors listed herein are the only offers received per the 
specified opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, 
are hereby rejected as late. 
 

Lora B. Lester
Typewritten Text
Date/Time:  February 23, 2011  08:16:00



 
 
 

Bids Evaluated By: 
Janie Harper, Inventory Records Specialist 
Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer 
  

Bid Prepared By: 
Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer 
 

Reviewed and Authorized By: 
Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: February 2, 2011
BID TITLE:  Telecom Repair Products
BID #11-061-AZ
**BOARD MEETING MARCH 1, 2011**

SUPPLIER PART NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY U/M UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Toner Cable Equipment Inc.
969 Horsham Rd.

Horsham, PA  19044

Graybar
4010 W. Osborne Ave.

Tampa, FL  33614

3M 3M 88T TAPE, BLACK 200 PER 66' ROLL 2.43$             486.00$             No bid No bid
BELDEN RG6U-P-FA-TC-R-BED RG6 PLENUM CABLE 25 1000' REEL 504.00$         12,600.00$        No bid No bid
BELDEN B9066-1000 RG6 FLOODED 1000' 20 1000' REEL 86.00$           1,720.00$          No bid No bid

BERK-TEK BER926030
4 COUNT FIBER  1000' 
MM 25 1000' REEL 357.00$         8,925.00$          No bid No bid

BERK-TEK 5EXHP4P24-XX-BER-AP 4 PAIR CAT 5E  1000' 15 1000' REEL 208.00$         3,120.00$          No bid No bid

BERK-TEK 6XHP4P24-XX-BER-AP
4 PAIR CAT 6  1000' 
(LANDMARK 2000) 30 1000' REEL 373.00$         11,190.00$        No bid No bid

BERK-TEK BER231021
SPEED PULL CAT 5E 
1000' 36 1000' REEL 1,072.00$      38,592.00$        No bid No bid

BLONDER TONGUE 59416-L2
MODULATOR NO OPT. 4  
AM60-550 10 EACH 598.40$         5,984.00$          * 672.00$          6,720.00$        

BLONDER TONGUE 59416-4
MODULATOR WITH OPT. 
4 AM60-550 15 EACH 723.26$         10,848.90$        672.00$          10,080.00$      

BLONDER TONGUE 59817-T
MODULATOR WITH OPT 
17 AM60-550B 5 EACH 918.36$         4,591.80$          944.00$          4,720.00$        

BLONDER TONGUE 5800-53
SUB CHANNEL AMP  
BIDA-55A-30 5 EACH 344.21$         1,721.05$          354.00$          1,770.00$        

BLONDER TONGUE 1902
2 WAY SPLITTER L TYPE  
SCVS-2 50 EACH 1.45$             72.50$               1.27$              63.50$             

BLONDER TONGUE 1903
3 WAY SPLITTER L TYPE  
SCVS-3 25 EACH 2.37$             59.25$               2.06$              51.50$             

BLONDER TONGUE 1904
4 WAY SPLITTER L TYPE  
SCVS-4 25 EACH 2.66$             66.50$               2.33$              58.25$             

BLONDER TONGUE 1922
2 WAY SPLITTER I TYPE  
SXRS-2 25 EACH 1.45$             36.25$               1.27$              31.75$             

BLONDER TONGUE 1923
3 WAY SPLITTER I TYPE 
SXRS-3 25 EACH 2.37$             59.25$               2.06$              51.50$             

BLONDER TONGUE 1924
4 WAY SPLITTER I TYPE 
SXRS-4 25 EACH 2.66$             66.50$               2.33$              58.25$             

BLONDER TONGUE 3855
2 WAY SPLITTER 
OUTDOOR TSL 1000 10 EACH 41.72$           417.20$             36.50$            365.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE 3856
3 WAY SPLITTER 
OUTDOOR TSL 1000 10 EACH 39.78$           397.80$             36.50$            365.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE 7715
RACK CHASSIS - 12 
PORT  MIRC-12V 2 EACH 97.88$           195.76$             87.50$            175.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE 7722C
POWER SUPPLY   MIPS 
12C 2 EACH 121.70$         243.40$             109.00$          218.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE AM-60-860
MODULATOR, RACK 
MOUNT 2 EACH 870.82$         1,741.64$          809.00$          1,618.00$        

BLONDER TONGUE 1944(8-29db) TAPS   SRT-4A 100 EACH 2.76$             276.00$             2.90$              290.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE 3854 (11-23db)
TAPS OUT DOOR  DMT-
1000-4 40 EACH 17.40$           696.00$             16.15$            646.00$           
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION
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Toner Cable Equipment Inc.
969 Horsham Rd.

Horsham, PA  19044

Graybar
4010 W. Osborne Ave.

Tampa, FL  33614

BLONDER TONGUE 6439
TERMINATOR 75 OHM  
LTF-2150 100 EACH 4.20$             420.00$             3.85$              385.00$           

BLONDER TONGUE 3889 (4 30db) TAP, DFT    V-3889 100 EACH 5.59$             559.00$             5.15$              515.00$           
BLONDER TONGUE 1930  (4-30db) TAP, L  SCW 100 EACH 1.48$             148.00$             1.33$              133.00$           
BLONDER TONGUE 1940  (4-30db) TAP, L  SRT 100 EACH 1.28$             128.00$             1.32$              132.00$           
BLONDER TONGUE 1940  (8-29db) TAP, SRT-4A 100 EACH 2.76$             276.00$             * 2.90$              290.00$           
BROTHER DR350 DRUM 50 EACH 88.09$           4,404.50$          No bid No bid
BROTHER DR250 DRUM 30 EACH 150.71$         4,521.30$          No bid No bid
BROTHER 2820 INTELEFAX FAX MACHINE 30 EACH 192.72$         5,781.60$          No bid No bid
BROTHER TN350 TONER 525 EACH 48.12$           25,263.00$        No bid No bid
BROTHER TN250 TONER 200 EACH 26.71$           5,342.00$          No bid No bid
CHATSWORTH CH40074-100 19" SHELF 20 EACH 70.86$           1,417.20$          No bid No bid
CHATSWORTH CH10758-501 19" SHELF 50 EACH 60.50$           3,025.00$          No bid No bid
CHATSWORTH CHT13050712 THIN LINE CABINET 40 EACH 286.72$         11,468.80$        No bid No bid

CHATSWORTH CHT55053 OPEN EQUIPMENT RACK 10 EACH 106.79$         1,067.90$          No bid No bid
CORTELCO ITT 219200-VOE-27F SINGLE LINE PHONE 50 EACH 16.73$           836.50$             No bid No bid
CYBERPOWER PP1500SWT4 1500 TOWER UPS 15 EACH 379.73$         5,695.95$          No bid No bid
CYBERPOWER PR1500LCDRT2U 1500 RACK MOUNT UPS 30 EACH 482.59$         14,477.70$        No bid No bid
CYBERPOWER PR750LCDRM1U 750 RACK MOUNT UPS 30 EACH 321.52$         9,645.60$          No bid No bid
CYBERPOWER PR2200LDDRTXK2U 2200 RACK MOUNT UPS 6 EACH 725.00$         4,350.00$          * No bid No bid

CYBERPOWER BP48V75ART2U
EXT. BATTERY PACK 
FOR 2200 UPS 6 EACH 326.29$         1,957.74$          No bid No bid

DRAKA COMTEQ M-RO-DN-A-L-BK-AUP
CABLE, FIBER 6 CT I/O  
MM (1000') 10 1000' REEL 430.00$         4,300.00$          No bid No bid

ERICO 4BRT64 4" BRIDAL RING 800 EACH 1.35$             1,080.00$          No bid No bid
ERICO BC200 BEAM CLAMP 1000 EACH 0.91$             910.00$             No bid No bid

ERICO MP2
WALL INSERT ADAPT 
DBL 100 EACH 1.27$             127.00$             No bid No bid

ERICO MP1
WALL INSERT ADAPT 
SING 200 EACH 1.09$             218.00$             No bid No bid

GREENLEE 430G PULL STRING-BUCKET 25 EACH 24.24$           606.00$             No bid No bid

GREENLEE 84472
1 1/4" MASONARY 
SCREW 500 EACH 0.23$             115.00$             No bid No bid

IDEAL 92-650
RG6 COMPRESSION 
CONNECTOR 500 EACH 0.59$             295.00$             No bid No bid

IDEAL 92/660
RG6 PLENUM 
COMPRESSION CONN. 300 EACH 0.86$             258.00$             No bid No bid

IDEAL 89-211
RG11 COMPRESSION 
CONNECTOR 300 EACH 4.48$             1,344.00$          No bid No bid

ITW LINX MAX 3400 RACK MOUNT SURGE 50 EACH 84.21$           4,210.50$          No bid No bid
ITW LINX GNM1200 FAX MACHINE SURGE 30 EACH 28.47$           854.10$             * No bid No bid
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KENTROX 93030121
CABLE, KENTROX M-
RJ45- 30' 25 EACH 50.84$           1,271.00$          No bid No bid

KENTROX 01-77965023 CSU FOR NEC 2400 10 EACH 699.43$         6,994.30$          No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPMM-1M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
1M  MM 100 EACH 8.04$             804.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPMM-1M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 1M 
MM 50 EACH 8.04$             402.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSCDUPMM-1M
FIBER JUMPER SC-SC-
1M  MM 50 EACH 7.56$             378.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSTDUPMM-1M
FIBER JUMPER ST-SC 
1M  MM 100 EACH 7.56$             756.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS STSTDUPMM-1M
FIBER JUMPER ST-ST 1M 
MM 100 EACH 7.56$             756.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPMM-2M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
2M  MM 150 EACH 8.51$             1,276.50$          No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPMM-2M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 2M 
MM 50 EACH 8.51$             425.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSCDUPMM-2M
FIBER JUMPER SC-SC-
2M  MM 50 EACH 8.04$             402.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSTDUPMM-2M
FIBER JUMPER ST-SC 
2M  MM 100 EACH 8.04$             804.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS STSTDUPMM-2M
FIBER JUMPER ST-ST 2M 
MM 100 EACH 8.04$             804.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPMM-3M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
3M  MM 150 EACH 9.01$             1,351.50$          No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPMM-3M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 3M 
MM 50 EACH 9.01$             450.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSCDUPMM-3M
FIBER JUMPER SC-SC-
3M  MM 50 EACH 8.52$             426.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS SCSTDUPMM-3M
FIBER JUMPER ST-SC 
3M  MM 100 EACH 8.52$             852.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS STSTDUPMM-3M
FIBER JUMPER ST-ST 3M 
MM 50 EACH 8.52$             426.00$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPSM-1M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
1M SM 50 EACH 8.51$             425.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPSM-2M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
2M SM 50 EACH 8.81$             440.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSCDUPSM-3M
FIBER JUMPER LC-SC 
3M SM 50 EACH 9.11$             455.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCLCDUPSM-1M
FIBER JUMPER LC-LC 1M 
SM 50 EACH 8.75$             437.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCLCDUPSM-2M
FIBER JUMPER LC-LC 2M 
SM 50 EACH 9.05$             452.50$             No bid No bid
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LYNN ELECTRONICS LCLCDUPSM-3M
FIBER JUMPER LC-LC 3M 
SM 50 EACH 9.35$             467.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPSM-1M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 1M 
SM 50 EACH 8.51$             425.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPSM-2M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 2M 
SM 50 EACH 8.81$             440.50$             No bid No bid

LYNN ELECTRONICS LCSTDUPSM-3M
FIBER JUMPER LC-ST 3M 
SM 50 EACH 9.11$             455.50$             No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-OFPSTDO8MB 8 ST FIBER STRIP 30 EACH 24.54$           736.20$             No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-FCO1U-P FIBER TRAY 10 EACH 210.11$         2,101.10$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-625MMC-24 PG1RB
FIBER PATCH PANEL 24 
PORT SC SM 10 EACH 389.44$         3,894.40$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-625MMC-48 PG1B
FIBER PATCH PANEL 48 
PORT SC SM 10 EACH 708.30$         7,083.00$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-S22600
IMO SERIES II JACK CAT 
6 1500 EACH 11.53$           17,295.00$        No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-MC6010-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  10' 1000 EACH 7.48$             7,480.00$          * No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-MC6015-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  14' 600 EACH 9.16$             5,496.00$          * No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC602-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  2' 2600 EACH 4.83$             12,558.00$        No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-MC6025-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  25' 200 EACH 13.02$           2,604.00$          * No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC603-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  3' 3400 EACH 4.83$             16,422.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC604-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  4' 2300 EACH 5.60$             12,880.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC605-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  5' 1800 EACH 5.60$             10,080.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC606-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  6' 1700 EACH 6.45$             10,965.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC607-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  7' 300 EACH 6.45$             1,935.00$          No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-MC608-XX PATCH CABLE CAT 6  8' 1000 EACH 7.20$             7,200.00$          No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-PHD66U24 PATCH PANEL 24 PORT 100 EACH 130.79$         13,079.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-PHD68U48 PATCH PANEL 48 PORT  75 EACH 260.72$         19,554.00$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-PHD68U96 PATCH PANEL 96 PORT 25 EACH 543.63$         13,590.75$        No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-40300164 SERIES II BLANK 1000 EACH 0.29$             290.00$             No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-40300158 SERIES II FACE PLATE 750 EACH 1.38$             1,035.00$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-40300159
SERIES II FACE PLATE 
DBL 100 EACH 3.40$             340.00$             No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-60900324
SERIES II FIBER IMO ST 
MULTI-MODE 150 EACH 8.85$             1,327.50$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-60900322
SERIES II FIBER IMO SC 
SING-MODE 50 EACH 34.50$           1,725.00$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-40300185 SERIES II GANG BOX 750 EACH 2.79$             2,092.50$          No bid No bid

ORTRONICS OR-40300186  
SERIES II GANG BOX 
DBL 75 EACH 3.19$             239.25$             No bid No bid
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Toner Cable Equipment Inc.
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Horsham, PA  19044

Graybar
4010 W. Osborne Ave.

Tampa, FL  33614

ORTRONICS OR-6040057 WIRE MANAGER REG 50 EACH 42.00$           2,100.00$          No bid No bid
ORTRONICS OR-808044916 WIRE MANAGER SM 30 EACH 43.01$           1,290.30$          No bid No bid
PANAMAX M4KSU WALL MT. SURGE 50 EACH 35.17$           1,758.50$          No bid No bid
PANDUIT PLT-31-C0 12"CABLE TIE WRAPS 50 PER PKG/100 27.00$           1,350.00$          No bid No bid
PANDUIT T70BCIW-X 4" R/W COUPLER BASE 25 EACH 3.96$             99.00$               No bid No bid

PANDUIT T70CCIW-X 4" R/W COUPLER COVER 25 EACH 1.92$             48.00$               No bid No bid
PANDUIT T70ECIW 4" R/W END CAP 25 EACH 4.10$             102.50$             No bid No bid
PANDUIT T70ICIW 4" R/W INSIDE CORNER 25 EACH 10.05$           251.25$             No bid No bid

PANDUIT T70OCIW
4" R/W OUTSIDE 
CORNER 25 EACH 10.05$           251.25$             No bid No bid

PANDUIT T70RAIW 4" R/W RT ANGLE 25 EACH 15.23$           380.75$             No bid No bid
PANDUIT T70CIW8 8' 4" RACEWAY BASE 50 PER 8' STICK 23.04$           1,152.00$          No bid No bid
PANDUIT T70CIW8 8' 4" RACEWAY COVER 50 PER 8' STICK 12.72$           636.00$             No bid No bid

PANDUIT PLT2I-C0 
8" CABLE TIE WRAPS 
(100) 50 PER PKG/100 19.00$           950.00$             No bid No bid

PLANTRONICS H-51
HEADSET FOR SERIES II 
& III 10 EACH 46.37$           463.70$             * No bid No bid

PLANTRONICS M-12 HEADSET BASE 10 EACH 67.86$           678.60$             * No bid No bid

PLANTRONICS HW251N HEADSET FOR SERIES E 25 EACH 57.68$           1,442.00$          No bid No bid

PLANTRONICS 66268-02
HEADSET CORD FOR 
SERIES E 25 EACH 25.45$           636.25$             No bid No bid

PLYMOUTH 4472  PREMIUM 111 TAPE, GRAY 200 PER 66' ROLL 2.99$             598.00$             * No bid No bid
PORTA SYSTEMS 95BCDXN-230 230V MODULE 500 EACH 5.96$             2,980.00$          No bid No bid
PORTA SYSTEMS 95BCDXN-75V 75V MODULE 100 EACH 8.08$             808.00$             No bid No bid
PORTA SYSTEMS 55BCN CUT THRU MODULE 300 EACH 1.15$             345.00$             No bid No bid
PORTA SYSTEMS 581P-2 PROTECTION BLOCK 25 EACH 84.77$           2,119.25$          No bid No bid

PORTA SYSTEMS 504PX2    
PROTECTION BLOCK 
W/AC 25 EACH 29.63$           740.75$             No bid No bid

QUAZITE PG1730BA24 PULL BOX 50 EACH 234.24$         11,712.00$        No bid No bid
QUAZITE PG1730CA00 PULL BOX COVER 75 EACH 107.36$         8,052.00$          No bid No bid

QUAZITE PG1730HH0012
PULL BOX COVER - 
HEAVY DUTY 25 EACH 206.35$         5,158.75$          No bid No bid

SUPERIOR ESSEX DB-6P24-AL-89-ESS
CABLE, 6 PAIR DIRECT 
BURIAL(1000') 10 1000' REEL 310.00$         3,100.00$          No bid No bid

SUPERIOR ESSEX S-RO-6-DN-A-BK-ESS
CABLE, FIBER 6 CT I/O 
SM (1000') 10 1000' REEL   290.00$         2,900.00$          No bid No bid

THOMAS & BETTS TY528MX 14" CABLE TIE WRAP 75 PER PKG/100 33.00$           2,475.00$          No bid No bid

TRANSITION NET J/E-PSW-FX-02
TX-FX CONVERTER 100 
MB 50 EACH 166.26$         8,313.00$          * No bid No bid

VIEWSONICS VSMA-20-100 20 DB AMP 25 EACH 48.07$           1,201.75$          No bid No bid
VIEWSONICS VSMA-10-100 10 DB AMP 25 EACH 27.87$           696.75$             * No bid No bid
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WIREMOLD 2906-WH 1.5 R/W COUPLER 100 EACH 1.17$             117.00$             No bid No bid
WIREMOLD 2910B-WH 1.5 R/W END CAP 100 EACH 1.18$             118.00$             No bid No bid

WIREMOLD 2917-WH 1.5 R/W INSIDE CORNER 75 EACH 1.18$             88.50$               No bid No bid

WIREMOLD 2918-WH
1.5 R/W OUTSIDE 
CORNER 75 EACH 1.18$             88.50$               No bid No bid

WIREMOLD 2911-WH 1.5 R/W RT. ANGLE 75 EACH 1.18$             88.50$               No bid No bid
WIREMOLD 2986-WH 1.5 R/W STAND OFF 75 EACH 1.29$             96.75$               No bid No bid
WIREMOLD 2915-WH 1.5 R/W TEE'S 75 EACH 1.18$             88.50$               No bid No bid
WIREMOLD 2900-WH 1.5 RACEWAY 200 PER 6'  STICK 10.38$           2,076.00$          No bid No bid

WIREMOLD NME1250AP
MOUNTING BOX FOR 
A.P. 10 EACH 147.34$         1,473.40$          No bid No bid

TOTAL ALL OR NONE COST $482,818.55** $28,736.75**
*   Alternate part number proposed and accepted by Telecom Dept. 
** Vendor math error; does not impact award
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