

District School Board of Pasco County Bid Recommendation

Bid Title	Furniture Renovation for Pasco High School and Pasco Middle School & District "As Needed"	Number of Vendors Notified	342
Bid Number	12-001-DM	Number of Bids Distributed	69
Date Solicited	December 2, 2010	Number of Vendors Bidding	9
Date Opened	January 12, 2011	Number of Vendors Not Bidding	1
Date Board Presentation	March 1, 2011	Funding Source	Capital and General Funds
Total Savings	\$44,123.86	Grand Total of Bid	\$113,863.49

Recommendation:

Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheets for Furniture Renovation for Pasco High School, Pasco Middle School & District "As Needed".

Term of Contract:

The term for Part A, is a period of one (1) year from date of award. The term for Part B, manufacturer's discount off list price, is a period of one (1) year from date of award, with two (2) consecutive yearly renewals at the mutual consent of the parties.

Notations and Exceptions:

In Part A, each Award Group was awarded "all or none" for compatibility of products.

Award Group #1, Student furniture and activity tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from Schoolhouse Products as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #2, Pedestal tables: Recommend acceptance of bid from Contrax Furnishings LLC as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #3, File cabinets: Recommend acceptance of bid from Contrax Furnishings LLC as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #4, Administrative chairs: Recommend acceptance of bid from Ernie Morris Enterprises as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Award Group #5, Computer tables: Recommend rejection of low bid from Pride Enterprises. Alternate tables bid had wire management system located at the back of the table rather than top. This would make set-up, repairs and the moving of computers difficult. Recommend acceptance of bid from Virco Inc. as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications.

Notations and Exceptions:

Award Group #7, First aid lounger: Recommend rejection of sole bid from Contrax Furnishings LLC, bidding an alternate lounger. The detachable slant pillow has been a quality problem in the past; limited color selection is available. Requesting permission to purchase on the open market as needed.

Award Group #8, Administrative Furniture/Conference Table: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pride Enterprises as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications

Award Group #9, Secretarial Furniture: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pride Enterprises as lowest and best responsive, responsible bid meeting written specifications

Award Group 6, Metal Shelving is still under evaluation, and will be submitted to a future Board meeting.

Under Part B, on items where no active or valid bids were received, we will review bids from other counties, school districts, and Florida State Contract, to "piggyback" where it is in the best interest of the District to do so and forward recommendation to future Board Meeting. We are also requesting permission to negotiate with interested parties regarding other manufacturers listed in the bid document. Any such negotiations will be forwarded to subsequent Board meetings for consideration and approval.

The requirements of this bid are for the renovations of Pasco High School, Pasco Middle School and the District on an "As Needed." For all items, quantities listed may vary slightly, but unit prices will remain the same. Offers from other vendors listed herein are the only offers received per the specified opening date and time; all other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late.

Cost savings have been calculated as the difference between the highest bid and lowest bid received under Part A for each Award Group.

Bids Evaluated By:

Arlene Zimney, CPPB, C.P.M., Buyer
Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant

Bid Prepared By:

Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant

Reviewed and Authorized By:

Kendra Goodman, CPPO, CPPB, Purchasing Agent 

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for FHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		CBA		Contrax Furnishings		Ernie Morris		Keesey Co.	
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		36 Weatherby Drive		690 NE 23rd Avenue		Gainesville, FL 32609		P. O. Box 818		3085 Rio Bonita Street	
Under Evaluation		Greenville, SC 29615		Gainesville, FL 32609		Bushnell, FL 33513		Indalantic, FL 32903			
ITEM#	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
		Award Group #1									
PSF1C	1,125	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	0.00	0.00	21.65	24,356.25	Scholarcraft SC127	19.60	22,050.00	0.00	0.00
PSF2A	750	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB Student desk w/out bookbox	0.00	0.00	33.64	25,230.00	Royal Seating 1647	37.95	28,462.50	0.00	0.00
PSF4A	42	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120 Teacher chair with casters	0.00	0.00	72.07	3,026.94	Royal Seating 1141U 18X	38.65	1,623.30	0.00	0.00
PSF5A	39	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series Table 30" x 60"	0.00	0.00	81.69	3,185.91		139.75	5,450.25	0.00	0.00
PSF5C	4	Table 36" x 72"	0.00	0.00	92.11	*386.44		89.92	359.68	0.00	0.00
PSF5D	1	Table 24" x 48"	0.00	0.00	58.83	58.83	Allied Plastics FS00 / L2000BKX	55.52	55.52	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1	NO BID	0.00		55,226.37			58,001.05	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #2									
PSF5J	3	Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series Table 36" round pedestal base	0.00	0.00	86.99	260.97	Allied Plastics 5036CRCH	161.14	483.42	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2	NO BID	0.00		260.97			483.42	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #3									
PSF8A	73	Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	0.00	0.00	169.16	12,346.68		174.69	12,752.37	0.00	0.00
PSF8E	1	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	0.00	0.00	469.16	469.16	Global Industries (PSF8A) 26-401 (PSF8E) 9342P-4FH	536.97	536.97	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3	NO BID	0.00		12,817.84			13,289.34	NO BID	0.00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		Office Furniture Center		Pride Enterprises		Schoolhouse Products		Universal Seating Co		Virco		
TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, FMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd.		12425 - 28th St. North, Ste. 300		13517 Prestige Place, Ste. 101		3772 Kori Road		Highway 65 South		
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		Tampa, FL 33606		St. Petersburg, FL 33716		Tampa, FL 33635		Jacksonville, FL 32257		Conway, AR 72032		
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
		Award Group #1										
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120										
PSF1C	1,125	17 1/2" - 18" stack chair	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	19.10	21,487.50	0.00	0.00	19.59	22,035.75
		Manufacturer					Artco Bell				Virco	
		Model #					7107 or D10A				2,018.00	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 2700FB										
PSF2A	750	Student desk w/out bookbox	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	33.75	25,312.50	0.00	0.00	34.06	25,545.00
		Manufacturer					Artco Bell				Virco	
		Model #					9100.00				727LXB	
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 120										
		Manufacturer					Artco Bell				Virco	
		Model #					53.50	2,247.00	0.00	0.00	34.63	1,454.46
PSF4A	42	Teacher chair with casters	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	7167 or D16AP				9050P	
		Manufacturer										
		Model #										
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 9400 series										
		Manufacturer										
		Model #										
PSF5A	39	Table 30" x 60"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	66.00	2,574.00	0.00	0.00	69.16	2,697.24
PSF5C	4	Table 36" x 72"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	79.25	317.00	0.00	0.00	83.98	335.92
PSF5D	1	Table 24" x 48"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	55.00	55.00	0.00	0.00	52.00	52.00
		Manufacturer					Artco Bell				Virco	
		Model #					(PSF5A) 1230 - 1200 Series				(PSF5A) 483060	
		Model #					(PSF5C) 1260 - 1200 Series				(PSF5C) 483672	
		Model #					(PSF5D) 1210 - 1200 Series				(PSF5D) 482448	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #1	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00		51,993.00	NO BID	0.00		52,123.37
		Award Group #2										
		Manufacturer: spec Scholarcraft 4000 series										
PSF3A	3	Table 36" round pedestal base	164.00	492.00	192.80	578.40	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	120.62	361.86
		Manufacturer HON			PRIDE						Virco	
		Model # 1121 / RSP Base			44161D - Performance						UP6R/66433	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #2	492.00	492.00	578.40	578.40	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00		361.86
		Award Group #3										
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 310/894L										
PSF8A	73	File cabinet, vertical 4 drawer, letter	186.00	13,578.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	346.62	25,303.26
PSF8E	1	File cabinet, lateral 4 drawer 42" wide w/lock	573.00	573.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	494.33	494.33
		Manufacturer HON									Virco	
		Model # 314P									(PSF8A) 54VF154D	
		Model # 894L									(PSF8E) 53LF424D	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #3	14,151.00	14,151.00	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00		25,797.59

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, FMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		Keesey Co.		
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		**Under Evaluation**		3085 Rio Bonita Street Indianapolis, FL 32903		
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	CBA		Ernie Morris	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #4				
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 5721/5795				
PSF9A	2	Data posture chair with arms	0.00	0.00	108.38	216.76
PSF9B	15	Data posture chair without arms	0.00	0.00	83.74	1,256.10
		Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605				
PSF14A	1	Executive swivel chair	0.00	0.00	159.92	0.00
PSF14B	34	Guest chair	0.00	0.00	98.90	3,362.60
PSF14C	26	Mid-back chair	0.00	0.00	151.96	3,950.96
		Manufacturer			HON	
		Model #			5721	
		Model #			5721/5795	
		Model #			2071	
		Model #			4605	
		Model #			2072	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #5				
		Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series				
PSF17A	59	Computer table 24" x 60"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer				
		Model #				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #6				
		Manufacturer: spec Penco Open Clipper Series				
PSF11C	36	Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF11G	8	Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87"	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer				
		Model #				
		Model #				
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #7				
		Manufacturer: spec Lloyd / Barrington 800P Deluxe				
PSF12	2	First aid toungeer	0.00	0.00	269.86	539.72
		Manufacturer			Royal Seating	
		Model #			3722	
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #7	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	539.72
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #7	NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm			TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PES, PMS and District Office on "As Needed"			BD NUMBER 12-001-DM						
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	Office Furniture Center 2117 W. Kennedy Blvd. Tampa, FL 33606		Pride Enterprises 12425 - 28th St. North, Ste. 300 St. Petersburg, FL 33716		Schoolhouse Products 13517 Prestige Place, Ste. 101 Tampa, FL 33635		Universal Seating Co 3772 Kori Road Jacksonville, FL 32257		Virco Highway 65 South Conway, AR 72032	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #4										
PSF9A	2	1 Data posture chair with arms Manufacturer: spec Hon 5721/5795	119.00	238.00	195.20	390.40	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF9B	15	15 Data posture chair without arms Manufacturer: spec Hon 5721	93.00	1,395.00	172.40	2,586.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF14A	1	1 Executive swivel chair Manufacturer: spec HON 2071/2072/4605	170.00	170.00	311.60	311.60	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF14B	34	34 Guest chair	105.00	3,570.00	103.60	3,522.40	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF14C	26	26 Mid-back chair Manufacturer: HON Model # (PSF9A) 5721 - 5720 Series Model # (PSF9B) 5721/5795 - 5720 Series Model # (PSF14A) 2071 - 2070 Series Model # (PSF14B) 4605 - 4600 Series Model # (PSF14C) 2072 - 2070 Series	162.00	4,212.00	309.20	8,039.20	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #4		9,585.00		14,849.60		NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00	NO BID
		Award Group #5										
PSF17A	59	59 Computer table 24" x 60" Manufacturer: spec ABCO CFL series	0.00	0.00	140.00	8,260.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	180.43
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #5		NO BID		8,260.00		NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00	180.43
		Award Group #6										
PSF11C	36	36 Metal shelf 18" x 36" x 87" Manufacturer: spec Penco Open Clipper Series	0.00	0.00	162.70	5,857.20	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF11G	8	8 Metal shelf 24" x 48" x 87" Manufacturer: Model # (PSF11C) 10938 Model # (PSF11G) 10944	0.00	0.00	195.70	1,565.60	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #6		NO BID		7,422.80		NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00	NO BID
		Award Group #7										
PSF12	2	2 First aid lounge Manufacturer: spec Lloyd / Barrington 800P Deluxe Manufacturer: Model #	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #7		NO BID		0.00		NO BID	0.00	NO BID	0.00	NO BID

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm										
TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"										
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM										
Under Evaluation										
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	CBA	Contract Furnishings	Ernie Morris	Keesey Co.	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
			36 Weatherby Drive Greenville, SC 29615	690 NE 23rd Avenue Gainesville, FL 32609	P. O. Box 818 Rushnell, FL 33513	3085 Rio Bonita Street Indianalantic, FL 32903				
		Award Group #8								
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 10700 series								
PSF13A	1	Wood lam desk 72" x 36"	0.00	556.76	472.55	472.55	0.00	472.55	0.00	0.00
PSF13B	2	Wood lam DP desk 66" x 60"	0.00	513.82	450.95	901.90	0.00	901.90	0.00	0.00
PSF13C	1	Wood lam secretarial desk left return	0.00	750.12	619.58	619.58	0.00	619.58	0.00	0.00
PSF13D	3	Wood lam secretarial desk right return	0.00	750.12	619.58	1,858.74	0.00	1,858.74	0.00	0.00
PSF13E	2	Wood lam storage credenza	0.00	762.46	476.34	952.68	0.00	952.68	0.00	0.00
PSF13F	4	Wood lam knee space credenza	0.00	513.82	424.80	1,699.20	0.00	1,699.20	0.00	0.00
PSF13I	2	Wood lam end table	0.00	115.60	118.99	237.98	0.00	237.98	0.00	0.00
PSF13K	2	Wood lam lateral file cabinet	0.00	331.92	331.96	663.92	0.00	663.92	0.00	0.00
PSF13O	16	Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf	0.00	263.92	294.06	4,704.96	0.00	4,704.96	0.00	0.00
PSF15B	2	Conference table 4' x 12'	0.00	776.48	567.66	1,135.32	0.00	1,135.32	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer			HON					
		Model #			(PSF13A) MLL D3672DFMGLR	80192, LA48144F/BLCP01 - 10700 Series on all items				
		Model #			(PSF13B) MLL D3066DFMGLR	PSF13A - PSF15B				
		Model #			(PSF13C) MLL 3066DFMGLR/D2448L29FM					
		Model #			(PSF13D) MLL 2448R29DFM/D3066DFMGLR					
		Model #			(PSF13E) MLL D2472DFMSPEC					
		Model #			(PSF13F) MLL D2472DFM					
		Model #			(PSF13I) MLL 2424T20					
		Model #			(PSF13K) MLL CL20362					
		Model #			(PSF13O) MLL BBL123672					
		Model #			(PSF15B) MLL 3468144B7H					
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8	NO BID	14,835.80		**Vendor did not complete - does not impact award		*13,246.83	NO BID	0.00
		Award Group #9								
		Manufacturer: PRIDE Enterprises / Premier Series								
PSF16B	38	Single pedestal desk 30" x 48"	0.00	510.86	19,412.68	19,412.68	0.00	19,412.68	0.00	0.00
PSF16C	5	Secretarial desk right return	0.00	721.22	3,606.10	3,606.10	0.00	3,606.10	0.00	0.00
PSF16D	2	Secretarial desk left return	0.00	721.22	1,442.44	1,442.44	0.00	1,442.44	0.00	0.00
PSF16E	42	Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12"	0.00	209.96	8,818.32	8,818.32	0.00	8,818.32	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer			Logiflex					
		Model #			(PSF16B) MLL 3048DSMSPEC					
		Model #			(PSF16C) D3060DSMSPEC/2040R29FM					
		Model #			(PSF16D) MLL 3060DSMSPEC/2040L29FM					
		Model #			(PSF16E) MLL BBL123660					
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9	NO BID	33,279.54					NO BID	0.00

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		Office Furniture Center		Pride Enterprises		Schoolhouse Products		Universal Sealing Co		Vitco		
TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd.		12425 - 28th St. North, Ste. 300		13517 Prestige Place, Ste. 101		3772 Kori Road		Highway 65 South		
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		Tampa, FL 33606		St. Petersburg, FL 33716		Tampa, FL 33665		Jacksonville, FL 32257		Conway, AR 72032		
Under Evaluation												
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Award Group #8										
		Manufacturer: spec Hon 10700 series										
PSF13A	1	Wood lam desk 72" x 36"	505.00	505.00	390.91	390.91	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13B	2	Wood lam DP desk 66" x 60"	481.00	962.00	328.91	657.82	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13C	1	Wood lam secretarial desk left return	661.00	661.00	447.56	447.56	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13D	3	Wood lam secretarial desk right return	661.00	1,983.00	447.56	1,342.68	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13E	2	Wood lam storage credenza	509.00	1,018.00	465.82	931.64	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13F	4	Wood lam knee space credenza	454.00	1,816.00	354.68	1,418.72	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13I	2	Wood lam end table	127.00	254.00	90.63	181.26	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13K	2	Wood lam lateral file cabinet	354.00	708.00	244.80	489.60	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF13O	16	Wood lam bookcase 5 shelf	314.00	5,024.00	197.16	3,154.56	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF15B	2	Conference table 4' x 12'	606.00	1,212.00	606.56	1,213.12	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer: HON										
		Model # (PSF13A) 10791										
		Model # (PSF13B) 10775										
		Model # (PSF13C) 10783R / 10716L (24 X 48)										
		Model # (PSF13D) 10784L / 10715R (24 X 48)										
		Model # (PSF13E) 10744										
		Model # (PSF13F) 10743										
		Model # (PSF13I) 80192										
		Model # (PSF13K) 10762										
		Model # (PSF13O) 10755										
		Model # (PSF15B) LB48144F / BLCP01 - 10700 Series										
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #8		14,143.00		10,227.87						
		Award Group #9										
		Manufacturer: PRIDE Enterprises / Premier Series										
PSF16B	38	Single pedestal desk 30" x 48"	0.00	0.00	260.07	9,882.66	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF16C	5	Secretarial desk right return	0.00	0.00	485.60	2,428.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF16D	2	Secretarial desk left return	0.00	0.00	485.60	971.20	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
PSF16E	42	Bookcase 60" x 36" x 12"	0.00	0.00	170.55	7,165.10	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
		Manufacturer										
		Model # (PSF16B) 4SFO09017										
		Model # (PSF16C) 4SFO09018/19										
		Model # (PSF16D) 4SFO09018/19										
		Model # (PSF16E) 4SFO09022										
		TOTAL FOR AWARD GROUP #9		0.00		20,444.96						

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		CBA		Contract Furnishings		Ernie Morris		Keesey Co.	
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		**Under Evaluation**		36 Weatherly Drive Greenville, SC 29615		690 NE 23rd Avenue Gainesville, FL 32609		P. O. Box 818 Bushnell, FL 33513		3085 Rio Bonita Street Indianapolis, FL 32903	
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		ABCO									
		Allied Plastics				54%				56.2%	
		Allsteel									20% - 30%
		Arntab									
		Arco Eall Corporation									
		B & B Library Shelving									
		Balt.				47%					
		Best Rate (formerly Elite)				47%					
		Blockhouse									
		Boroughs								50.1%	
		Bretford Manufacturing									
		Bush									
		Clarn									
		Community								35.3%	
		Evolve Systems									
		Fire King								47.1%	
		Fleetwood									
		Georgt Chair				28%					
		Global Furniture Company									
		Hale								53.8%	
		Hallowell									
		Hon Company								60.1%	
		Iceberg								32.1%	
		Indiana Desk									
		Interior Concepts								52%	
		Inwood									
		KI								45%	
		Kimball									
		K-Log									
		Knoll									
		Lloyd Barrington									
		Luxor Specialty Furniture									
		Lyons Metal Products									
		Midwest Folding Products									
		Mitchell Tables								45.2%	
		National Public Seating				42%				45.2%	
		Oklahoma Sound								45.2%	
		Palmer									
		Palmieri Library Furniture									
		Pool formerly Whitehall				32%					
		Paragon								46%	
		Perco									
		Peppo									
		PRIDE									
		Revolution Products				45%					
		Royal Seating									
		Rubbermaid								35.3%	

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		Office Furniture Center		Pride Enterprises		Schoolhouse Products		Universal Seating Co		Vico	
TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PBS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd. Tampa, FL 33606		12425 - 28th St. North, Ste. 300 St. Petersburg, FL 33716		13517 Prestige Place, Ste. 101 Tampa, FL 33635		3772 Kori Road Jacksonville, FL 32257		Highway 65 South Conway, AR 72032	
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM	**Under Evaluation**	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION									
		ABCO									
		Allied Plastics									
		Allied									
		Amiab									
		Artco Bell Corporation					52%				
		B & B Library Shelving									
		Balt					45%				
		Best Rate (formerly Elite)					45%				
		Blockhouse									
		Borroughs									
		Bretford Manufacturing					57%				
		Bush									
		Clarin									
		Community									
		Evolve Systems									
		Fire King									
		Fleerwood									
		Georgia Chair					40%				
		Global Furniture Company					53%				
		Hale									
		Hallowell									
		Iron Company					58.5%				
		Iceberg									
		Indiana Desk					58.5%				
		Interior Concepts									
		Inwood									
		KI									
		Kimball									
		K-Log									
		Krell									
		Lloyd Barrington									
		Luxor Specialty Furniture									
		Lyons Metal Products									
		Midwest Folding Products									
		Mitchell Tables					38%				
		National Public Seating									
		Oklahoma Sound									
		Palmer					46%				
		Palmeri Library Furniture					46%				
		Paoli formerly Whitehall									25%
		Paragon									
		Penco									
		Pepeco									
		PRIDE					58%				
		Revolution Products									
		Royal Seating									
		Rubbermaid									

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		Keesey Co. 3085 Rio Bonita Street Indalantic, FL 32903		
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		**Under Evaluation**		Emile Morris P. O. Box 818 Bushnell, FL 33513		
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	CBA 36 Weatherby Drive Greenville, SC 29615		Contrax Furnishings 690 NE 23rd Avenue Gainesville, FL 32609	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
		Safco		35%		45.3%
		Sandusky Lee		54%		47.3%
		Scholarcraft				45.2%
		Screenflex		10%		
		Shain Shop-Built		4%		
		Shellie Desk				48%
		SICO America, Inc.		42%		
		Smith System		56.5%		
		Southern Aluminum				
		Spectrum Furniture				
		Tennsco				43.1%
		United Chair				
		Virco Manufacturing				
		Waddell				
		Walker, McGuire				
		Wenger				
		Worden				

DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 12, 2011 @ 1:30 pm		TITLE: Furniture for Renovations for PHS, PMS and District Office on an "As Needed"		Office Furniture Center		Pride Enterprises		Schoolhouse Products		Universal Seating Co		Virco	
BID NUMBER 12-001-DM		**Under Evaluation**		2117 W. Kennedy Blvd. Tampa, FL 33606		12425 - 28th St. North, Ste. 300 St. Petersburg, FL 33716		13517 Prestige Place, Ste. 101 Tampa, FL 33635		3772 Kori Road Jacksonville, FL 32257		Highway 65 South Conway, AR 72032	
ITEM#	QTY.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	
		Safco											
		Sandusky Lee											
		Scholarcraft											
		Screenflex											
		Shain Shop-Built						40%					
		Shelle Desk											
		SICO America, Inc.											
		Smith System						46%					
		Southern Aluminum											
		Spectrum Furniture											
		Tennisco											
		United Chair											
		Virco Manufacturing						53%					
		Waddell										61%	
		Walker, McGuire											
		Wenger											
		Worden											