District School Board of Pasco County

Bid Recommendation
Bid Title Classroom Retrofit Number of Vendors 397
Supplies Notified
Bid Number 13-066-DM Number of Proposals 48
Distributed
Date December 3, 2012 Number of Vendors 10
Solicited Proposing

Bid” Responses

Date Opened January 25, 2013 l Number of Formal “No 0

Date Board February 19, 2013 Funding Source General

Presentation Funding

Total Savings $52,024.70 Grand Total of Proposal Estimated
$200,000.00

Recommendation: Recommend acceptance of bids as noted on the attached tabulation sheet as
lowest and best, responsive and responsible bids meeting written specifications. ltems are
awarded based on the 11-50 quantity bid price and by the averaging of grouped items using the
11-50 quantity as indicated in the bid document.

Term of Contract: The term of this bid is a period of one (1) year from March 6, 2013 through
March 5, 2014.

Notations and Exceptions:

Recommend rejection of bid from Classroom Technology Solutions for failure to return complete
bid document.

SJO-010: Recommend acceptance of bid from Pro Sound, Inc. as the lowest and best,
responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. Recommend rejection of lower
bids from Audio Visual Innovations and Troxell Communications, Inc. failure to meet
specifications.

SJO-058: Recommend acceptance of bid from Howard Technology Solutions as the lowest and
best, responsive and responsible bid meeting written specifications. Recommend rejection of
lower bid from Troxell Communications, Inc. for failure to meet specifications, (i.e. not Plenum
rated).

Date/Time: February 13, 2013 08:37:00
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Notations and Exceptiens: -

Ofters from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the specified
| opening date and time. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are
[ hereby rejected as late.
- Savings were determined by the averaging of all bids submitted and deducting the recommended
- awarded vendors.

Bl(is Evaluated By:

\ Don Torge Electromes Crew Chlef Malntenance Department

BldS Prenared BV o - - -

Deb Mateo, Buyer Assistant, Purchasmg Department

t Reviewed and Authorized By:

74 4
! Michael J. Woodall, CPPO, Purchasing Agent ’LW ‘, L (,LL—-/// k
b AT : i R il b P E SR 5 15 =T SR Tt it et L




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

Camcar, Inc.

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

420 Ninth Avenue

2273 S. Church St., PO Box 1899

BID #13-066-DM

Tampa, FL 33634

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

New York, NY 10001

Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM # DESCRIPTION R = == S et
Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware: o o
Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: - 1 B
SJO 001 Peerless model CMJ 500RI or equal B
Manufacturer . ~Chief As Specified Peerless ]
Model - ** CMS 440 As Specified ~ CMJ 500RI ]
Deliver Date (aro) 15 7-14 3-30
Each: 1-10 $57.38 o $55.95 $58.49
Each: 11-50 $57.38 $55.95 - $57.29
Each: 50-100 B $57.38 $55.95 $56.94
P Each: 101+ $57.38 5 $55.95 - $55.91
Universal -LCD Projector Celing Mount: Peerless mod; - a
S$J0O 002 PRG UNY or equal B L o
- Manufacturer **Chief ) - As Specified Peerless
Model **RPA-U As Specified o PRG UNV B
Deliver Date (aro). i - 15 ) - 7-14 3-30
~ Each: 1-10 S - $97.49 - $93.35 $102.08
Each: 11-50 $97.49 $93.35 $99.98
|Each: 50-100 - $97.48 $93.35 $99.37
Each: 101+ ) o $97.49 $93.35 o $97.56
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector - o
SJO 007 Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal - N o
Manufacturer o Chief Chief Chief N
Model CMS012 CMS012 ~ CMS012 _
Deliver Date (aro) R 15 7-14 3-30 ]
Each: 1-10 - $18.97 B $22.10 $20.23
| Each: 11-50 ) $18.97 82210 %1984 0000000
Each: 50-100 - %1897 $22.10 $19.83
- Each: 101+ - ) ~ §18.97 B $22.10 $19.83
~SJ0 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price N | )
|Using the Each Price 11-50 $57.95 $57.13 $59.04




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

~ CCS Presentation Systems

BID TITLE:

. Classrcom Retrofit Supplies

5530 Florida Mining Blvd.

BID #13-066-DM

Jacksonville, FL 32256

__Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

4908 Victor Street

3101 Maltby Drive

Jacksonville, FL 32207

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Deltona, FL 32738

ITEM # DESCRIPTION - B N
Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware: - - ) o
o Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: B
SJO 001 Peerless model CMJ 500RI or equal _ ) No Bid
Manufacturer Peerless “AVM-Pro -
B Model o CMJ 500RI 2x2 Plate B
l Deliver Date (aro) o 15 5 B
Each: 1-10 §62.67 $45.00 B
L Each: 11-50 - $62.67 $45.00
Each; 50-100 $62.67 i ) $4500 )
|Each: 101+ - $62.67 $45.00 -
Universal LCD Projector Celing Mount: Peerless model
1SJO 002 PRG UNV or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Peerless “*AVM-Pro -
- Model PRG UNV UNV-101-XX
Deliver Date (aro) 15 5 -
Each: 1-10 $92.17 ~ $45.00 B - B -
Each: 11-50 $92.17 $45.00
Each: 50-100 $92.17 $45.00 .
~ |Each: 101+ $92.17 _ $45.00 |
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector -
$JO 007 | Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal - No Bid
Manufacturer Chief **AVM-Pro
| Model B CMS012 B EXT-5012-XX
Deliver Date (aro) - [ 15 - 5 B
[Bach: 1-10 $14.74 $12.00
|Each: 11-50 $14.74 $12.00 | B
Each; 50-100 $14.74 _ $1200 -
Each: 101+ $14.74 $12.00 -
SJO 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price
Using the Efichfﬂce 11-50 $56.53 $34.00 $0.00




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Howard Technology Solutions

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Jersey Jim Towers

PO Box 1590

BID #13-066-DM

Laurel, MS 39441

17722 U.S. Highway 19 North

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Clearwater, FL 33764

ITEM # ~ DESCRIPTION - -
~ |Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware: B B
Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: i
$J0O 001 Peerless model CM.J S00RI or equal No Bid
Manufacturer o Peerless o
Model B - N CMJ 500RI .
Deliver Date (aro) 014
Each: 1-10 B No Provided N
Each: 11-50 $61.00 -
\Each: 50-100 Not Provided _
Each: 101+ Not Provided
- Universal LCD Projector Celing Mount: Peerless model - -
SJO 002 PRG UNY or equal N No Bid B
Manufacturer | Peerless .
Modeloo o PRG UNV
_|Deliver Date (aro) - 1014 ) B
- Each: 1-10 B Not Provided - o
Each: 11-50 B $113.00 |
Each: 50-100 - - Not Provided
Each: 101+ Not Provided
12" Column Extension for Universal LCD Projector o o B
§J0 007 Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal B - No Bid o
Manufacturer - 3 Chief - _
Model ) CMs012 B B
| Deliver Date (aro) - B 10-14 )
‘Each: 1-10 ) Not Provided _
\Each: 11-50 . I $20.00 - —
'EBach: 50-100 Not Provided B B o
Each: 101+ B Not Provided
SJ0 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price o
Using the Each Price 11-50 $64.67 $0.00




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Pro Sound, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies
BID #13-066-DM

1375 NE 123 Street

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Miami, FL 33161

Troxell Communictions, Inc.

1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148

Brandon, FL 33511

ITEM # DESCRIPTION -
Multimedia Projector Celing Mounting Hardware: -
) Suspended Celing Plate for LCD Universal Mount: o - B
SJO 001 | Peerless model CMJ S00RI or equal
B JManufacturer S Peerless Peerless

‘Model CMJ 500RI CMJ 500R|
Deliver Date (aro) - 14-21 7-21
\Each: 1-10 o $99.00 $52.00
Each: 11-50 $77.00 $48.80
|Each: 50-100 $77.00 $48.80
Each: 101+ P ~ §77.00 $48.80
Universal LCf) i’rT)jector Celing Mount: Peerless model

SJO 002 PRG UNYV or equal B

| o ‘Manufacturer B B - Peerless Peerless
Model PRG UNV PRG UNV
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
[Each:1-10 $138.00 $74.00

- |Each: 11-50 | 812000 $71.80
Each; 50-100 $129.00 $71.80
|Each: 101+  %129.00 $71.80

T 112" Column Extension for Universal LCD P.mjectT)r-_ F -

SJO 007 | Ceiling Mount: Chief model CMA 012 or equal -
Manufacturer **Peerless Chief
Model EXT101 CMS012
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $29.00 $18.00
Each: 11-50 $25.00 $16.45
Each; 50-100 $25.00 $16.45
BEach; 101+ $25.00 $16.45
SJ0O 001, SJO 002 & SJO 007: Average Total Price
Using the Each Price 11-50 $77.00 $45.68




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

‘Camcaor, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

420 Ninth Avenue

2273 S. Church St., PO Box 1899

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Tampa, FL 33634

New York, NY 10001

Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
SJO 010 -Amfjliﬁer: Paso DMA 2015 or equal o - - " No Bid
| Manufacturer B Paso / **Audio Enhancements **Toa
|Model DMA2015 / **CA-25 **BG-2035 CU -
\Deliver Date {aro) - 15 - 7-14
|Each: 1-10 $169.00 / **$150.00 $238.00 - B
|Each: 11-50 B $169.00 /*$150.00 $239.00
L |Each: 50-100 $169.00 / **$150.00 $23¢00 - B
[Bach: 101+ ) $169.00 / **$150.00 ] $239.00
| CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT
SJO 015 Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal T )
Manufacturer B Atlast Sound Atlast Sound Atlast Sound
 |Model GDBTW B GD&7TW ] ~ GD8TW -
_ | Deliver Date (aro) 15 714 o 1 3-30
Each: 1-10 $34.49 $33.00 $35.76
Lach: 11-50 o $28.38 $33.00 $29.22
Each: 50-100 ] $28.38 3 $33.00 $28.20
) _ |Each: 101+ $28.38 - $33.00 - | $27.18 B
Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: Atlas Sound model 81-8R or
SJO 016 equal -
Manufacturer - - Atlas Sound L Atlas Sound _ Adlas Sound
[ Model 81-8R 81-8R 81-8R
Deliver Date (aro) 15 7-14 - 3-30
Each: 1-10 $6.65 $6.00 $13.27
[Bach: 1150 - $6.65 e $6.00 — $8.64
Each: 50-100 - $6.65 %600 ] . $8.09
Each: 101+ $6.65 $6.00 $7.54
B Speaker "backcan" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound
SJO 017 model 95-8 or equal .
Manufacturer Atlas Sound Atlas Sound Atlas Sound
Model 95-8 95-8 958 -
o |Deliver Date (aro) - 15 - 714 - B 330
Each: 1-10 $12.93 $19.00 $19.72
[Bach: 11-50 - $12.93 ) $19.00 $13.65
[n— Each: 50-100 $12.93 $19.00 $13.26
Each: [01+ - $12.93 T $1900 1 $12.74
[ S5J0 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price S -
Using the Each Price 11-50 $15.99 $19.33 $17.17




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies
BID #13-066-DM

CCS Presentation Systems

Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

5530 Florida Mining Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32256

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

4908 Victor Street

3101 Maltby Drive

‘Jacksonville, FL 32207

Deltona, FL 32738

Computer Station of Orlando, Inc.

ITEM # DESCRIPTION
sJO 010 [Amplifier: Paso DMA 2015 or equal a o No Bid
Manufacturer Paso ) _ *"Pyle
Model = 0 DMA 2015 “PCMBOA
Deliver Date (arc) 15 . 15
B |Each: 1-10 - _$197.80 $139.00 -
Each: 11-50 $197.80 $128.00 B
~ |Each: 50-100 - $152.75 $126.00 -
Each: 101+ $152.75 $125.00
CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT B . B B ]
5JO 015 Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Atlast Sound | **Quam .
Model B GD87W “*8C10EFCOM70/MWS
Deliver Date (aro) o 15 15 S
Each: 1-10 $33.19 - $36.00 -
_|Each: 11-50 $33.19 $34.00
Each: 50-100 - $32.89 - $32.00
Each: 101+ B | $32.89 $30.00 -
Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: Atlas Sound model 81-8R or - N
SJO 016 equal No Bid
Manufacturer Atlas Sound ~ **Quam 0
- Model - - 81-8R **55B-2
Deliver Date (aro) 10 15 o
T |Each: 1-10 $7.57 il $7.00
[Each: 11-50 $7.57 $7.00 l
[Each; 50-100 B  $7.57 $7.00 -
~ |Each: 101+ - = %757 $7.00 B
e "Speaker "backean" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound -
SJ0 017 \model 95-8 or equal - No Bid
~ |Manufacturer Aflas Sound **Quam
-, N;Model_ ) - N 9543 . *ERDS8U - o
Deliver Date (aro) B 10 15 N
Each: 1-10 ] $14.56 ~ 58.00 -
Each: 11-50 $14.56 $8.00
[ |Each: 50-100 $14.56 $8.00 -
i Each: 101+ N $14.66 $8.00 )
SJ0 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price S N o T
|Using the Each Price 11-50 $18.44 $16.33 NO Bid




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

[DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 230 P.M. | Howard Technology Solutions | Jersey Jim Towers
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies B I PO Box 1590 [ 17722 U.8. Highway 19 North
BID #13-066-DM o  lLaurel, MS 38441 B Clearwater, FL 33764 -
Board Meeting - 21M9/13
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION B ]
SJO 010 | Amplifier: Paso DMA 2015 or equal
o Manufacturer -  Paso Paso
Model - DMA 2015 ) DMA 2015
Deliver Date (aro) - - 10-14 | ) 2weeks
Each: [-10 - Not Provided 1 $186.00
" Each: 11-50 ] $186.00 _ Not Provided
Each: 50-100 Not Provided Not Provided
Bach: 101+ Not Provided ' NotProvided

CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT

mﬁ;_ Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal B
Manufacturer R Aflas - Not Provided
Model GDBTW Not Provided
Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 Not Provided

| |Each: 1-10 - Not Provided . $34.10
Each: 11-50 o $31.00 ) _ Not Provided
Each: 50-100 - Not Provided _Not Provided
Each: 101+ Not Provided ) Not Provided

S'peakcFEciling-TI‘_il_e Bridch Atlas Sound model 81-8Ror |
SJO 016 equal

Manufacturer Atlas ) Not Provided
Model 81-8R Not Provided
B Deliver Date (aro) Not Provided -~ _ Not Provided
Each: 1-10 Not Provided ~$8e0
- Each: 11-50 - $8.00 ] _ NotProvided
Each: 50-100 Not Provided Not Provided
_|Each: 101+ ) - Not Provided Not Provided

Speaker "backean" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound
SJO 017 model 95-8 orequal

o Manufacturer o Atlas Not Provided
Model 95-8 - Not Provided
Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 B - Not Provided
Each: 1-10 - - Not Provided ) $16.10
Each: 11-50 - $15.00 Not Provided
Each: 50-100 Not Provided ) Not Provided
Each: 101+ ) ~ NotProvided ) Not Provided

SJO 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price :
Using the Each Price 11-50 $18.00 $19.70




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Pro Sound, Inc.

Troxell Communictions, Inc.

BID TITLE:
BID #13-066-DM

Classroom Retrofit Supplies

1375 NE 123 Street

1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148

Board Meeting - E"I 97’?3 o

Miami, FL 33161

Brandon, FL 33511

ITEM # DESCRIPTION B S
SJO 010 Amplifier: Paso DMA 2015 or equal
Manufacturer o B Paso **Atlas
Model DMA 2015 ~ *™AA3S
_______ | Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $177.00 $161.80
Each: 11-50 $167.00 $156.00
Each: 50-100 $167.00 $156.00
Each: 101+ $167.00 $156.00
CLASSROOM SOUND EQUIPMENT
SJO 015 Speakers: Atlas Sound model GD87W or equal ) ) - R
L _|Manufacturer Atlas Atlas
Model e GDBTW GDETW
Deliver Date (aro) o 14-21 721
Each: 1-10 $39.50 $39.50 -
Fach: 11-50 $33.50 $28.15
Each: 50-100 $33.50 $28.15
Each: 101+ $32.00 ~§2815 B
Speaker Ceiling Tile Bridge: Atlas Sound model 81-8R or i
5J0O 016 equal ) S
T Manufacturer Atlas  Atlas
Model ) - i 81-8R 81-8R
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 72
|Each: 1-10 $15.50 $8.48
|Each: 1150 ] - $10.50 $7.90
| [Fach: 50-100 B B $10.50 ~§7.90 ]
Each: 101+ 5950 - §7e0
Speaker "backean" Protective Enclosure: Atlas Sound R o
SJO 017 ‘model 95-8 or equal
Manufacturer Atlas Atlas
Model 95-8 95-8
Deliver Date (aro) - 14-21 7-21 -
Each: [-10 $21.00 $14.53
Each: 11-50 $16.50 $13.90
Each: 50-100 $1650 $13.90
— [Each: 101+ B $14.50 $13.90 ~ T
SJO 015, SJO 016 & SJO 017: Average Total Price o N -
Using the Each Price 11-50 $20.17 $16.65




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

B & H Photo Video

Camocor, Inc.

Tampa, FL 33634

420 Ninth Avenue

2273 S. Church St, PO Box 1899

New York, NY 10001

Board Meeting - 2119/13

Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

SJ0O 020

40300185 or equal

| Manufacturer
| Model

Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics  OR

No Bid

No Bid

| Deliver Date (aro)

Each; 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each; 101+

SJO 021

Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics
OR-40300186 or equal

No Bid

| Manufacturer

No Bid

Model

| Deliver Date (aro)

|Bach:1-10
|Each: 11-50

|Each: 50-100

_ |Each: 101+

SJO 023

Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series TT
OR-40300011 or equal

No Bid

Manufacturer

Model
Deliver Date (aro)

FEach: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJ0O 024

Faceplate for Double Gang Qutlet Box: Ortronics Series IT
Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal

No Bid

Manufacturer

No Bid

No Bid

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

~ |Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

CCS Presentation Systems

5530 Florida Mining Blvd.

Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

4909 Victor Street

Computer Station of Crlando, Inc.

3101 Maltby Drive

Jacksonville, FL 32256

_Jacksonville, FL 32207

Deltona, FL 32738

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

ITEM # DESCRIPTION o - o -
| Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics  ORf
SJO 020 40300185 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer B - Ortronics As Specified A
Model 7 OR-40300185 As Specified -
Deliver Date (aro) 10 15
Each: 1-10 B $3.29 o %495 - B
'Each: 11-50 $3.29 %485 - B
Each: 50-100 $3.29 3475 -
| | Each: 101+ B $3.29 $4.65 -
Double Gang Surface Mount Qutlet Box: Ortronics | o
SJO 021 OR-40300186 or equal B - S ) - No Bid
Manufacturer Ortronics B As Specified
Model ) OR-40300186 B As Specified i
- Deliver Date {aro) 10 15 o
) Each: 1-10 $3.78 $5.75 - -
Each: 11-50 B $3.78 $5.45
Bach: 50-100 $3.78 $5.35
Each: 101+ $3.78  $5.25
Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series 11
SJO 023 OR-40300011 or equal No Bid
| Manufacturer B Ortronics As Specified - )
~ Model - OR-40300011 As Specified B — |
[Deliver Date (aro) - 10 15
_|Each: 1-10 - ) $2.11 P 8350
B |Each: 11-50 N $2.11 $3.15 - B _
Each: 50-100 - - $2.11 $3.10 e e o]
|Each: 101+ 777777 $2.11 $3.00 ]
Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series II o
SJO 024 Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal o No Bid
Manufacturer Ortronics _ As Specified
o Model ) OR-40300175 _As Specified
_|Deliver Date (aro) - 10 L B
Each: 1-10 ) $5.59 $8.75 ~
Each: 11-50 B $5.59 $8.50
Each: 50-100 . i $5.59 $8.25 }
 |Each: 101+ $5.59 $8.00

10




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

_ Howard Technology Solutions

Jersey Jim Towers

_PO Box 1590
Laurel, MS 39441

17722 U.S. Highway 19 North

Board Meeting - 2/19/M13

Clearwater, FL 33764

ITEM # DESCRIPTION B
|Single Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics  OR; - o
SJ0O 020 40300185 or equal
Manufacturer - o Ortronics Not Provided ]
~ Model 40300185 - Not Provided
- | Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 Not Provided
- _ |Each: 1-10 Not Provided $4.25
B ~_|Each: 11-50 $9.00 Not Provided
B \Each: 50-100 Not Provided Not Provided
\Each: 101+ B Not Provided - Not Provided
Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics )
5JO 021 OR-40300186 or equal
| |Manufacturer Ortronics Not Provided
~ Model B 40300186 Not Provided
\Deliver Date (aro) B 10-14 o Not Provided
Each: 1-10 B Not Provided $4.60
|Each: 11-50 B - $13.00 ~ Not Provided S
Each: 50-100 1l Not Provided ~ Not Provided .
| Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided
- 'Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series T
$JO 023 OR-40300011 or equal - -
Manufacturer Ortronics Not Provided
Model 40300011 Not Provided B
- | Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 ~ Not Provided
Each:1-10 - Not Provided $2.98 o
Each: 11-50 $6.00 Not Provided
Each: 50-100 B Not Provided _ Not Provided |
B _|Bach: 101+ o Not Provided Not Provided
R Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series 11 o
$J0 024  |Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal No Bid
. Manufacturer Ortronics
- Model 40300175
Deliver Date (aro) B 1014 e
~ [Bach:l-10 Mot Provided ]
~ |Each: 11-50 $16.00
Each- 50-100 | NotProvided i N -
Each: 101+ ~ Not Provided

11



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M. - B Pro Sound, Inc. ) Troxell Communictions, Inc.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies | 1376 NE123 Street . 1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148
BID #13-066-DM - ~ Miami, FL 33161 - Brandon, FL 33511
Board Meeting - 2/19/M13
ITEM # DESCRIPTION -
Single Gang Surface Mount Qutlet Box: Ortronics OR; i
SJ0O 020 40300185 or equal
Manufacturer o ) __ Ortronics ) o Ortronics
- |Model o 40300185 o 40300185
Deliver Date (aro) - 14-21 721
Each: 1-10 - - $7.79 $5.89
Each: 11-50 $6.79 - $4.89
Each: 50-100 - $5.29 ~ $4.89
Each: 101+ o $6.29 | $4.89
| Double Gang Surface Mount Outlet Box: Ortronics R
SJO 021 | OR-40300186 or equal - o . B
| Manufacturer o Ortronics Ortronics
Model - 40300186 40300186
B | Deliver Date (aro) o B 14-21 B 7-21
\Each: 1-10 - $7.99 B _ $6.48
- |Each: 11-50 ] $6.99 - $5.48
Each: 50-100 $6.49 - $5.48
_ |Each: 101+ ) $6.49  $548
Faceplate for Single Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series I1
5J0 023 OR-40300011 or equal ] B
Manufacturer ] Ortranics - | Ortronics
Model ) - B 40300011 L 40300011
o Deliver Date (aro) - B 14-21 72 -
Each: 1-10 ) ~$6.79 $4.41 -
Each: 11-50 - $5.79 $3.41
Each: 50-100 | $5.79 $3.41
Each: 101+ - $5.25 $3.41
Faceplate for Double Gang Outlet Box: Ortronics Series 11 R
SJ0 024 Dual Gang, high profile OR-40300175 or equal B o
_ |Manufacturer o ~ Ortronics Ortronics B
Model 40300175 40300175
Deliver Date (aro) - e 14-21 - - 7-21
Each: 1-10 . $9.99 ] $8.71
Each: 11-50 ) $9.10 $7.71
Each: 50-100 ] - - $8.99 | 51T
Each: 101+ $8.79 ) ! o $7.71

12




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

B & H Photo Video

Camcor, Inc.

420 Ninth Avenue

Tampa, FL 33634

New York, NY 10001

2273 §. Church St., PO Box 1899 |

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM #_

SJO 030

DESCRIPTION

Three RCA Connector Module: Ortronics Series 11
1OR-60900316 or equal

| Manufacturer

No Bid

‘Model

Deliver Date (ar(;) B

Each: 1-10

|Each: 11-50

|Each: 50-100

|Each: 101+

40 031

|
|Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:
Ortronics Series Il OR-60900212 or equal

| Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 033

15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series I
OR-60900270 or equal

Manufacturer

NoBid

No Bid

No Bid

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

SJO 034

Each: 101+

One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series IT
OR-60900017 or equal

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

No Bid

No Bid

Each; 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

13




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

CCS Presentation Systems

Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

Computer Station of Orlande, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies
BID #13-066-DM

5530 Flerida Mining Blvd.
Jacksonville, FL 32256

4908 Victor Street

3101 Maltby Drive

Jacksonville, FL 32207

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Deltona, FL 32738

ITEM# | DESCRIPTION
iThrce RCA Connector Module: Ortronics Series I
SJO 030 |OR-60900316 or equal
|Manufacturer - Ortronics
|Model B OR-60900316
Deliver Date (aro) 10
_Each: 1-10 $13.84
‘Each: 11-50 $13.84
- ‘Each: 50-100 - $13.84
) |Each: 101+ - $13.84
| Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:
SJ0 031 | Ortronics Series 11 OR-60900212 or equal
' Manufacturer Ortronics
Model OR-60900212
Deliver Date (aro) 10
Each: 1-10 - $10.71
Each: 11-50 $10.71
L Each: 50-100 - $10.71
- _|Each: 101+ - $10.71
) | 15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series Il
SJO 033 OR-60900270 or equal
Manufacturer - - Ortronics
Model OR-60900270
Deliver Date {aro) 10
3 |Each: 1-10 o - $17.18
Each: 11-50 $17.18
Each: 50-100 $17.18
Each: 101+ $17.18
One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series 11
SJO 034  |OR-60900017 or equal
Manufacturer - o Ortronics
- ~ |Model OR-60900017
Deliver Date (aro) 10
Each: 1-10 $4.18
Each: 11-50 - - B $4.18
Each: 50-100 $4.18
Each: 101+ $4.18

No Bid

-AS SPECIEC] -

As Specified

15

$25.00

$20.00

$19.00

$18.00

No Bid

As Specified

As Specified

15

$19.00

$16.00

$15.00

$14.00

As Specified

As Specified

15

$25.00

$22.00
$21.00

$20.00

‘As Specified

As Specified

16

$7.00

$6.20

$6.00

$5.90




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

|BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Howard Technology Solutions

Jersey Jim Towers

PO Box 1590

BID #13-066-DM

Laurel, MS 38441

17722 U.S. Highway 19 North

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Clearwater, FL 33764

|Each: 101+
|

ITEM# | - DESCRIPTION
[Three RCA Connector Module: Ortronies Series I~ | o
§JO030  |OR-60900316 or equal - No Bid -
- Manufacturer Ortronics B -
Model 60900316
Deliver Date (aro) - ~10-14
Each: 1-10 - Not Provided
Each: 11-50 B - %2100 -
Each: 50-100 - - Not Provided B ]
| Each: 101+ ) - Not Provided - ]
|
'Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female: - o ]
SJO 031 'Ortronics Series IT OR-60900212 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer - - Ortronics
Model 60900212
Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 -
‘Each: 1-10 Not Provided o o
|Each: 11-50 B $21.00
- __|Each: 50-100 B Not Provided o
| Each: 101+ - Not Provided - B
' 15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series IT o
8J0O 033 |OR-60900270 or equal No Bid -
~  Manufacturer Ortronics -
Model 60900270
Deliver Date (aro) o 10-14
~ Each:1-10 - _Not Provided o B
|Each: 11-50 $28.00 B B - o
Each: 50-100 Not Provided
Each: 101+ - B Not Provided
|One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series T
5J0034 OR-60900017 or equal ~ NoBid
| Manufacturer Ortronics o
Maodel - 60800017 o |
|Deliver Date (aro) -  10-14
|Each: 1-10 Not Provided
NN |Each: 11-50 $13.00 B
[Each: 50-100 ~ Not Provided
Not Provided




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Pro Sound, Inc.

Troxell Communictions, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies B 1375 NE 123 Street 1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148
|BID #13-066-DM - o Miami, FL 33161 1 Brandon, FL 33511
Board Meeting - 2/19/13
ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Three RCA Connector Module: Ortronics Series II
$JO 030 | OR-60900316 or equal - o
_ |Manufacturer - Ortronics L Ortronics
[ Model 60900316 60900316
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
) Each: 1-10 - $18.29 $18.89
Each: 11-50 ) $17.49 $17.89
Each: 50-100 $17.49 $17.89
Each; 101+ - $16.99 $17.89
Three RCA Connector Module - Female/Female:
SJO 031 Ortronics Series IT OR-60900212 or equal
Manufacturer Ortronics Ortronics
Model 60900212 60800212
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 721
Each; [-10 ) ~ $1450 ] $15.01
Each: 11-50 B $1399 $14.01
Each: 50-100 - $13.99 B - $14.01
Each: 101+ $13.49 B $14.01
15-Pin VGA Connector Module: Ortronics Series IT o
5J0033 | OR-60900270 or equal 5
Manufacturer Ortronics Ortronics
- Model 60800270 60900270 o
_ |Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $15.99 $23.00
Bach: 11-50 ~ $15.48 - - $22.00 -
~|Each: 50-100 B $15.49 $22.00
Each: 101+ $14.99 $22.00
One "F" Connector Module: Ortronics Series IT
SJO 034 OR-60900017 or equal . B o
Manufacturer B Ortronics Ortronics
.. Model - - 60900017 - 60900017
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $8.29 $6.98
Each: 11-50 . $7.99 ) $5.98
Each: 50-100 - $7.99 $5.98
Each: 101+ $7.49 $5.98 )




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies
BID #13-066-DM

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

420 Ninth Avenue

Tampa, FL 33634

Board Meeting - 2119/13

New York, NY 10001

~Camcor, Inc.

2273 8. Church St., PO Box 1899

_Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM #

SJO 035

DESCRIPTION

Blank Modules: Ortronics Series 1T OR-40300191
(1 unit = pke. of 10) or equal

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro) '

Each: 1-10

No Bid

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 020,021,023-024, 030-031 & 033-035: Average
Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50

No Bid

540 040

Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male -
15': MCM #24-6280 or equal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ma_r_lgfa&ugr 3

Model

Deliver Date (amj -

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Bach; 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 041

Audio Cable - 2ZRCA Male to ZRCA Male - 3™:
MCM #24-2500 or equal

No Bid

Man ut:a[ctupgr

S — T—

No Bid

No Bid

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 047

Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50: Cables to Go 40456 or
equal

_ NoBid

Manufacturer

No Bid

Model

_|Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

17



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

CCS Presentation Systems

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

5530 Florida Mining Blvd.

_Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

Computer Station of Orlando, Inc.

4909 Victor Street

3101 Maltby Drive

BID #13-066-DM S Jacksonville, FL 32256 Jacksonville, FL 32207 Deltona, FL 32738
Board Meeting - 2/19/13
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION B e o e :
Blank Modules: Ortronics Series [I OR-40300191 K
SJO 035 (1 unit = pkg. of 10) or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Ortronics As Specified
Model OR-40300191 ~ As Specified
Deliver Date (aro) 10 15 o
Each: 1-10 - o $3.43 §6.00
_|Each: 11-50 $3.43 $5.00 o B
Each: 50-100 $3.43 $5.00 -
Each: 101+ $3.43 ___ $5.00
S$J0 020,021,023-024, 030-031 & 033-035: Average
Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50 $7.12 $10.13 No Bid
|Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male -
SJO 040 15": MCM #24-6280 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer RCA ___TCTs _
Maodel | - _ *MMZRCA-15F **CBL-3.5 5t M-2RCA-M-015 B
Deliver Date (aro) - - 10 15 o
Each: 1-10 $13.27 $6.00
[Each: 11-50 - $13.27 - $5.75
|Each: 50-100 | $13.27 $5.65
'Each; 101+ $13.27 $5.50
Audio Cable - ZRCA Male to 2RCA Male - 3" o
SJO 041 MCM #24-2500 or equal
Manufacturer RCA =*CTS - **Cables to Go
Model 2RCAMM-FF “*CBL-2RCA-MM-003 13032
Deliver Date (aro) 10 L., 15 5-7
Each: 1-10 - $0.85 - $4.00 ~ Not Provided
Each: 11-50 $0.85 $3.00 $6.85
Each: 50-100 $0.85 $3.00 Not Provided
 |Each: 101+ $0.85 - $2.75 ~ Not Provided
Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50'": Cables to Go 40456 or o i - )
SJ0O 047 equal No Bid
| |Manufacturer S RCA ) *CTS )
Model RCARCAMM-3F “*CBL-Comp-Vid-050
Deliver Date (aro) 10 15 B
Each: 1-10 e $6.43 $9.50 B
Each: 11-50 $6.43 $8.50
Each: 50-100 $6.43 - $7.50
Each: 1014 $6.43 $6.50

18




DISTRICT SCHOOL BCARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATICN

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M. Howard Technology Solutions Jersey Jim Towers
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies B PO Box 1590 17722 U.8. Highway 19 North
BID #13-066-DM Laurel, MS 39441 Clearwater, FL 33764
Board Meeting - 2/19/13
ITEM # DESCRIPTION
Blank Modules: Ortronics Series Il OR-40300191
SJO 035  |(1 unit= pke. of 10) or equal No Bid
Manufacturer _ Ortronics
Model 40300191 -
Deliver Date (aro) 014
Each: 1-10 o B Not Provided
Each: 11-50 $12.00 B
Each: 50-100 o Not Provided
~ |Each: 101+ Not Provided
SJ0O 020,021,023-024, 030-031 & 033-035: Average Disqualified - failure to provide pricing for all
Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50 $15.44 items in this grouping
~ |Audio Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male -
SJO 040 15": MCM #24-6280 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Not Provided
Model - - Not Provided
- Deliver Date (aro) - Not Provided
~ |Each:1-10 o $3.25
- Each: 11-50 B Not Provided
Each: 50-100 Not Provided
Each: 101+ - Not Provided
B _ o NOTE: Pricing is for all quantities ordered
Audio Cable - ZRCA Male to 2ZRCA Male - 3:
SJO 041 MCM #24-2500 or equal
Manufacturer **Cablesto Go - ~ Not Provided
Model o *13032 Not Provided
Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 S Not Provided
- Each: 1-10 Not Provided - $1.20
Each: 11-50 $7.00 ~ NotProvided
Each: 50-100 - Not Provided Not Provided
Each: 1014 Not Provided Not Provided
Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50': Cables to Go 40456 or o o
$J0O 047 equal
Manufacturer - Cables to Go Not Provided
Model 40456 Not Provided
Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 Not Provided
Gach: 1-10 Not Provided $6.40
Each: 11-50 $8.00 Not Provided
| |Each: 50-100 _ Not Provided Not Provided
Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

1375 NE 123 Strest

__ProSound, Inc.

BID #13-066-DM

Miami, FL 33161

Troxell Communictions, Inc.
1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148
Branden, FL 33511

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

ITEM # DESCRIPTION )
Blank Modules: Ortronics Series IT OR-40300191
5J0 035 (1 unit = pkg. of 10) or equal

Manufacturer Ortronics Ortronics
Model , 40300191 - 40300791
S |Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 A S
| Bach: 1-10 B _ $7.99 $6.05
- Each: 11-50 ) $6.99 $5.05 n
Each: 50-100 - B $6.49 $5.05
Each: 101+ - $6.39 B $5.05
SJ0O 020,021,023-024, 030-031 & 033-035: Average
| Total Price Using the Each Price 11-50 $10.07 $9.60
}Aucﬁ'o_ Cable - 3.5mm Stereo Male to Dual RCA Male - T a
SJO 040 [15": MICM #24-6280 or equal
- Manufacturer o **Cables to Go “Kramer
I Model **3H-150310-101 “*CA35MRRAM15 -
_|Deliver Date (aro) - 14-21 721 ]
~|Each: 1-10 i $11.76 $7.00
~ |Each: 11-50 B $10.76 $6.00 |
~ |Each: 50-100 - $10.50 $6.00 S
Each: 101+ $10.25 $6.00
~ |Audio Cable - 2RCA Male to 2RCA Male-3': S
SJO 041 MCM #24-2500 or equal
Manufacturer **Cables to Go “Kramer B
Model 40463 **C2RAM2RAM3
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
A Each: 1-10 B $4.30 $400
Each: 11-50 B $3.40 ~ $4.00
_ |Each: 50-100 I R $2.95 _ $4.00 o
Each: 101+ $2.45 $4.00
Video Cable - RCA to RCA - 50': Cables to Go 40456 or o
SJO 047 equal
Manufacturer - ~ Cablesto Go _Cables to Go ]
|Model 40456 40456 .
Deliver Date (aro) o - I L 7-21
Each: 1-10 - ~$9.90 _$9.27 B
Each: 11-50 . $9.10 ~ $8.27
Each: 50-100 $8.40 $8.27
Each: 101+ $7.95 $8.27

20



DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE:

Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

Camcor, Inc.

420 Ninth Avenue

2273 8. Church St., PO Box 1899

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

BID #13-066-DM

Tampa, FL 33634

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

New York, NY 10001

~ Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

SJO 048

Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male - 3":
MICM-24-2485 or equal

No Bid

MDY

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Bach: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

$JO 051

Video Cable - "F" to "F'": MCM #33-548 or equal

"No Bid

Manufacturer

No Bid

Model -

Deliver Date (ara)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 055

VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15"
Cables to Go - 09618 or equal

No Bid

Manufacturer

No Bid

No Bid

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

SJO 057

Each: 50-100

|Each: 101+

~ IVGA Cable, 15 pin, DBIS Male to Male - 35%
Calrad 55-612-35 or equal
Manufacturer

No Bid

Model

No Bid

Deliver Date (aro)

|Each: 1-10

(Each: 11-50

|Each; 50-100

[Bach: 101+

21




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M. CCS Presentation Systems o Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc. Computer Station of Orlande, Inc.
[BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies 5530 Florida Mining Blvd. 4909 Victor Street 3101 Maltby Drive
BID #13-066-DM - Jacksonville, FL 32256 Jacksonville, FL 32207 N ~ Deltona, FL 32738
Board Meeting - 2/19/13
ITEM # » ~__ DESCRIPTION _
. Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male -3 o
SJO 048 MCM-24-2485 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer RCA *CTS N ~
B Model - R3RCAMM-3F **CBL-3RCA-003 = -
Deliver Date (aro) B 10 15
Each: [-10 ” $1.29 $4.00
Each: 1150 $1.29 $3.40
Each: 50-100 . $1.29 $3.25
Gach: 101+ T $1.29 $3.00
|
SJ0 051 Video Cable - "F"* to "F"': MCM #33-548 or equal )
| Manufacturer RCA N *Cables to Go
| Model *R689FFM-6F **CBL-RG59-MM-006 **40026
Deliver Date (aro) - 10 15 5-7
Each: 1-10 B $1.65 $3.50 No Provided
Each: 11-50 - ] $1.65 $2.75 $5.43
Each: 50-100 $1.65 $2.50 Not Provided
| Each: 101+ $1.65 $2.25 ~ Not Provided
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15'": -
SJ0O 055 Cables to Go - 09618 or equal
Manufacturer - Cables to Go **CTS Cables to Go
Model 09618 *CBL-VGA-MM-015 09618
- |Deliver Date (aro) 10 15 _ ] 5-7
- Each: 1-10 : ~§9.90 . §9%.00 No Provided
|[Each: 11-50 o $9.90 $8.50 $4.87
_ |Each: 50-100 $5.90 $8.25 Not Provided
l Each: 101+ $5.90 | $8.00 Not Provided
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DBIS Male to Male - 35 o -
SJO 057 Calrad 55-612-35 or equal
Manufacturer - B ) **Suga *CTS **Cables to Go
Model ] **Suga-MM-35 “*CBL-VGA-MM-035 _ **28015
- Deliver Date (aro) 10 - 15 o 57 ]
B Each: 1-10 $15.60 - ~ §13.50 - No Provided -
Each: 11-50 - . $15.60 $12.50 $27.88
Each: 50-100 B $15.60 $12.25 Not Provided
Each: 101+ $15.60 $12.00 Not Provided

22




DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Howard Technology Solutions

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Jersey Jim Towers

PO Box 1590

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Laurel, MS 38441

17722 U.S. Highway 19 North

Clearwater, FL 33764

TTEM # — DESCRIPTION

Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to SRCA Male-3';
SJO 048 MCM-24-2485 or equal

Manufacturer “Cablesto Go Not Provided
Model **13036 __Not Provided
Deliver Date (aro) - 10-14 Not Provided
~ |Each:1-10 Not Provided ) $1.40
~ [Each: 11-50 B $8.00 Not Provided
L - _ |Each: 50-100 o Not Provided Not Provided
Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided
SJ0O 051 Video Cable - "F" to "F'": MCM #33-548 or equal
Manufzcturer B B “Cablesto Go Not Provided
Model **29132 Not Provided
Deliver Date {(aro) 10-14 _ Not Provided
Bach: 1-10 Not Provided $2.60
Each: 11-50 $7.00 Not Provided
Each: 50-100 ) Not Provided Not Provided !
Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided o
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 15"
SJO 055 Cables to Go - 09618 or equal
Manufacturer Cables to Go Not Provided
e Model 09618 Not Provided
| Deliver Date (aro) o 10-14 Not Provided
Each: 1-10 Not Provided $12.80 .
|Each: 11-50 o $5.00 Not Provided
|Each: 50-100 Not Provided Not Provided
|Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided
- VGA Cable, 15 pin, DBIS Male to Male - 35": o NS
SJO 057 Calrad 55-612-35 or equal
Manufacturer ~ Cables to Go Not Provided
Model B 28015 B Not Provided i
o 'Deliver Date (zro) 10-14 Not Provided
Each: [-10 Not Provided $26.10
Each: 11-50 -  %21.00 Not Provided
Each: 50-100 - Not Provided Not Provided -
Each: 101+ Not Provided Not Provided
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Pro Sound, Inc.

Troxell Communictions, Inc.

1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

1375 NE 123 Street

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Miami, FL 33161

Brandon, FL 33511

ITEM# | N DESCRIPTION - ]
A Audio Cable - 3RCA Male to 3RCA Male-3": - -
SJO 048 MCM-24-2485 or equal
Manufacturer **Cables to Go ] **Cables to Go
Model - **40447 ) 40447
Deliver Date (aro) ~14-21 B 7-21
~ |Each: 1-10 $4.90 $4.88 -
- Each: 11-50 _ $4.50 $3.88 _
- Each: 50-100 $3.95 $3.88
Each: 101+ ~ $360 $3.88
SJO 051 Video Cable - "F" to "F'': MCM #33-548 or equal T
Manufacturer - **Cables to Go **Cables to Go
~ |Model **27030 **27030
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 o 721
Bach: [-10 $4.40 i} $5.49 )
Each: 11-50 $3.40 B $4.49 |
Each: 50-100 - $3.20 $4.49
Each: 101+ - $3.15 $4.49
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DBI5 Male to Male - 15': - B N
SJO 055 Cables to Go - 09618 or equal
Manufacturer -~ Cables to Go Cables to Go B
Model 09618 B 09618 -
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $9.50 $7.28
Each: 11-50 B ~ $8.75 $6.28 )
Each: 50-100 o - $8.50 $6.28
Each: 101+ $7.75 $6.28
VGA Cable, 15 pin, DB15 Male to Male - 35" -
SJO 057 Calrad 55-612-35 or equal
- | Manufacturer **Cables to Go B j*(m -
Model - *28015 ) **28015 N
Deliver Date (ar0) - 14-21 7-21
~ |Each:1-10 $29.90 _%$30.08
- Each: 11-50 $28.90 B $29.06 .
Each: 50-100 $28.00 - $29.06 .
Each: 101+ $27.50 $29.06
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

|DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies
BID #13-066-DM

Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

Board Meeting - 2119/13

Tampa, FL 33634

420 Ninth Avenue

Camcor, Inc.

New York, NY 10001

2273 8. Church St, PO Box 1899

__Burlington, NC 27215

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

SJ0O 058

VGA Cable, Plenum raté'd,'DBIS Male to Male - 35";
Cables to Go or equal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

~ |Manufacturer ) ~

Model
Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

|Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 060

Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

Each: 50-100

SJO 065

Bach: 101+

| Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD 10WHG-A
or equal

No Bid

No Bid

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date?ﬁo)

Each: 1-10
Each: 11-50

Each; 50-100

Each: 101+

SJO 066

Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallic
Raceway: Panduit Celing Entry Cap #1125 or equal

~ |Deliver Date (aro)

Manufacturer
Model

|Each: 1-10

[Each: 11-50

[Each: 50-100

|Bach: 101+

18J0O 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the
|Each Price 11-50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCC COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M. N CCS Presentation Systems Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc. | Computer Station of Orlando, Inc.
1BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies i 5530 Florida Mining Blvd. 4909 Victor Street 3101 Maltby Drive
BID #13-066-DM Jacksonville, FL 32256 o Jacksonville, FL 32207 Deltona, FL 32738
Board Meeting - 2/19/13 |
ITEM # o ~_ DESCRIPTION
VGA Cable, Plenum rated, DB15 Male to Male - 35":
SJO 058 Cables to Go or equal
| Manufacturer o *SVGA *CTS Cables to Go
- Model - **SVGAMMPL-35F - *CBL-VGA-MM-PLN-035 40093
B Deliver Date (aro) 3 | 10 ) | i 15 - - 5-7 -
Each: 1-10 ] - §118.79 B $90.00 No Provided
Each: 11-50 - ~ $118.79 $84.50 $80.65
- Each: 50-100 $118.79 _ §8200 B - Not Provided
Each; 101+ R $118.79 $80.00 Not Provided
SJO 060 Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal B o ] o ~ NoBid o
Manufacturer B 7 - Belden »CTS
Model - B Bel-5100UE **CBL-SPKR-14-2
Deliver Date (aro) - 10 i 15
Each: 1-10 - $270.65 %0000
Each: 11-50 N $270.65 $285.00
Each: 50-100 - $270.65 [ $280.00 - -
Each: 101+ - $270.65 ' §275.00
Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD I0WHG-A
SJO 065 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer ) - Panduit **Wiremold
Model B ] 10WHSB-A 2900FW
_ Deliver Date (ara) ] 10 15 -
Each: 1-10 ] $2.42 $15.00
Each: 11-50 - $2.42 $12.96
Each: 50-100 $2.42 §12.72
Each: 101+ i ] $2.42 o §12.60 -
Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallic
8JO 066 Raceway: Panduit Celing Entry Cap #1125 or equal ‘ No Bid
Manufacturer Panduit L. **Wiremold o
 |Model 1125 - *2986-FW N
Deliver Datejéro) - 10 15
Each: 1-10 - $1.80 $2.25
~ |Bach: 11-50 - $1.60 _ $1.95 )
| |Each: 50-100 - — $1.60 | %180 -
Each: 101+ $1.60 . %185 -
7 |SJO 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the B -
Each Price 11-50 $2.01 $7.46 No Bid
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.
BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Howard Technology Sclutions

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

PO Box 1590

Laurel, MS 39441

_Jersey Jim Towers

17722 U.S. Highway 19 North
Clearwater, FL 33764

ITEM# ~ DESCRIPTION
VGA Cable, Plenum rated, DB15 Male to Male - 35":
SJO 058 Cables to Go or equal No Bid
B Manufacturer __ o Cables to Go
Model - o 40093 | - -
- Deliver Date (aro) ~ 10-14 -
Each: 1-10 Not Provided o
] Each: 11-50 $75.00 B
| _Eaci-r. 50-100 o Not Provided B
_ |Each: 101+ B Not Provided
SJO 060 | Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal No Bid a
[Manufecturer i Not Provided
Model - Not Provided
| Deliver Date (aro) - S Not Provided -
- Each: 1-10 _ $280.00 -
Each: 11-50 N Not Provided
Each: 50-100 Not Provided
Each: 101+ e ‘Not Provided
~ |Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD [0WHG6-A
SJO 065 (or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Panduit
~ Model LD 10WHB-A
| Deliver Date (aro) 10-14 B
B Each: 1-10 — Not Provided - -
Each: 11-50 - $15.00 B
Each: 50-100 Not Provided
[Each: 101+ ~ Not Provided
Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallie
SJO 066 | Raceway: Panduit Celing Entry Cap #1125 or equal No Bid B
o Manufacturer N Panduit B B o B
) Model o *DCF 10WF-X-Pan )
~|Deliver Date (aro) - 10-14 -
Each: 1-10 Not Provided o
B Each: 11-50 _ _s800 00
| Each: 50-100 o Not Provided i
o Each: 101+ - Not Provided B -
SJO 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the
Each Price 11-50 $9.00 $0.00
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

Pro Sound, Inc.

1375 NE 123 Street

Miami, FL 33161

~ Troxell Communictions, Inc.

1971 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148

Brandon, FL 33511

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

ITEM # - ~ DESCRIPTION __
VGA Cable, Plenum rated, DB15 Male to Male - 35":
SJO 058 Cables to Go or equal
| | Manufacturer = Cablesto Go Cables to Go
Model B 40093 B ) 28015
Deliver Date (aro) ~ Not Listed 7-21 B -
Each: 1-10 $94.00 ~ $30.086
|Each: 11-50 - $89.00 $29.06
Each: 50-100 $87.00 $29.06
Each: 101+ $82.00 $29.06
S$JO 060 Speaker Cable: Belden BEL-5100UE or equal o
~ |Manufacturer Belden **Kramer
Model BEL-5100UE **BC25300M
Deliver Date (aro) Not Listed 7-21
Each: 1-10 ) $285.00 $208.00
L Each: 11-50 $281.00 $204.00
Each: 50-100 $280.00 $204.00
Each: 101+ $279.00 ) $204.00
Non-Metallic Latching Raceway: Panduit LD 10WIG-A o
SJO 065 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer - Panduit
~ |Model — LD 10WHEA
Deliver Date (aro) 7-21
Each: 1-10 $14.02
- Each: 11-50 $1398
C Each. 50-100 $13.98
Each: 101+ $13.98
Non-Metallic Ceiling Entry Cap for Non-Metallic
$JO066  |Raceway: Panduit Celing Entry Cap #1125 or equal No Bid -
Manufacturer B Panduit
Model ~ DCF10WHX
Deliver Date (aro) o - ) 7-21
~ |Each: 1-10 $3.18
Each: 11-50 - $2.98
Each: 50-100 — — - $2.93
_ |Each: 1014 - e - o $2.98
[ SJO 065 & SJO 066: Average Total Price Using the - N ) -
Each Price 11-50 $0.00 $8.48
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2230 P.M.

~Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

B & H Photo Video

Cameor, Inc.

6301 Benjamin Road, Suite 101

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

~ Tampa, FL 33634

420 Ninth Avenue

2273 8. Church St,, PO Box 1899

New York, NY 10001

Burlington, NC 27215

" TEM# |

DESCRIPTION _

~ |Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated:

SJW 023 ‘Anixter #AL-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal

Manufacturer

No Bid

| Model i

\Deliver Date (aro)
|Each: 1-10
'Each: 11-50

'Each: 50-100

_ Each: 101+

*Disqualified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

CCS Presentation Systems

Classroom Technology Solutions, Inc.

Computer Station of Orlando, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

5530 Florida Mining Blvd.

Jacksonville, FL 32256

4909 Victor Street
~ Jacksonville, FL 32207

3101 Maltby Drive
Deltona, FL 32738

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

ITEM # DESCRIPTION B o -
Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated: T
SJW 023 Anixter #AL-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal No Bid
Manufacturer Anixter **Cablesto Go
Medel Al-1802C-2-2N-01 — **43089
Deliver Date (aro) 10 5-7
Each: 1-10 $121.98 - No Provided
Each: 11-50 $121.98 - o $194.80 -
L Each: 50-100 B $121.98 | Not Provided
Each: 101+ $121.98 Not Provided
*Disqualified *Disqualified -
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Howard Technology Solutions

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

Jersey Jim Towers

PO Box 1580

BID #13-066-DM

Board Meetingi 2/19/13

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

Laurel, MS 39441

17722 U.8. Highway 19 North
Clearwater, FL 33764

|Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated:

SJW 023 Anixter #A1-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal

No Bid

Manufacturer

Model

Deliver Date (aro)

No Bid

Each: 1-10

Each: 11-50

_|Bach: 50-100
Each: 101+

*Disqualified
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DISTRICT SCHOOL BOARD OF PASCO COUNTY BID TABULATION

DATE OF OPENING: January 25, 2013 @ 2:30 P.M.

Pro Sound, Inc.

BID TITLE: Classroom Retrofit Supplies

BID #13-066-DM

1375 NE 123 Street

Troxell Communictions, Inc.

1871 W. Lumsden Road PMB 148

Miami, FL 33161

Board Meeting - 2/19/13

Brandon, FL 33511

ITEM # DESCRIPTION

Speaker Cable, Plenum Rated:

SJW 023 Anixter #AL-1802C-2-2N-01 or equal

Manufacturer Anixter “Belden
~ |Model B AL-18022N-01 *6100UE
Deliver Date (aro) 14-21 7-21
Each: 1-10 $259.00 $363.00
~ |Each: 11-50 - $253.00 - $338.00
Each: 50-100 $250.00 $338.00 |
Each: 101+ $245.00 $338.00

*Disqualiazmd- B
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