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13-003-SB NON-FOOD EXPENDABLES-WAREHOUSE STOCK TABULATION SHEET

Bid # : 13-003-SB
Bid Name: Non-Food Expendable Warehouse Stock

Board Meeting: November 6, 2012

FNS # Product Description Brand  Extended Price Brand
Extended 

Price Brand
Extended 

Price 
FS-001 STRAWS, MILK Cardinal 651T 2,518.50$        Net Choice 00402 24/500 2,732.25$       No Bid

FS-002 NAPKINS, 13 X 12 SCA D786 E 26,020.00$      SCA D786 27,020.00$     No Bid

FS-003 CONTAINER, DIPPER BOX Par-Pak 82612 7,268.00$        Par-Pak 82612 7,374.00$       No Bid

FS-005 ALUMINUM FOIL Western 286 3,764.00$        Durable 91805 4,360.00$       Daxwell  J10002275 3,396.00$     

FS-007 CARRY TRAYS, SMALL GenPak 8S 37,940.00$      Genpack 8S 40,220.00$     No Bid
 
FS-009 SLEEVE , PAPER Stewart Southerlan 03WC 1,872.00$        Brown 807-3WC 1,604.00$       No Bid

FS-010 GLOVES, DISPOSABLE Safety Zone GDPE-MED 5,655.00$        Inteplast GL-Large 5,085.00$       No Bid

FS-011 CONTAINER, HINGED-LID, 3 COMPARTMENT GenPak SN203VW-H 9,540.00$        Genpak SN203VW 9,855.00$       No Bid

FS-012 PLATES, 6" Pactiv YTH100060000 3,216.00$        Dart 6PWC 3,573.00$       No Bid

FS-013 LINER, PAN 18" X 26" Durable QPL-25 24,520.00$      McNairn 290001 26,890.00$     No Bid

FS-014 CONTAINER, CLEAR HINGED, SINGLE COMPARTMEN Par-Pak 02010 42,910.00$      Durable PXT-880 31,270.00$     No Bid

FS-015 CUP, 5 OZ. PLASTIC Dart 5N25 1,351.00$        SWEETHEART CDE5 1,417.00$       No Bid

FS-016 CUP, 16 OZ. PLASTIC Genpak VW16 20,407.50$      Fabrikal RK16 25,252.50$     No Bid
Alt Dart 16TN 23,490.00$     

FS-017 CUP, 10 OZ. FOAM Master 10D 8,710.00$        MASTER 10D 9,085.00$       No Bid

FS-018 LIDS, for 16 OZ. PLASTIC cup Genpak LVW20 19,867.50$      Fabrikal RK16 20,700.00$     No Bid
Alt Dart L16TN 20,827.50$     

FS-019 SPORK STRAW NAPKIN KIT Nutribon 3606P 65,100.00$      Nutri-bon 3606 79,000.00$     Daxwell B10001522 60,750.00$   

FS-022 TRAY, SNACK 5 3/4" X 8 1/2" x 7/8" Genpak 1002S 23,940.00$      Anchor 7309482 30,120.00$     No Bid

FS-023 FILM WRAP Western 182 3,366.00$        Goldmax 4,101.00$       No Bid

FS-029 UTENSILS, KNIVES, PLASTIC   Nutribon 6441 1,442.50$        Goldmax 3,362.50$       Daxwell  A1000139 1,475.00$     

FS-030 UTENSILS, TEASPOONS, PLASTIC Nutribon 6442 8,655.00$        Goldmax 19,815.00$     Daxwell A10001390 8,850.00$     

Daxwell    
2825Wilcrest Drive Suite

Houston, TX 77042Due Date: October 4, 2012 @ 2:30 pm

Penninsular Paper
5101 East Hanna Ave.

Tampa, FL 33610

Southeastern Paper Group, Inc.
3850-7 Port Jacksonville Pkwy

Jacksonville, FL 32226
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FS-031 UTENSILS, FORKS, PLASTIC Nutribon 6440 4,904.50$        Goldmax 11,262.50$     Daxwell  A1000138 5,015.00$     

FS-035 SQUAT CUP, 8 OZ Master Container 8C 4,436.00$        Master Container 8C 4,536.00$       No Bid
 
FS-037 CONTAINER, CUP, SQUAT, 12 OZ. Master Container 12C 8,074.00$        Master Container 12C 8,558.00$       No Bid

FS-038 LID, 12 OZ. SQUAT CUP Master Container L24DV 3,966.00$        Master Container L24DV 4,122.00$       No Bid
 
FS-042 BAG, LUNCH WHITE Bagcraft 296 6,678.00$        Brown 1417 5,548.50$       No Bid

FS-043 HAIRNETS Royal PPR Hat HN 144 8,107.50$        RPH144LTDB 20/144 PK 8,647.50$       No Bid

FS-046 BAG, CLEAR, COOKIE/SANDWICH Elkay DP657 13,620.00$      Elkay DP657 12,780.00$     No Bid

FS-057 LID, 8 OZ. CONTAINER Park-Pak 21879 5,607.00$        Par-Pak 21879 5,622.00$       No Bid
 
FS-063 FIVE COMPARTMENT TRAY, PEWTER Pactiv YTHB0500 186,240.00$    GenPak 10500 Pewter 205,080.00$   No Bid

Alt Republic 98015 White 181,080.00$   
FS-065 LID, 10 OZ Master L10D 558.50$           Must match FS-017 571.00$          No Bid

FS-067 STORAGE BAG, SHEET PAN Elkay BOR2737HD 2,480.00$        Elkay BOR2737HD 2,380.00$       No Bid

FS-069 LID, 2 OZ SOUFFLE Dart 200PCL 4,154.00$        Amhil ASL2 4,240.00$       No Bid

FS-071 SOUFFLE CUP, 2 OZ, PLASTIC Dart 200PC 4,664.00$        Amhil ASB200 3,968.00$       No Bid

FS-072 COVER, BUN PAN RACK Interplast BR52X80 5,635.00$        Interplast BR52X80 5,870.00$       No Bid

FS-073 FORK STRAW NAPKIN KIT Nutribon 3605P 39,060.00$      GoldMax 48,870.00$     Daxwell B10002150 36,450.00$   

FS-075 FOOD TRAY (BOAT)  2 LB SQP 8702 20,232.00$      SQP 8702 20,148.00$     No Bid
 

FS-076 PORTION TRAY, 8 OZ, BLACK PLASTIC Parpak 21878 24,800.00$      Par-Pak 21878 10,000.00$     No Bid

FS-078 BAG, BREAKFAST Elkay 6G0863015 20,320.00$       Elkay 6G063015 19,080.00$     No Bid

FS-079 PAPER, FOIL BACKED Volflex # VOL-FS-004 7,454.40$        Brown 5C14 2500 10,132.00$     No Bid

FS-080 PAPER, FOIL BACKED Bagcraft 843 12,756.00$      Brown 5C14-G 2500 16,341.00$     No Bid
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FS-081  SANDWICH, 5 INCH CLEAR Dart C53PST1 14,832.00$      Park Pak 29367 9,045.00$       No Bid

FS-082 CUP, 9 OZ. PLASTIC PARFAIT Fabrikal NC90F 73,800.00$      Fabrikal NC90 92,850.00$     No Bid
Alt. Dart 9CS 82,650.00$     

FS-083 DOME LID, 9 OZ. PLASTIC PARFAIT-NO HOLE Fabrikal DLKC 12/20 NH 58,626.00$      Fabrikal DLKC 12/20 NH 66,996.00$     No Bid
 Alt. Dart 16LCD 63,216.00$     

FS-084 FLAT LID, 9 OZ. PLASTIC PARFAIT Fabrikal LKC 12/20 X-slot 3,992.00$        Fabrikal LKC 12/20 X-slo 4,140.00$       No Bid
Alt. Dart L12CS 4,662.00$       

FS-092 CUP, 12 OZ. PLASTIC Dart 12CS 28,770.00$      Fabrikal KC12T 30,330.00$     No Bid

FS-093 LIDS, for 12 OZ. PLASTIC cup Dart 16LCD 24,427.50$      Dart 12C 1000 25,687.50$     No Bid

FS-103 TABLE COVER ROLL, WHITE Atlantis 2TCW300 777.00$            Straubel PTC40300 1,265.00$       No Bid
 
FS-116 NAPKINS, Catering white SCA NP310A 2,752.00$        SCA NP310A 2,883.00$       No Bid

FS-121 CATERING, PLATE 6" GenPak BLK06 3,655.00$        GenPak BLK06 3,872.00$       No Bid
 
FS-122 CATERING, PLATE 10" GenPak BLK10 7,910.00$        GenPak BLK10 8,382.00$       No Bid
 
FS-123 CATERING, BOWL 10 - 12 OZ. GenPak BLK21 5,835.00$        GenPak BLK21 6,198.00$       No Bid
 
FS-124 CATERING, FORK Nutribon 6860 2,598.00$        Goldmax 3,165.00$       Daxwell A10003288 2,832.00$     
 
FS-125 CATERING, TEASPOON Nutribon 6862 1,299.00$        Goldmax 1,611.75$       Daxwell A10003292 1,416.00$     
 
FS-126 CATERING, KNIFE Nutribon 6861 1,299.00$        Goldmax 1,611.75$       Daxwell A10003291 1,416.00$     
 
FS-127 CATERING, SOUP SPOON Nutribon 6863 1,299.00$        Goldmax 1,611.75$       Daxwell A10003377 1,416.00$     
 
FS-137 TRAY, LARGE ECO 5 1/2" X 8 1/2" x 2" Southern Champion 0598 5,230.00$        No Bid   No Bid No Bid

FS-140 TRAY, MEDIUM ECO 3lb. Southern Champion 0525 7,032.00$        No Bid No Bid No Bid

 $    945,943.40 

*Total for SE Paper 
exludes items 137 and 
140  $  981,148.50 DisqualifiedTotal for all products:
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