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ITEM # QTY. DESCRIPTION Unit Total Unit Total

PP-201 180 8-1/2" x 11" Blue   Item #81199 $37.54 $6,757.20 $37.63 $6,773.40
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer 

PP-202 50 8-1/2 x 11" Ivory  Item #81201 $37.54 $1,877.00 $37.63 $1,881.50
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-203 170 8-1/2" x 11" Canary  Item #81196 $37.54 $6,381.80 $37.63 $6,397.10
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-204 90 8-1/2" x 11" Goldenrod   Item #81203 $37.54 $3,378.60 $37.63 $3,386.70
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-205 135 8-1/2" x 11" Green   Item #81197 $37.54 $5,067.90 $37.63 $5,080.05
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-206 110 8-1/2" x 11" Orchid   Item #81200 $37.54 $4,129.40 $37.63 $4,139.30
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-207 115 8-1/2" x 11" Pink  Item #81198 $37.54 $4,317.10 $37.63 $4,327.45
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-208 30 8-1/2" x 11" Gray  Item #81195 $37.54 $1,126.20 $37.63 $1,128.90
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

No
None

30%

PP-230 90 8-1/2" x 11" Terra Green   Item #22581 $79.65 $7,168.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-231 45 8-1/2" x 11" Terrestial Teal  Item #21849 $79.65 $3,584.25 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-232 80 8-1/2" x 11" Re-Entry Red   Item #22551 $79.65 $6,372.00 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-233 80 8-1/2" x 11" Fireball Fuschia  Item #22681 $79.65 $6,372.00 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-234 120 8-1/2" x 11" Sunburst Yellow  Item #22591 $79.65 $9,558.00 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-235 70 8-1/2" x 11" Celestial Blue   Item #22661 $79.65 $5,575.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-236 50 8-1/2" x 11" Gamma Green Item #22541 $79.65 $3,982.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-237 95 8-1/2" x 11" Cosmic Orange  Item #22651 $79.65 $7,566.75 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-238 55 8-1/2" x 11" Planetary Purple   Item #22671 $79.65 $4,380.75 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

No
None

30%

BID: # 13-089-MV

Mac Papers, Inc
3300 Philips Hwy

Jacksonville, FL 32207
BID TITLE:  Specialty Paper- Warehouse Stock
DATE OF OPENING:  May 7, 2013

Board Meeting:  June 4, 2013

Total "All or None" Bid Price - Group II

GROUP I: 20lb Domtar Colors-Multipurpose or Equal 

$33,035.20

$54,560.25

5% added to Out of State Vendor  
Pallets Required

Total "All or None" Bid Price - Group I

Waste Paper Content
Charge per Pallet / Exchange

GROUP II: 60lb Astrobright Paper or Equal

Pallets Required
Charge per Pallet / Exchange
Waste Paper Content

School Specialty
3175A Northwoods Parkway

Norcross, GA 30071

$33,114.40

Place of Business in Georgia

$34,770.12

NO BID
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PP-241 55 8-1/2" x 11" Cosmic Orange  Item #22851 $62.13 $3,417.15 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-242 35 8-1/2" x 11" Gamma Green  Item #22741 $62.13 $2,174.55 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-243 35 8-1/2" x 11" Celestial Blue  Item #22665 $62.13 $2,174.55 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-244 35 8-1/2" x 11" Re-Entry Red  Item #22751 $62.13 $2,174.55 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-245 50 8-1/2" x 11" Sunburst Yellow Item #22791 $62.13 $3,106.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-246 30 8-1/2" x 11" Terrestial Teal  Item #21855 $62.13 $1,863.90 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-247 25 8-1/2" x 11" Planetary Purple  Item #22871 $62.13 $1,553.25 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-248 25 8-1/2" x 11" Fireball Fushia  Item #22881 $62.13 $1,553.25 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-249 35 8-1/2" x 11" Terra Green Item #22781 $62.13 $2,174.55 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

No
None

30%

PP-261 95 8-1/2" x 11" Blue   Item #026000 $39.95 $3,795.25 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-262 90 8-1/2" x 11" Canary  Item #036000 $39.95 $3,595.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-263 50 8-1/2" x 11" Goldenrod  Item #086008 $39.95 $1,997.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-264 25 8-1/2" x 11" Gray   Item #066000 $39.95 $998.75 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-265 65 8-1/2" x 11" Green   Item #046000 $39.95 $2,596.75 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-266 60 8-1/2" x 11" Pink   Item #076000 $39.95 $2,397.00 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-267 265 8-1/2" x 11" White  Item #016000 $37.64 $9,974.60 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-268 45 8-1/2" x 11" Ivory   Item #056000 $39.95 $1,797.75 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-269 50 8-1/2" x 11" Orchid   Item #057000 $39.95 $1,997.50 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

No
None

10%

PP-281 15 8-1/2" x 11" Blue   Item #27141 $92.88 $1,393.20 NO BID NO BID
Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

PP-282 6 8-1/2 x 11" Celadon Item #27261 $92.88 $557.28 NO BID NO BID
 Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer
PP-283 8 8-1/2 x 11" Natural  Item #27121 $92.88 $743.04 NO BID NO BID

Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer
PP-284 10 8-1/2 x 11" Gold  Item # 27171 $92.88 $928.80 NO BID NO BID

Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer
PP285 10 8-1/2 x 11" Gray  Item #27151 $92.88 $928.80 NO BID NO BID

Cases Product Numer/Manufacturer

No
None

30%
Charge per Pallet / Exchange

Total "All or None" Bid Price - Group V

GROUP V:  ASTROPARCHE 60lb Paper or Equal

Pallets Required

$20,192.25

$29,150.60

$4,551.12

Total "All or None" Bid Price - Group III
Pallets Required
Charge per Pallet / Exchange
Waste Paper Content

Waste Paper Content

Total "All or None" Bid Price - Group IV
Pallets Required
Charge per Pallet / Exchange
Waste Paper Content

GROUP IV: 67lb Springhill Vellum Bristol Cover or Equal

GROUP III: 65lb Astrobright Paper or Equal

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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