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WHOLE LIFE INSURANCE 

GROUP WHOLE LIFE INSURANCE 

Pasco County Schools is pleased to offer a NEW Whole 
Life benefit to all benefit eligible employees through 
MassMutual. Whole Life Insurance provides coverage at a 
set premium, builds cash value over time that you can 
borrow from and pays a death benefit.  Some important 
features include: 

Provides Guarantees:  

Provides a guaranteed death benefit, level premiums and 
cash-value accumulation. 

Dividend Eligible:  

MassMutual whole life certificate owners are eligible to 
receive dividends. During enrollment, you'll have the 
opportunity to select the dividend option that fits you best. 
Options include cash, dividend accumulations and paid-up 
additional coverage. 

Read more about these dividend options when you enroll. 
While dividends are not guaranteed, MassMutual® has 
paid them to eligible participating policy and certificate 
owners every year since 1869.  

Portable, Lifelong Coverage:  

You own the certificate along with the accumulated cash 
values and you can take it with you even if you leave the 
company. Additionally, if you leave the company and take 
your certificate with you, you can change your dividend 
option and choose to have your dividend payments 
reduce your premiums. 

Tax Advantages: 

Whole life insurance policies offer a combination of 
valuable tax advantages, including generally income-tax-
free death benefit and tax-deferred cash-value growth. 

Accelerated Death Benefit Provisions: 

 As the certificate owner, you can receive an advance, or 
acceleration, of a portion of the death benefit under your 
certificate, if the insured is diagnosed with a terminal 
illness or if the insured has a chronic illness that has been 
certified by a Qualified Medical Practitioner. 

• Chronic Illness: The Accelerated Death Benefit for 
Chronic Illness is payable when the insured meets the 
definition of Chronic Illness, generally having a 
permanent loss of two activities of daily living (eating, 
toileting, transferring, bathing, dressing, or 
continence) due to loss of functional capacity, or 
requiring substantial supervision due to permanent 
severe cognitive impairment. In North Carolina and 
Washington, generally, Chronic Illness is any medical 
condition that requires continuous confinement in an 
Eligible Institution, where the Insured is expected to 
remain there for the rest of their life. 

• Terminal Illness: In most states, the Accelerated 
Death Benefit for Terminal Illness is payable when the 
insured meets the definition of Terminally Ill, generally 
diagnosed with an illness that will result in death 
within 12 months (24 months in some states). 

These benefits are not long term care insurance and may 
be used for any purpose. In many cases, these benefits 
allow access to more funds than would be available 
through a certificate loan or certificate cash surrender 
value. There is a fee taken from the Chronic Care Benefit. 
Consult with your tax advisor regarding a request for 
accelerated benefits. Certificate owners who have 
exercised the Accelerated Death Benefit for Terminal 
Illness benefit cannot use the Chronic Care Benefit. 
However, the Terminal Illness Benefit will still be available 
on the remaining face amount after a Chronic Care 
Benefit payment has been made. 

Your Benefit Options 

Employee Certificates: minimum of $10,000 up to the 
Guaranteed Issue maximum of $50,000. Issue ages 18-
75.                                                                           
Spouse Certificates: choice of $10,000 or $25,000 of 
Guaranteed Issue. Issue ages 18-60.                        
Child/Grandchild Certificates: choice of $10,000 or 
$25,000 of Guaranteed Issue. One time purchase with 
lifetime maximum of $25,000. Issue ages 14 days to 26 
years.  

Please note:  

EMPLOYEES MUST HAVE COVERAGE FOR 
THEMSELVES TO BE ELIGIBLE FOR THE SPOUSE OR 
CHILD/GRANDCHILD COVERAGE. 

To qualify for Guaranteed Issue Spouse Dependent 
Coverage, the applying Spouse must confirm they are not 
currently applying or collecting Disability Benefits 
(including but not limited to Social Security Disability). 

To speak to a benefits counselor or schedule a 1-on-1 
meeting about Whole Life Insurance, scan the QR 
code. 

 

 

 

 

2025 MassMutual Whole Life Insurance Rates 

Group Whole Life Video 

Chronic Care Benefit Video 

 

https://vimeo.com/905254157/66ef9ca188?share=copy
https://vimeo.com/868815251/feaad6bda9?share=copy
https://user-emmuwdy.cld.bz/2025-PASCO-County-Schools-MassMutual-Group-Whole-Life-Insurance-Rates
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